Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137 Filed 10/25/21 Page 1 of 17

1 2 3 4 5	Laura L. Ho (CA SBN 173179) lho@gbdhlegal.com Ginger L. Grimes (SBN 307168) ggrimes@gbdhlegal.com GOLDSTEIN, BORGEN, DARDARIAN & HO 155 Grand Avenue, Suite 900 Oakland, CA 94612 Tel: (510) 763-9800 Fax: (510) 835-1417	
6 7	Attorneys for Plaintiffs. Settlement Class and Collective Members, and Aggrieved Employees	
8	[Additional counsel on following page]	
9 10	UNITED STATES I	
11	NORTHERN DISTRIC	Case No. 3:18-cv-05813-JSC
12	individually, and on behalf of all others similarly situated,	DECLARATION OF DEIRDRE A.
13	Plaintiffs,	AARON IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFFS MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES
14	VS.	AND COSTS
15 16	CUSHMAN & WAKEFIELD WESTERN, INC., CUSHMAN & WAKEFIELD, INC., and CUSHMAN & WAKEFIELD OF	Date: March 31, 2022 (Final Approval Hearing) Time: 9:00a.m.
17	WASHINGTON DC, INC., and DOES 1-50, inclusive	Dept: Courtroom E, 15th Floor Hon. Magistrate Judge Jacqueline Scott Corley
18	Defendants.	
19		
20 21		
21		
23		
24		
25		
26		
27		
28		
	=	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137 Filed 10/25/21 Page 2 of 17

1	Justin M. Swartz (admitted <i>pro hac vice</i>) jms@outtengolden.com
2	Deirdre Aaron (admitted <i>pro hac vice</i>) daaron@outtengolden.com
3	OUTTEN & GÖLDEN, LLP
4	685 Third Avenue, 25th Floor New York, NY 10017
5	Tel: (212) 245-1000 Fax: (646) 509-2060
6	Jahan C. Sagafi (SBN 227887)
7	jsagafi@outtengolden.com Molly J. Frandsen (SBN 320094)
8	mfrandsen@outtengolden.com OUTTEN & GOLDEN, LLP
9	One California Street, 12th Floor
10	San Francisco, CA 94111 Tel: (415) 638-8828
11	Fax: (415) 638-8810 Paolo Meireles (admitted <i>pro hac vice</i>)
12	Shavitz Law Group, P.A. 951 Yamato Rd, Suite 285
13	Boca Raton, FL 33431 Tel: (561) 447-8888
14	Attorneys for Plaintiffs. Proposed Class and
15	Collective Members, and Aggrieved Employees
16	
17	
18	
19	
20	
21	
22	
23	
24	
25	
26	
27	
28	

I, Deirdre Aaron, declare as follows:

- 1. I am a partner at Outten & Golden LLP ("O&G"), and together with Laura Ho and Ginger Grimes of Goldstein, Borgen, Dardarian & Ho ("GBDH") and Paolo Meireles of Shavitz Law Group, P.A., ("SLG") attorneys for the Plaintiffs in the above-captioned matter ("Class Counsel"). I make these statements based on personal knowledge and would so testify if called as a witness.
- 2. This Declaration is submitted in support of Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorneys' Fees and Costs.
- 3. I am a member in good standing of the bar of the State of New York and the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, and am admitted *pro hac vice* in this matter.

I. BACKGROUND & EXPERIENCE OF OUTTEN & GOLDEN

- 4. O&G is the among largest firms in the country that exclusively represents individuals (not companies) in employment matters. O&G is a 50+ attorney firm with offices in New York, San Francisco, and Washington, D.C., representing plaintiffs in a wide variety of employment matters, including individual and class action litigation involving wage and hour, discrimination, and harassment claims, as well as contract and severance negotiations. In addition to taking contingency fee matters, O&G maintains a substantial practice of hourly work for paying clients and often receives fee awards in the cases it handles, giving O&G a solid foundation of resources from which to take on class action matters such as this one.
- 5. O&G's experience advocating for workers' rights. O&G has represented plaintiffs in hundreds of class and collective actions asserting employment rights on behalf of workers in California and around the country. For example, one judge recently found that "Class Counsel have capably and effectively represented the Settlement Class Members' interests," and praised them for "their outstanding work on this case." *Zamora v. Lyft, Inc.*, No. 16-cv-02558-VC, ECF No. 103 at 6 (N.D. Cal.). O&G attorneys "have . . . extensive experience and expertise in prosecuting wage-and-hour class actions and collective actions." *Galeener v. Source*, No. 13-cv-4960, ECF No. 131 (N.D. Cal. Mar. 13, 2015); *Lillehagen v. Alorica*, No. 13-cv-0092, ECF No.

262 (C.D. Cal. May 31, 2016) (same); Yuzary v. HSBC Bank USA, N.A., No. 12-cv-3693, 2013 WL 1832181, at *4 (S.D.N.Y. Oct. 2, 2013) (finding that O&G attorneys "have substantial experience prosecuting and settling employment class actions, including wage and hour class actions[,] and are well-versed in wage and hour and class action law"); Johnson v. Brennan, No. 10 Civ. 4712, 2011 WL 1872405, at *2 (S.D.N.Y. May 17, 2011) (same); accord Ballinger v. Advance Magazine Publishers, Inc., No. 13 Civ. 4036, 2014 WL 7495092, at *7 (S.D.N.Y. Dec. 29, 2014) ("[b]ased on the firm's performance before me in this and other cases and its work in the foregoing and other cases, I have no question that it will prosecute the interests of the class vigorously"); Perez v. Allstate Ins. Co., No. 11 Civ. 1812, 2014 WL 4635745, at *25 (E.D.N.Y. Sept. 16, 2014) ("O & G has the requisite experience in handling class actions . . . , are well versed in the applicable law, and have the resources necessary to represent the NYLL Class fairly and adequately"); Capsolas v. Pasta Res., Inc., No. 10 Civ. 5595, 2012 WL 1656920, at *2 (S.D.N.Y. May 9, 2012) (O&G attorneys "have years of experience prosecuting and settling wage and hour class actions, and are well-versed in wage and hour law and in class action law"); Damassia v. Duane Reade, Inc., 250 F.R.D. 152, 158 (S.D.N.Y. 2008) (O&G lawyers have "an established record of competent and successful prosecution of large wage and hour class actions, and the attorneys working on the case are likewise competent and experienced in the area").

6. O&G's appointment as class counsel in wage and hour actions. Courts have repeatedly appointed O&G as class counsel in wage and hour class actions. For instance, courts have appointed O&G class counsel in the following wage and hour litigations, among others: Strauch v. Computer Science Corp., 322 F.R.D. 157, 181 n.15 (D. Conn. June 30, 2017) (in wage and hour litigation, finding that O&G "adequately represent[s] the interests of the putative class"), motion to decertify denied, 2017 WL 4683993 (D. Conn. Oct. 18, 2017); Perez v. Allstate Insurance Co., No. 11 Civ. 1812, 2014 WL 4635745, at *25 (E.D.N.Y. Sept. 16, 2014) (appointing O&G as class counsel and noting that "O & G has the requisite experience in handling class actions . . . , are well versed in the applicable law, and have the resources necessary to represent the NYLL Class fairly and adequately"); Jacob v. Duane Reade, Inc., 289 F.R.D. 408,

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

423 (S.D.N.Y. 2013) (appointing O&G as class counsel in assistant manager misclassification 1 case because it has "experience in handling class actions, sufficient knowledge of the pertinent 2 3 law, and sufficient resources to commit to this representation"), aff'd, 602 F. App'x 3 (2d Cir. 2015); and *Damassia v. Duane Reade, Inc.*, 250 F.R.D. 152, 165 (S.D.N.Y. 2008) (granting class 4 certification and appointing O&G as class counsel in multi-state wage and hour class action); cf. 5 Houser v. Pritzker, 28 F. Supp. 3d 222, 248, 255 (S.D.N.Y. 2014) (appointing O&G class counsel 6 in nationwide Title VII litigation and noting that O&G "bring[s] to the case a wealth of class 7 action litigation experience"). 8

7. O&G's appointment as class counsel in settlement contexts. O&G also has frequently been appointed class counsel in class settlements, including, among others: *Pickett v.* Simos Insourcing Sols., Corp., 249 F. Supp. 3d 897, 899 (N.D. Ill. 2017) (appointing O&G class counsel); Walsh v. CorePower Yoga LLC, No. 16 Civ. 5610, 2017 WL 589199, at *8 (N.D. Cal. Feb. 14, 2017) (O&G has "a proven track record in the prosecution of class actions as they have successfully litigated and tried many major class action cases"); Long v. HSBC USA Inc., No. 14 Civ. 6233, 2015 WL 5444651, at *9 (S.D.N.Y. Sept. 11, 2015) (O&G attorneys "have appeared in many major [Fair Labor Standards Act ("FLSA")] and state labor law cases"); Puglisi v. TD Bank, N.A., No. 13 Civ. 637, 2015 WL 574280, at *4 (E.D.N.Y. Feb. 9, 2015) ("O & G has substantial experience prosecuting and settling nationwide wage and hour class and collective actions, and are well-versed in wage and hour law and class action law and are well-qualified to represent the interests of the class."); Aboud v. Charles Schwab & Co., No. 14 Civ. 2712, 2014 WL 5794655, at *2-4 (S.D.N.Y. Nov. 4, 2014) (certifying class and approving settlement of nationwide wage and hour class and collective action); Zeltser v. Merrill Lynch & Co., No. 13 Civ. 1531, 2014 WL 4816134, at *8 (S.D.N.Y. Sept. 23, 2014) (O&G "are experienced employment lawyers with good reputations among the employment law bar"); Hanifin v. Accurate Inventory & Calculating Service, Inc., No. 11 Civ. 1510, 2014 WL 4352060, at *8 (N.D.N.Y. August 20, 2014) (same); Clem v. KeyBank, N.A., No. 13 Civ. 789, 2014 WL 2895918, at *2-4 (S.D.N.Y. June 20, 2014) (finding O&G adequate counsel, certifying class, and approving settlement of nationwide wage

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

and hour class and collective misclassification action); *Yuzary v. HSBC Bank USA, N.A.*, No. 12 Civ. 3693, 2013 WL 5492998, at *2-4 (S.D.N.Y. Oct. 2, 2013) (certifying class action under the NYLL and appointing O&G as class counsel); *Hernandez v. Merrill Lynch & Co., Inc.*, No. 11 Civ. 8472, 2012 WL 5862749, at *4 (S.D.N.Y. Nov. 15, 2012) (appointing O&G as class counsel, noting the firm's years of experience prosecuting and settling wage and hour class actions); *Capsolas v. Pasta Resources Inc.*, No. 10 Civ. 5595, 2012 WL 1656920, at *2 (S.D.N.Y. May 9, 2012) (certifying class and approving settlement of wage and hour class action); and *Palacio v. E*TRADE Financial Corp.*, No. 10 Civ. 4030, 2012 WL 1058409, at *1-2 (S.D.N.Y. Mar. 12, 2012) (certifying class and approving settlement of wage and hour class action brought under New York, California, and federal law).

8. O&G's experience representing plaintiffs in California state and federal courts. O&G attorneys have represented plaintiffs asserting employment claims in representative actions in federal and California state courts, including: Borrego v. Raley's Family of Fine Stores, 34-2015-00177687 (Sacramento Co. Super. Ct.) (pregnancy discrimination); Chen v. Morgan Stanlev Smith Barney LLC, 30-2014-00724866-CUOE-CJC (Orange Co. Super. Ct.) (PAGA claims on behalf of financial advisors regarding reimbursement of business expenses); Lee v. The Hertz Corp., No. CGC-15-547520 (San Francisco Co. Super. Ct.) (Fair Credit Reporting Act claims based on employment application process); Beilke v. Uber Technologies, Inc., No. CGC-17-560916 (San Francisco Co. Super. Ct.) (claims by drivers for miscalculation of fees contractually owed); Calhoun v. Academy Mortgage Corp. (UT), No. RIC-1811790 (Riverside Co. Super Ct.) (Settlement of Fair Credit Reporting Act claims based on employment application process); Storch v. Carrington Holding Co., No. 34, 2017, 201455-CU, OE, GDS (Sacramento Co. Super. Ct.) (\$1,000,000 settlement for overtime misclassification claims on behalf of mortgage loan officers); Gupta v. MGM HD Productions, LLC, No. BC580436 (Los Angeles Super. Ct.) (wage claims for unpaid interns); Whitworth v. SolarCity Corp., No. 16-cv-1540-JSC (N.D. Cal.) (off-the-clock and meal break claims on behalf of installers); Godhigh v Savers, No. 16-cv-2874-WHO (N.D. Cal.) (\$750,000 settlement for overtime misclassification claims of retail store assistant managers in

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

1

16

17

181920

2223

21

2526

24

2728

2018); Wolf v. Permanente Medical Group, Inc., No. 17-cv-05345-VC (N.D. Cal.) (\$2,950,000 settlement for off-the-clock claims of telephone service representatives in 2018); Zamora v. Lyft, Inc., No. 16-cv-02558-VC (N.D. Cal.) (\$1,950,000 settlement for claims of drivers asserting that Lyft used deceptive language in explaining how Prime Time Premiums would be paid to drivers; Lyft eliminated the challenged language during the litigation); Walton v. AT&T Svcs., Inc., No. 15-cv-03653-VC (N.D. Cal.) (\$2,750,000 settlement for overtime misclassification claims of deliverers and designers of corporate trainings in 2018); Armstrong v. Concentrix Corp., No. 16-cv-05363-WHO (N.D. Cal.) (\$320,000 settlement for off-the-clock claims of at-home customer service representatives in 2018); Brown v. Permanente Medical Group, Inc., No. 16-cv-05272-VC (N.D. Cal.) (\$6,255,000 settlement for off-the-clock claims of advice nurses in 2017); Zajonc v. Morgan Stanley & Co. LLC, No. 14 Civ. 5563 (N.D. Cal.) (\$5,995,000 settlement as part of multicase settlement) (Final Analyst trainee off-the-clock wage and hour claims); Buccellato v. AT&T, Inc., No. 10 Civ. 463 LHK (N.D. Cal.) (\$12.5 million settlement of overtime misclassification claims for technical support workers in 2011); Lillehagen v. Alorica, Inc., No. 13 Civ. 92 (C.D. Cal.) (nationwide class action settlement) (call center worker off-the-clock claims).

II. THE REQUESTED FEE IS REASONABLE BASED ON THE RESULTS ACHIEVED AND CONTINGENT RISK

- 9. Based on my experience litigating employment class actions and knowledge of settlements and verdicts in other similar cases, I believe that the proposed Settlement represents an appropriate monetary result for the Settlement Class and Collective Members, particularly in light of the risks of continued litigation, and is in the best interests of the Settlement Class and Collective Members.
- 10. In addition, the fee request is supported by the fact that O&G undertook the financial risk and burden of prosecuting this case on a contingency basis. This matter has required O&G to expend substantial time that could have been spent on other fee-generating matters. We took this matter on a pure contingency basis, expending this effort without any guarantee of recovery. At various times, the litigation has consumed a significant amount of our time.

- 11. Because we often decline to represent workers with valid legal claims who might pay hourly or retain us on a contingency basis there is a significant opportunity cost to each class action we pursue. O&G undertook representation of Plaintiffs in this action without any assurance of payment for its services, litigating the case on a wholly contingent basis in the face of significant risk. Class cases of this type are, by their very nature, complicated and time-consuming. Any lawyer undertaking representation of large numbers of affected employees in class actions inevitably must be prepared to make a tremendous investment of time, energy, and resources. Sometimes these cases result in a recovery for the class, and sometimes they do not, in which case we are paid nothing for our time and costs incurred. O&G's commitment to this case precluded the firm from accepting other profitable or otherwise worthwhile cases, both because of the number of hours this case required and because O&G needed to ensure adequate resources to litigate the case if the case had not settled. Committing resources to this case necessitated turning down hourly-paying clients as well as other contingency cases.
- 12. For example, we have invested millions of dollars of time and hundreds of thousands of dollars of expenses without being compensated for our time or out-of-pocket costs. *See, e.g., Benedict v. Hewlett-Packard Co.*, No. 13-cv-119-BLF (N.D. Cal.) (overtime misclassification claims on behalf of technical support workers); *Winans v. Starbucks Corp.*, 796 F. Supp. 2d 515 (S.D.N.Y. 2011) (tip pool violation claims on behalf of baristas); *Pippins v. KPMG LLP*, No. 11 Civ. 377, 2012 WL 6968332 (S.D.N.Y. Nov. 30, 2012) (overtime misclassification claims on behalf of auditors).
- 13. In addition, Plaintiffs' Counsel's retainer agreements with Plaintiffs allowed for a one-third contingency fee arrangement.

III. THE REQUESTED FEE IS REASONABLE UNDER THE LODESTAR CROSS CHECK

14. As a cross-check on the requested percentage-of-the-fund award, O&G's lodestar confirms the appropriateness of the requested fee.

A. <u>O&G'S REASONABLE HOURLY RATES</u>

- 15. O&G ordinarily and regularly bills clients on an hourly fee basis, based on each attorney's standard hourly rate. O&G's rates range from \$550 to \$1,300 per partner's hour, \$675 to \$925 per counsel's hour, \$300 to \$550 per associate's hour, \$250 per law clerk's hour, and \$270 to \$290 per paralegal's hour. My current hourly rate is \$600 per hour. The firm's clients regularly accept and pay O&G's hourly rates.
- 16. These rates are my firm's current billing rates and are supported by the extensive and specialized experience in these types of cases and recognized expertise described. Our rate structure has been approved by other courts and has been paid to our firm by hourly-paying clients. *See e.g., del Toro Lopez v. Uber Techs., Inc.*, No. 17 Civ. 06255, 2018 WL 5982506, at *4 (N.D. Cal. Nov. 14, 2018) ("Class Counsel's hourly rates, ranging from \$250 to \$850 for attorneys, are reasonable in light of the market for legal services of this type and quality."); *Zamora v. Lyft, Inc.*, No. 16 Civ. 2558, 2018 WL 4657308, at *3 (N.D. Cal. Sept. 26, 2018) ("Class Counsel's hourly rates, ranging from \$240 to \$260 for staff and \$280 to \$850 for attorneys, are reasonable in light of the market for legal services of this type and quality.").
- 17. I have personal knowledge of the hourly rates charged by other attorneys with comparable experience as well as to the attorneys within the firm who worked on this matter. Based on that information, I believe that these rates are fully consistent with, if not lower than, the market rate in San Francisco for attorneys with comparable expertise, experience and qualifications, and that they are comparable to rates of attorneys specializing in complex litigation around the country. Based on the information I have, I believe that the rates charged by O&G for its partner and non-partner attorney time are reasonable and appropriate fees for those with comparable expertise, experience, and qualifications.
- 18. I am a partner in O&G's Class Action Practice Group. Since joining the firm in September 2012, I have been engaged primarily in prosecuting wage and hour class and collective actions and class action discrimination cases.

19. Recent representative cases I have litigated include *Kis v. Covelli*, No. 18 Civ. 54 (N.D. Ohio May 29, 2020) (\$4.625 million settlement on behalf of Panera café assistant managers in overtime misclassification case); *Ratcliffe v. Food Lion*, No. 18 Civ. 1177 (M.D. Tenn. Oct. 15, 2020) (\$550,000 settlement on behalf of grocery store assistant managers in overtime misclassification case); and *Rotondo v. J.P. Morgan Chase Bank N.A.*, No. 19 Civ. 2328 (S.D. Ohio Dec. 2, 2019) (\$5 million settlement on behalf of fathers denied paid parental leave).

- 20. I received a Juris Doctor degree, magna cum laude and Order of the Coif, from Washington University in St. Louis in 2010. I received my B.A. from Northwestern University in 2004.
- 21. Prior to joining O&G, I worked as a Staff Attorney for the U.S. Court of Appeals for the Eighth Circuit from August 2010 to August 2012.
- 22. I was admitted to the New York State Bar in 2011, and the Bar of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania in 2016. I am also admitted to the bars of the U.S. District Courts for the Eastern and Southern Districts of New York, the Eastern District of Pennsylvania, and the U.S. Court of Appeals for the Second Circuit. I am a member in good standing of each of these bars.
- 23. I am a member of the American Bar Association Section on Labor and Employment Law's Federal Labor Standards Legislation Committee and a chapter editor for the committee's Fair Labor Standards Act ("FLSA") Midwinter Report, a member of the National Employment Lawyers Association ("NELA"), and board member of NELA's Eastern Pennsylvania Chapter.
- 24. I have been selected as a Rising Star by Super Lawyers from 2016-2021, was selected for Best Lawyers: Ones to Watch for 2021, and received Public Justice's Trial Lawyer of the Year Award in 2017 for my work on Gonzalez v. Pritzker, a class action challenging the U.S. Census Bureau's criminal background check policy.
- 25. Justin M. Swartz is a Partner and Co-Chair of the firm's Class Action Practice Group and its LGBT Employment Rights Practice Group. He has represented thousands of lowwage workers, including restaurant workers, and frequently co-counsels with non-profit

organizations in doing so. He is a frequent speaker on employment law topics and has contributed to two ABA/BNA treatises, The Fair Labor Standards Act and Employment Discrimination Law. He is active in bar associations including the American Bar Association Section of Labor and Employment Law where he is Co-Chair of the Section's CLE/Institutes and Meetings Committee, Co-Chair of the Committee on Equal Employment Opportunity Law, and is a former Co-Chair of the Ethics and Professional Responsibility Committee. Prior to joining O&G in December 2003, he graduated from DePaul University School of Law with honors in 1998.

- 26. Sally J. Abrahamson was a Partner at O&G in Washington, DC until October 2020, and co-Chair of the Lesbian, Gay, Bisexual, Transgender & Queer (LGBTQ) Workplace Rights Practice Group and a member of the firm's Class Action Practice Group. Prior to joining O&G in September 2012, she worked as law clerk to the Honorable Frank Montalvo of the U.S. District Court in the Western District of Texas, El Paso Division and later as the Bilingual Staff Attorney at D.C. Employment Justice Center. She received her B.A. from Oberlin College in 2003 and her J.D., with honors, from American University's Washington College of Law in 2009.
- 27. Pamela A. Disney was an Associate at O&G and a member of the firm's Class Action Practice Group from September 2017 to February 2020. Prior to joining the firm, Ms. Disney was a Fellow with the Lawyers' Committee for Civil Rights Under Law where she litigated voting rights cases and worked on employment discrimination matters. She received her B.A., cum laude, from Trinity University in San Antonio and her J.D., cum laude, from American University Washington College of Law, where she was a Public Interest Public Service Scholar.
- 28. Molly J. Frandsen is an associate at O&G and a member of the firm's Class Action Practice Group. Prior to joining the firm, Ms. Frandsen clerked for the Honorable Chief Justice Mark Recktenwald of the Hawaii State Supreme Court. She received her B.A. from the University of California, Santa Barbara in 2011, and her J.D. from the University of California, Berkeley School of Law in 2017.
- 29. Emily Abelow is a Case Analyst at O&G. Ms. Abelow joined O&G in August 2021.

- 30. Christopher Alter was an e-Discovery Specialist at O&G from September 2016 to August 2020. Mr. Alter joined O&G in September 2016 initially as a Litigation Paralegal and later as an e-Discovery Administrator and subsequently e-Discovery Specialist.
 - 31. Lynsey Major was a paralegal at O&G from July 2015 to July 2021.
- 32. Sara Olson is a Special Projects Coordinator at O&G. Prior to her current position, she joined O&G in May 2016 as a paralegal.
 - 33. Rania Tootla is a paralegal at O&G. Miss Tootla joined O&G in June 2018.
- 34. Christopher Truong is a paralegal at O&G. Mr. Truong joined O&G in September 2016.
- 35. Stephanie Yu was Paralegal Coordinator and a paralegal at O&G from September 2017 to March 2020.

B. <u>O&G'S REASONABLE TIME SPENT AND NATURE OF ITS</u> REPRESENTATION OF THE CLASS AND COLLECTIVES

- 36. All attorneys and legal staff at O&G are instructed to maintain contemporaneous time records reflecting the time spent on this and other matters. In all instances, the time keeper indicates the date and amount of time spent on a task to one-tenth of an hour; describes the work that was performed during the indicated time period; and identifies the case to which the time should be charged. Attached as **Exhibit A** is a spreadsheet of O&G's detailed time records for this case listed in chronological order. The names of non-Plaintiff/Opt-in Plaintiff employee witnesses have been redacted from these records to protect their privacy.
- 37. As of October 15, 2021, O&G has devoted approximately 1,509.9 attorney and support staff hours litigating and settling this case, with work still continuing. The firm's total lodestar for these hours amounts to \$699,404.50. However, O&G has also applied an across-the-board discount of 5%. O&G's final lodestar is thus \$664,434.28.
- 38. This figure will increase in the coming months, due to additional work performed by O&G for the benefit of the Settlement Class and Collective Members—including, securing final approval of the settlement, overseeing the Settlement Administrator's implementation of the

mechanics of the settlement, and assisting Settlement Class and Collective Members with questions during and after the settlement process.

39. A summary of hours expended by O&G's timekeepers through October 15, 2021 is as follows:

	Hours	Fees
Attorneys	1,198.8	\$616,583.50
Staff	311.1	\$82,821.00
Total	1,509.9	\$699,404.50

Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al, No. 18 Civ. 05813 (JSC) OUTTEN & GOLDEN LLP Attorneys									
Name	Initials	Position Position	O&G Rate	Hours	O&G Total				
Justin Swartz	JMS	Partner	\$ 990.00	90.4	\$ 89,496.00				
Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Partner	\$ 625.00	153.2	\$ 95,750.00				
Deidre A. Aaron	DAA	Partner	\$ 600.00	367.0	\$ 220,200.00				
Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Associate	\$ 375.00	210.7	\$ 79,012.50				
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Associate	\$ 350.00	377.5	\$ 132,125.00				
Attorney Subtotal				1198.8	\$616,583.50				

		Staff			
Name	Initials	Position	O&G Rate	Hours	O&G Total
Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Paralegal	\$	13.2	\$
			270.00		3,564.00
Christopher Truong	CXT	Paralegal	\$	2.5	\$
			270.00		675.00
DC Law Clerk	DCLC	Law Clerk	\$	35.0	\$
			250.00		8,750.00
Lynsey Major	LXM	Paralegal	\$	200.2	\$
			270.00		54,054.00
Rania Tootla	RXT	Paralegal	\$	13.0	\$
			270.00		3,510.00
SF Law Clerk	SFLC	Law Clerk	\$	23.8	\$
			250.00		5,950.00
Sara Olson	SXO	Paralegal	\$	11.9	\$
			270.00		3,213.00
Stephanie Yu	SYU	Paralegal	\$	11.5	\$
			270.00		3,105.00

 Staff Subtotal
 311.1
 \$82,821.00

40. At all times, O&G used a small team of core attorneys and paralegals in order to minimize duplication of efforts and maximize billing judgment, and made every effort to have the work performed by the attorney or paralegal with the lowest hourly rate who was able to perform it effectively.

- 41. In addition, O&G exercised billing judgment by conducting an extensive review of our contemporaneous time records in preparation for this application. In addition, O&G made judicious cuts for any potentially duplicative work, *de minimis* time billed by attorneys and staff who had little participation in the action (i.e., O&G proactively removed any attorneys or staff who worked less than five hours on this matter), and other similar subtractions based on an exercise of billing judgment. Not counting the across-the-board reduction or the time removed by billers who worked less than ten hours on this matter, O&G additionally removed over 100 hours of time and over \$35,000 in lodestar.
- 42. The hours O&G billed were properly and necessarily spent on the firm's assigned tasks and projects. The following summarizes the approximate hours O&G spent on each phase of litigation:
- 43. O&G spent around 8.9 hours investigating Plaintiff Seltz's claims, including interviewing Plaintiff Seltz and other potential witnesses, reviewing his employment records, conducting legal and company research, and drafting the initial demand letter.
- 44. Plaintiff Seltz and Cushman thereafter agreed to toll the FLSA and state law statutes of limitations for putative class and collective members as of December 2017, and ultimately engaged in private mediation in July 2018. In preparation for the mediation, O&G and Shavitz Law Group ("SLG") (together, "Counsel for Seltz") performed legal research and review of mediation discovery to draft a mediation statement, negotiated the mediation data exchange, and computed a damages model without incurring the expense of retaining a damages expert. Counsel

for Seltz also drafted and filed the state court complaint in advance of mediation. O&G spent about 161.8 hours on this phase of the case.

- 45. After initial mediation was unsuccessful, Plaintiffs Seltz and Cushman engaged in early discovery and initial case management, including negotiating the case scheduling order, and preparing and serving initial disclosures and discovery requests. O&G spent about 99.2 hours on this phase of litigation.
- 46. In November 2018, the parties in *Seltz* and *Dixon* agreed to stayed the cases pending mediation. In preparation for the June 2019 joint mediation, O&G performed legal research and review of mediation discovery to draft sections of the mediation statement, negotiated the mediation data exchange, and worked with SLG to analyze and compute a damages model without incurring the expense of retaining a damages expert. O&G spent about 110.8 hours on this this phase of the case.
- 47. After mediation was unsuccessful, litigation and discovery continued. In this phase of the case, Counsel for Seltz responded to discovery requests and produced documents, and reviewed document productions from Cushman. O&G also drafted and filed a 216(b) motion with detailed exhibits, including several declarations O&G collected from individuals who had been employed by Cushman as Junior Appraisers. Cushman decided not to oppose the motion, and Counsel for Seltz negotiated a 216(b) notice stipulation. O&G spent approximately 756.7 hours on this phase of the case.
- 48. In October of 2020, the parties in both the *Seltz* and *Dixon* matters resumed settlement discussions and agreed to mediation. During this phase of the case, O&G and SLG negotiated the mediation data exchange, contributed to the damages calculations, and O&G took the lead in drafting the mediation statement. O&G also spent time on 216(b) notice administration, including communicating with opt-ins and potential opt-ins. O&G spent approximately 120.9 hours on this phase of the case.

Although Plaintiff Seltz's complaint pled a collective including both Junior Appraisers and Appraisers, the motion for conditional certification only sought certification of a collective of Junior Appraisers.

49. Following the March 11, 2021 mediation, O&G prepared the initial draft of the long form settlement agreement and the settlement notices, and both O&G and SLG participated in negotiating the long form settlement agreement and related documents. O&G contributed research, and revisions to the amended complaint and motion for preliminary approval, and drafted sections of the supplemental briefing in support of the preliminary approval motion. O&G and SLG also prepared detailed declarations in support of the briefing. O&G spent approximately 232 hours on this phase of the case.

- 50. Since the Court preliminary approved the settlement, O&G has spent time on notice administration and preparing the attorneys' fee application. O&G spent approximately 19.6 hours on this phase of litigation.
 - 51. The three law firms will be splitting fees pro-rata by lodestar.

IV. THE LITIGATION EXPENSES WERE REASONABLY INCURRED

52. O&G maintains all records regarding costs expended on each case. I have reviewed the records of costs expended in this matter. As of the date of October 15, 2021, which does not yet account for additional costs to be incurred in the course of the final approval process and any other costs arising during the settlement check distribution process, O&G has incurred \$30,658.36 in litigation costs and expenses. The costs and expenses identified below in an itemized summary based on each category of costs are reflected in the accounting books and records GBDH maintains in the ordinary course of business. These costs include:

Outten & Golden LLP Costs Summary	
Categories	Costs
Court Fees/Filing Fees/Service Fees	\$1,340.19
Document Management	\$1,056.82
In-House Postage	\$174.41
In-house printing	\$210.05
Meals	\$24.05
Research - Online	\$4,586.73
Special Masters/Mediators/Arbitrators	\$16,250.00
Telephone	\$10.76
Travel - airline/car/mileage/taxi/gas	\$6,668.36

1	Website Design/Hosting Cost \$336.99
2	Grand Total \$30,658.36
3	
4	53. I have reviewed the billing and expense records described above and certify to the
5	Court that the work was reasonably and necessarily performed and expenses reasonably and
6	necessarily incurred in connection with the litigation of this matter.
7	* * *
8	I declare, under penalty of perjury, under the laws of the State of California and the United
9	States that the foregoing is true and correct. Executed this 25th day of October 2021, at
10	Philadelphia, Pennsylvania.
11	/s/ Deirdre A. Aaron
12	Deirdre A. Aaron
13	
14	
15	
16	
17	
18	
19	
20	
21	
22	
23	
24	
25	
26	
27	
28	

Exhibit A

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 2 of 124

Date	Professional	Initials	Narrative	Hours	Rat	e	ount
10/26/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Investigate case against Cushman Wakefield.	3.1	\$	625.00	\$ 1,937.50
10/26/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA regarding case evaluation.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
10/31/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conduct intake with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	1.1	\$	625.00	\$ 687.50
10/31/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review client intake documentation.	1.0	\$	625.00	\$ 625.00
10/31/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re investigation and merits.	0.3	\$	625.00	\$ 187.50
10/31/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re investigation and merits.	0.3	\$	990.00	\$ 297.00
10/31/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft demand letter.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$ 125.00
10/31/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re investigation.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
10/31/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re investigation.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
11/3/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
11/7/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Revise demand letter.	0.6	\$	625.00	\$ 375.00
11/8/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review and revise draft demand letter.	0.3	\$	990.00	\$ 297.00
11/8/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re demand letter and local counsel.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
11/9/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Finalize demand letter.	0.3	\$	625.00	\$ 187.50
11/9/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
11/9/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re demand letter.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
11/9/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with G. Shavitz regarding co- counsel.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
11/10/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re potential witnesses	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
11/10/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
11/10/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
11/13/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review demand letter.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
11/27/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re opposing counsel.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$ 125.00
11/27/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Research potential witnesses.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$ 125.00
11/27/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
11/28/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with opposing counsel J. Mulherin re tolling and initial steps.	0.4	\$	990.00	\$ 396.00
11/28/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re settlement demand.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
11/28/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re conference with opposing counsel J. Mulherin.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
11/28/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with opposing counsel J. Mulherin re demand letter.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
12/4/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
12/4/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
12/4/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
12/4/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re negotiations.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
12/5/2017	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re sample data request letters.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$ 60.00
12/5/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re telephone conference with opposing counsel and next steps.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with opposing counsel J. Mulherin re potential claim.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
12/5/2017			, , ,	•	1		
12/5/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft tolling agreement.	0.6	\$	625.00	\$ 375.00
	Sally J. Abrahamson Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA SJA	Draft tolling agreement. Correspondence with client.	0.6	\$	625.00 625.00	\$ 375.00 62.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 3 of 124

12/8/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re letter re data necessary to mediate.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
12/8/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with co-counsel G, Shavitz re tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
12/11/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft data request letter.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$ 312.50
12/11/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re settlement negotiation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
12/11/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
12/12/2017	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
12/18/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
12/18/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
12/18/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re Plaintiff's last pay check.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
12/19/2017	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/3/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
1/3/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/3/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re late check.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/4/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Leave voicemail for client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/8/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conduct research re liquidated damages.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$ 250.00
1/8/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with client and JMS re potential claims.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
1/8/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA and client re potential claims.	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$ 198.00
1/8/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review notes re case investigation status.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
1/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re possible settlement.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
1/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/22/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with opposing counsel re last paycheck.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
1/22/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with client re conference with opposing counsel re potential claims.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
1/22/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel and client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/22/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Leave voicemail for opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/31/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Investigate potential witnesses.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$ 312.50
1/31/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re commission exemption.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/31/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re commission exemption.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/5/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2/5/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re potential mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2/7/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re Plaintiff's last check.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2/7/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client and opposing counsel re potential claims.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2/8/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2/14/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
2/14/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client and opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2/14/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with opposing counsel re potential mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2/14/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re update on call with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2/14/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re data request letter.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
	•		•	•		

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 4 of 124

2/14/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re potential mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
2/14/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re potential mediation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
2/15/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
2/22/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
2/27/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
2/27/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from SJA, co-counsel G. Shavitz re meeting with Defendants.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
2/27/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re meeting with Defendants.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
2/28/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re arbitration.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
2/28/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re opposing counsel meeting.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
3/1/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
3/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with client and client's personal attorney.	0.8	\$ 625.00	\$	500.00
3/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
3/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client's personal attorney.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
3/2/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re questions from Plaintiff's personal lawyer.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
3/3/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re opposing counsel comments.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
3/5/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re premediation meeting.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
3/10/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz re opposing counsel meeting.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
3/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
3/21/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re mediation data.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re pre-mediation meeting.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re premediation meeting.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/3/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/10/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re data for damage calculations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/13/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/17/2018	Abrahamson DC Law Clerk	DCLC	(JEM) Conduct research re preparation for	3.5	\$ 250.00	\$	875.00
4/17/2018	Sally J.	SJA	mediation presentation re settlement. Conference with opposing counsel re settlement	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
4/17/2018	Abrahamson Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	data. Correspondence with SJA re preparation for	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
4/17/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	meeting with opposing counsel. Correspondence with SJA re damage calculations and facts.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
4/18/2018	DC Law Clerk	DCLC	(JEM) Conduct research in preparation for	4.8	\$ 250.00	\$	1,200.00
4/18/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	mediation presentation re settlement. Review class member data from Defendants.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
4/18/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re class member data from Defendants.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
4/18/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re class member data.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
4/19/2018	DC Law Clerk	DCLC	(JEM) Draft and revise PowerPoint presentation in preparation for mediation presentation resettlement.	4.5	\$ 250.00	\$	1,125.00
4/19/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft position statement.	0.8	\$ 625.00	\$	500.00
4/19/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conduct research re highly compensated exemption.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
4/19/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re highly compensated exemption.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
4/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft pre-mediation statement.	3.1	\$ 625.00	\$	1,937.50
			+	+		-	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 5 of 124

		1=		Ta .	- 1			
4/20/2018 4/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron Justin Swartz	DAA JMS	Conduct research re 7(i) exemption. Prepare for pre-mediation meeting with opposing	0.4	\$	990.00	\$	240.00 99.00
4/20/2018	Sally J.	SJA	counsel. Conference with DAA re potential exemption	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
	Abrahamson	DAA	defenses.					
4/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re potential exemption defenses.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
4/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re 7(i) exemption.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
4/22/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft letter to Defendant re settlement.	2.1	\$	625.00	\$	1,312.50
4/23/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft pre-mediation letter to Defendant.	2.1	\$	625.00	\$	1,312.50
4/23/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise pre-mediation letter.	0.8	\$	600.00	\$	480.00
4/23/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with JMS, SJA, and co- counsel re meeting with opposing counsel.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
4/23/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with JMS, DAA and co- counsel re pre-mediation meeting.	0.4	\$	625.00	\$	250.00
4/23/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with SJA, DAA and co-	0.4	\$	990.00	\$	396.00
4/23/2018	Leatin Occurre	JMS	counsel re pre-mediation meeting.	0.4		000.00	Φ.	396.00
4/23/2018	Justin Swartz Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise draft settlement letter. Review correspondence from team re pre-mediation		\$ \$	990.00	\$	60.00
4/23/2010	Delitare A. Aaron	DAA	statement.	10.1) D	000.00	Ф	60.00
4/23/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review damages calculations.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
4/24/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Prepare for pre-mediation meeting with opposing	1.1	\$	990.00		1,089.00
			counsel and client.					,
4/24/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from co-counsel re potential client.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
4/24/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from SJA, co-counsel G. Shavitz re 7(i) exemption.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
4/24/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review client documents re commission structure.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
4/24/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re client documents re commission structure.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
4/24/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re appraiser compensation structure.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
4/24/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re appraiser compensation	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
4/24/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	structure. Correspondence with SJA re updated damages	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
4/25/2018	Sally J.	SJA	calculations. Travel to NYC for pre-mediation meeting.	4.0	\$	625.00	\$	2,500.00
4/25/2018	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel and Defendant	2.7	\$	625.00	\$	1,687.50
4/25/2018	Abrahamson	JMS	and follow up meeting with JMS.	2.7			\$	2,673.00
4/25/2018	Justin Swartz Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with opposing counsel and client.	0.2	\$ \$	990.00	\$	120.00
			Review correspondence from co-counsel P. Meireles, co-counsel re damages calculations.		,			
4/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re pre-mediation meeting.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
4/25/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re pre-mediation meeting.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
4/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
4/27/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client re settlement negotiation.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/1/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re investigation.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/4/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/4/2018	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re status of	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/7/2018	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	mediation. Correspondence with opposing counsel and client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/14/2018	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/15/2018	Abrahamson Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conduct research on case law re appraiser	3.1	\$	375.00	\$	1,162.50
5/15/2018	·	SJA	misclassification.			625.00		
	Sally J. Abrahamson		Conference with PAD re case background and investigation.	0.5	\$		\$	312.50
5/15/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with SJA re case background and investigation.	0.5	\$	375.00	\$	187.50
5/15/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with potential client.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
5/16/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review documents from the case file for background re status of the case.	0.5	\$	375.00	\$	187.50
5/17/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conduct research re case law re appraiser misclassification.	1.1	\$	375.00	\$	412.50
L				1			<u> </u>	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 6 of 124

5/17/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
5/17/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review Defendants' response letter re exemption arguments.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
5/17/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/17/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/17/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendants' response letter re exemption arguments.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/17/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re Defendant's response to claims.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/17/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re Defendant's response to claims.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
5/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with client.	0.4	\$	625.00	\$	250.00
5/18/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re 7(i) exemption.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re mediation negotiations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/18/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz re negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
5/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conduct research re 207(i) issues.	1.2	\$	625.00	\$	750.00
5/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from team re next steps.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/20/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review research re potential defenses.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
5/20/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence re claims evaluation.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
5/21/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with client.	0.4	\$	625.00	\$	250.00
5/21/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA, SJA, co-counsel G. Shavitz re possible exemption arguments, mediation, scope of class.	0.3	\$	990.00	\$	297.00
5/21/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS, SJA, co-counsel G. Shavitz re possible exemption arguments, mediation, scope of class.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
5/21/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS, DAA, co-counsel G. Shavitz re possible exemption arguments, mediation, scope of class.	0.3	\$	625.00	\$	187.50
5/21/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conduct research re financial disclosures.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
5/22/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/24/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re meet and confer.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/24/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re scheduling telephone conference.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
5/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference JMS and opposing counsel re mediation.	0.5	\$	625.00	\$	312.50
5/25/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with SJA and opposing counsel re mediation.	0.5	\$	990.00	\$	495.00
5/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re mediation.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
	/ wrananison							60.00
5/31/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re 7(i) exemption and attached case.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	00.00
5/31/2018 6/1/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron Sally J.	DAA		0.1	\$	600.00 625.00	\$	62.50
	Deirdre A. Aaron Sally J. Abrahamson Sally J.		7(i) exemption and attached case.					
6/1/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	7(i) exemption and attached case. Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/1/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson Sally J. Abrahamson Sally J. Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA SJA	7(i) exemption and attached case. Correspondence with client. Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00 625.00	\$	62.50 62.50
6/1/2018 6/4/2018 6/4/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA SJA SJA	7(i) exemption and attached case. Correspondence with client. Correspondence with client. Correspondence with client. Telephone conference with opposing counsel re	0.1	\$ \$	625.00 625.00 625.00	\$ \$	62.50 62.50 62.50
6/1/2018 6/4/2018 6/4/2018 6/4/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA SJA SJA	7(i) exemption and attached case. Correspondence with client. Correspondence with client. Correspondence with client. Telephone conference with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations. Correspondence with client.	0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1	\$ \$	625.00 625.00 625.00 625.00	\$ \$	62.50 62.50 62.50 62.50
6/1/2018 6/4/2018 6/4/2018 6/4/2018 6/7/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA SJA SJA SJA SJA	7(i) exemption and attached case. Correspondence with client. Correspondence with client. Correspondence with client. Telephone conference with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations. Correspondence with client.	0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1	\$ \$ \$	625.00 625.00 625.00 625.00	\$ \$ \$	62.50 62.50 62.50 62.50 62.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 7 of 124

6/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS and opposing counsel re mediation.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$ 187.50
6/12/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA and opposing counsel re meditation.	0.3	\$ 990.00	\$ 297.00
6/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re California issue and litigation strategy.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
6/12/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re California issue and litigation strategy.	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$ 198.00
6/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re California issue re legal research tasks.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
6/12/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re California issue re legal research tasks.	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$ 198.00
6/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re potential Private Attorneys General Act suit.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/12/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re potential Private Attorneys General Act suit.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with potential mediator.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re mediation dates.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/12/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re drafting complaint and next steps.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/12/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with potential mediator.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/13/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with client.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
6/13/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with potential mediator.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/13/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/13/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re potential mediator.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/13/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with opposing counsel J. Mulherin re choosing mediator and scheduling mediation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/13/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from JMS, SJA, opposing counsel re potential mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/13/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re choosing mediator.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/13/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with potential mediator.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/14/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with potential mediator.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
6/14/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re venue decision and first filed issue.	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$ 198.00
6/14/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re conference with potential mediator.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/14/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD and JMS re drafting complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/14/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with SJA re drafting complaint.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
6/14/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with PAD re drafting complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/14/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, PAD re drafting complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/14/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with potential mediator.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/15/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft complaint.	5.5	\$ 375.00	2,062.50
6/15/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/15/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re researching first filed issue.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/17/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with opposing counsel J. Mulherin re venue issues.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/18/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Futher review and revise complaint.	1.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 450.00
6/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review and revise complaint.	1.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 750.00
6/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
6/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD re complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/18/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with SJA re drafting complaint and first filed rule.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
6/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with PAD re drafting complaint and first filed rule.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 8 of 124

6/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re mediator.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re selecting mediator and venue for filing.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/18/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re selecting mediator and venue for filing.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re conference with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re mediation date.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/18/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from SJA, opposing counsel, PAD re mediation and draft complaint.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/18/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re venue decision.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/18/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with potential mediator.	0.1	\$	990.00		99.00
6/19/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and revise complaint.	0.8	\$	375.00	\$	300.00
6/19/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Telephone conference with team re strategy for	0.4	\$	625.00	\$	250.00
6/19/2018	Abrahamson Justin Swartz	JMS	filing and mediation. Telephone conference with team re strategy for	0.4	\$	990.00	\$	396.00
			filing and mediation.				Ů	
6/19/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/19/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re mediator.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/19/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re mediators.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/19/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re mediator proposal.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/19/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from JMS, SJA, opposing	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/20/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	counsel re mediation. Conduct research re case law and case background	3.9	\$	375.00	\$	1,462.50
			documents while reviewing the complaint.					
6/20/2018	DC Law Clerk	DCLC	[DXP]: Conduct research re minimum number of class members required for class certification in DC state court.	2.5	\$	250.00	\$	625.00
6/20/2018	DC Law Clerk	DCLC	[DXP]: Draft correspondence with PAD re research re the minimum number of class members required for class certification in DC state court.	1.0	\$	250.00	\$	250.00
6/20/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DXP re research assignment re class certification requirements in DC state court.	0.3	\$	375.00	\$	112.50
6/20/2018	DC Law Clerk	DCLC	[DXP]: Conference with PAD re research assignment re class certification requirements in DC state court.	0.3	\$	250.00	\$	75.00
6/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with client.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
6/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
6/20/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with opposing counsel J. Mulherin	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/20/2018	Sally J.	SJA	re selecting mediator. Correspondence with team re mediator selection.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/20/2018	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re potential mediator.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/20/2018	Abrahamson Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re theory of	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	case and mediation. Correspondence with team re M. Rudy as mediator.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
							Ů	
6/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, PAD re draft complaint.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/21/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conduct research re case law and summarize findings re first-filed rule in D.C. Superior Court.	3.5	\$	375.00		1,312.50
6/21/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise draft complaint.	1.4	\$	600.00		840.00
6/21/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re follow-up research and mediation.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/21/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with SJA re follow up research on first filed.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
6/21/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with PAD re follow up research on first filed.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/21/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re draft complaint.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/22/2018	Abrahamson		Povice complaint	1.2	r r	375.00	¢	450.00
6/22/2018	Pamela A. Disney Sally J.	PAD SJA	Revise complaint. Review and revise draft complaint.	0.6	\$	375.00 625.00		450.00 375.00
0/22/2010	Abrahamson	337	To view and revise draft complaint.	0.0	Ψ	020.00	Ψ	373.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 9 of 124

6/22/2018	Christopher Truong	CXT	Prepare Consent to Join form for signature per PAD.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
6/22/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re draft complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/22/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re draft complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
6/22/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review SJA edits to draft complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
6/22/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Revise Consent to Join form.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/22/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review DocuSign correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
6/25/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Revise complaint.	1.5	\$ 375.00	\$	562.50
6/25/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Research class and collective actions under DC law.	0.7	\$ 375.00	\$	262.50
6/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re filing complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/25/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with SJA re potential mediators.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
6/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with JMS re potential mediators.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with potential mediators re mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review co-counsel revisions to complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD re revised complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/25/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with potential Mediator.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
6/25/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re scheduling mediation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
6/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review local rules re complaint and summons filing.	1.4	\$ 270.00	\$	378.00
6/26/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review documents re filing complaint.	0.9	\$ 375.00	\$	337.50
6/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Revise complaint.	0.6	\$ 625.00	\$	375.00
6/26/2018	Rania Tootla	RXT	Review court rules and complaint.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
6/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare civil cover sheet and summons.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
6/26/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conduct research re case law on issue of first filing in federal courts.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
6/26/2018	Christopher Truong	CXT	Conduct research re procedures re filing complaint before the D.C. Superior Court.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
6/26/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with team re filing issues.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
6/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise civil cover sheet.	0.2	\$ 270.00		54.00
6/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Left voicemail for opposing counsel re mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/26/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Update task list.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
6/26/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
6/26/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
6/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re mediator scheduling.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD re filing complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/26/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from SJA, PAD re complaint filing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
6/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with BXS re civil cover sheet.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
6/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review civil action handbook.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
6/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re civil cover sheet.	0.1	\$ 270.00 270.00		27.00
6/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with clerk re nature of suit categories.	0.1	\$	\$	27.00
6/26/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re scheduling mediation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	·	99.00
6/26/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with PAD re case information sheet.	0.1	\$ 990.00		99.00
6/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/27/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/27/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re mediation and tolling.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 10 of 124

6/27/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from co-counsel G. Shavitz, SJA re status of mediation negotiations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/27/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel and co- counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/27/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD and MTL re complaint filing.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
6/27/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re mediation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/28/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Review complaint process in rules of Superior Court in DC.		\$ 270.00	\$ 135.00
6/28/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conduct research re case law re the first-file rule.	0.9	\$ 375.00	\$ 337.50
6/28/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Telephone conference with court clerk re complaint filing fees.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
6/28/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with team with findings re case law re first-file rule.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
6/28/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Telephone conference with Department of Consumer and Regulatory Affairs re correct agent to serve Defendants.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
6/28/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD re case law re first filed rule.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/28/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise subpoena; collate filing and complaint service instructions.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
6/28/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MTL re subpoena and complaint service instructions.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
6/28/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with team re filing the complaint.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
6/29/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and revise complaint and documents to be filed.	1.6	\$ 375.00	\$ 600.00
6/29/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	File complaint via case file xpress for DC Superior court; troubleshoot filing errors on website.	0.8	\$ 270.00	\$ 216.00
6/29/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Correspondence with team re complaint packet and filing.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
6/29/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Revise and finalize complaint.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
6/29/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Calendar deadlines.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
6/29/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Revise credit card tracker re complaint filing.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
6/29/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Finalize exhibit a to complaint.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
6/29/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Correspondence with Accounting re credit card use re complaint filing.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
6/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD re drafting complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD re filing complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re filing complaint and service.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with mediator re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re next steps re damage calculations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with SXO re filing complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with mediator re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/29/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re filing complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/2/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Update task list.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
7/2/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence with mediator.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
7/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with mediator re status of case.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re filing complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/2/2018	Sara Olson	sxo	Circulate bates stamped complaint to SJA.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/2/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence with SJA re complaint.	0.1	\$ 990.00	99.00
7/3/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Check to see if submitted complaint was cf stamped	0.6	\$ 270.00	\$ 162.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 11 of 124

7/3/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re Judge assignment.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/2/2010	Abrahamson	SJA		0.1	\$	625.00	¢.	60.50
7/3/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re stamped complaint.	0.1)	625.00	\$	62.50
7/3/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Save document to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/3/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Calendar new deadline.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/3/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Revise calendar deadline.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/6/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence re damage calculations and information for mediation.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
7/9/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review DC Superior Court rules re initial order and summons deadlines.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
7/9/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar Initial Scheduling Conference.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/9/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update calendar entry re deadline to serve summons.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/9/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Check docket re initial order.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/9/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SXO re initial order.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/9/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Correspondence with LXM re calendaring deadlines.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/10/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
7/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft case background memo.	0.8	\$	270.00	\$	216.00
7/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review docket for initial order.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/12/2018	Lýnseý Major	LXM	Conduct research re adding PAD to electronic notice.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re adding PAD to electronic notice.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/16/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/16/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re Initial Order.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/16/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Check docket re Initial Order.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/16/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re mediation data.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/17/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re initial order.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/17/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with clerk re initial order.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
7/18/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/19/2018	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	mediation data. Draft mediation statement.	1.2	\$	625.00	\$	750.00
	Abrahamson							
7/19/2018 7/19/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS SJA	Review draft mediation statement.	0.4	\$ \$	990.00	\$	396.00
	Sally J. Abrahamson		Correspondence with co-counsel re term sheet.	0.1		625.00	,	62.50
7/19/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD re mediation statement.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/19/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with mediator re mediation logistics.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/19/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re mediation logistics.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
7/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise mediation statement and cases cited.	0.6	\$	600.00	\$	360.00
7/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft term sheet.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
7/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re mediation statement.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re complaint package.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re term sheet.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re mediation statement.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re mediation data.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/20/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save initial order to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/20/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar internal deadline to serve complaint after mediation.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
7/23/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Revise mediation statement.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
7/23/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re data clarifications.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/24/2018	Stephanie Yu	SYU	Send mediation statement and exhibits to mediator H. Hughes; prepare Courtesy Copy and send Courtesy Copy to H. Hughes via FedEx.	1.0	\$	270.00	\$	270.00
7/24/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise mediation statement.	0.8	\$	270.00	\$	216.00
7/24/2018	Stephanie Yu	SYU	Finalize mediation statement and exhibits.	0.5	\$	270.00		135.00
7/24/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare exhibits to mediation statement and revise mediation statement.	0.5	\$	270.00		135.00
			modiation statement.	ļ				

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 12 of 124

7/24/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Finalize mediation statement.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$	250.00
7/24/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re exhibits.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
7/24/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, LXM re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/24/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review mediation statement and exhibits.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/24/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SYU re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/24/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/24/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review mediation statement and exhibits.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/24/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re mediation statement and exhibits.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/24/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
7/24/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re finalized mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
7/24/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review draft term sheet.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
7/24/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SYU re finalizing and serving mediation brief.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re damage calculations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
7/26/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review additional data from Defendants.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/26/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review production from Defendants.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
7/26/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re Defendant's production.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
7/27/2018	Rania Tootla	RXT	Compile mediation binder.	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$	135.00
7/27/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare mediation binder.	0.6	\$ 270.00	\$	162.00
7/27/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA and RXT re mediation binder.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
7/27/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re documents in support of mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
7/27/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with LXM re mediation preparation	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
7/30/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with team re mediation preparation.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
7/30/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with team re mediation preparation.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$	250.00
7/30/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review case law in preparation for mediation.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$	250.00
7/30/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with team re mediation preparation.	0.4	\$ 990.00	\$	396.00
7/30/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Prepare for mediation.	0.4	\$ 990.00	\$	396.00
7/30/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re term sheet.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/30/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re compensation structure.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/30/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with LBB re term sheet.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
7/31/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Prepare for, travel to, attend and travel from mediation.	16.9	\$ 990.00	\$ ^	16,731.00
7/31/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Attend mediation.	5.0	\$ 625.00	\$	3,125.00
7/31/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Travel back from ATL to DC (weather delays).	4.5	\$ 625.00	\$	2,812.50
7/31/2018	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	Travel from DC to mediation in ATL.	4.2	\$ 625.00	\$	2,625.00
7/31/2018	Abrahamson Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re other wage and hour cases	1.5	\$ 270.00	\$	405.00
7/31/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	against Defendant. Conduct research re highly compensated	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
7/31/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	exemption. Correspondence with SJA re research re other	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
		1,15	wage and hour cases against Defendant.			Ļ	
7/31/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Create docket alerts re Defendant.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
8/1/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$	187.50
8/1/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review docket alets re Defendant.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
8/1/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with mediator re follow up on mediation.	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$	198.00
8/1/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator re follow up on mediation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/1/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re outcome of mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/1/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re status of mediation	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
	1			<u> </u>			

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 13 of 124

8/1/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re telephone conference with mediator.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/4/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re next steps in negotiation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/6/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review Bloomberg and Westlaw for new cases against Defendant.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
8/6/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re review of Bloomberg and Westlaw for new cases against Defendant.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/7/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/8/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re new cases against Defendant.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
8/9/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re research re new cases against Defendant.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
8/9/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re deadline to serve complaint.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft JMS and DAA Pro Hac Vice applications.	1.0	\$ 270.00	\$	270.00
8/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft enclosure letter re JMS and DAA's application and payment to the Committee on Unauthorized Practice of Law.		\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
8/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research local rules re Pro Hac Vice admission.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
8/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Check dockets for new cases against Defendant.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
8/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft Proof of Service re JMS and DAA Pro Hac Vice application and payment to the Committee on Unauthorized Practice of Law.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
8/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re check of dockets for new cases against Defendant.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/13/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research registered agent and draft enclosure letter to process server re process of service of complaint.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
8/13/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research local rules re process of service and revise enclosure letter re service.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
8/13/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re new cases against Defendant.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
8/13/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator re continuing negotiations.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/13/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re negotiations.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/14/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/14/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/14/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with RXT re Plaintiff search.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/15/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re waiver of service.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/15/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with RXT re Plaintiff search.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
8/16/2018	Rania Tootla	RXT	Conduct research re putative class members.	3.0	\$ 270.00	\$	810.00
8/16/2018	Sara Olson	sxo	Draft, print, and prepare cover letter, proof of service, mail labels, and complaint package and serve Defendants.	1.6	\$ 270.00	\$	432.00
8/16/2018	Rania Tootla	RXT	Revise letters to putative class.	1.5	\$ 270.00		405.00
8/16/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re DC Superior Court rules re waiver of service and service of summons.	0.6	\$ 270.00	\$	162.00
8/16/2018	Rania Tootla	RXT	Print envelopes for mailings.	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$	135.00
8/16/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Investigate and correspondence with witnesses.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$	250.00
8/16/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft enclosure letter and correspondence re service of complaint on Defendant.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
8/16/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conduct research re Waiver of Service.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
8/16/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re research re DC Superior Court rules re waiver of service and service of summons.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
8/16/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SXO re preparing complaint for service.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
8/16/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise Proof of Service re complaint and summons.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
8/16/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/16/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review and revise service package.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/16/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Scan and save tracking receipt for complaint service on Defense counsel.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/16/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Telephone conference with LXM re service of complaint.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
						•	-

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 14 of 124

8/16/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with SXO re service of complaint.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/16/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with RXT re Plaintiff search advertising.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/16/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re mediation process.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
8/17/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Conference with BXS re case management.	0.7	\$	270.00	\$	189.00
8/17/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft preservation letter.	0.5	\$	270.00	\$	135.00
8/17/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
-,,	Abrahamson				*		*	
8/17/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
8/17/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re status of settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
8/17/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Correspondence with team re certified mail for complaint service on Defendant's counsel.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/17/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar Defendant's deadline to answer complaint.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/17/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save tracking of summons to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/17/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re preservation letter.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/17/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/17/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare mailing of the preservation letter.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/19/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator re settlement	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
			negotiations.					
8/20/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save client documents to case file.	0.4	\$	270.00		108.00
8/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client and review client documents.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
8/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
8/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
8/21/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with USPS re return receipt of complaint service.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
8/21/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re case status.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
8/21/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator and team re settlement.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
8/22/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with client.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
8/22/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
8/22/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
8/22/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from team re status of settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/23/2018	Justin Swortz	JMS		0.4	- t	990.00	¢	396.00
8/23/2018	Justin Swartz Sally J.	SJA	Conference with SJA re settlement negotiations. Conference with JMS re settlement negotiations.	0.4	\$	625.00	\$	250.00
0/20/2010	Abrahamson	0071	Conterence with time to settlement negotiations.	0.4	Ι Ψ	020.00	*	200.00
8/23/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
8/23/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SXO re certified receipt of complaint service.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/23/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Correspondence with team re affidavit of service.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/24/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re negotiation strategy and timing of motion practice.	0.3	\$	990.00		297.00
8/24/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Scan, save, and circulate return receipt.	0.3	•	270.00	¢	81.00
8/24/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Correspondence with team re Plaintiffs' response to		\$	270.00	\$	81.00
8/24/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Defendant's administrative motion. Conference with JMS re negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
	Abrahamson	1		ļ	4		<u> </u>	
8/24/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
8/27/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research Case FileExpress filing re proof of service.	0.4	\$	270.00	\$	108.00
8/27/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS, SJA re additional class member communications.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/27/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with team re serving the complaint.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
8/27/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save certified receipt re proof of service to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/27/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare filing re proof of service of complaint and summons.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
			summons.				l	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 15 of 124

8/27/2018	Sara Olson	SXO	Correspondence with team re filing receipt of complaint service on Defendant and affidavit of service.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/27/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re additional case investigation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/27/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	File proof of service of complaint and summons.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/27/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save filing receipt to case file and correspondence with accounting re filing charge.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/27/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re further investigation.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
8/28/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re witness research.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
8/28/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re filing notice of service.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
8/28/2018	Abrahamson Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SMH, SYU re additional case	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
			investigation and class member communications.					
8/29/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from team re next steps.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
8/29/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Prepare for call with co-counsel L. Ho.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
8/29/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with accounting re filing charge.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
8/30/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update database re retainer dates and preservation letter dates.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
8/30/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SYU re witness search.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/4/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft mediation statement.	1.6	\$	625.00	\$	1,000.00
9/4/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re reaching out to other counsel - Laura Ho.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/4/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re potential cooperation.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
9/5/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho re potential cooperation with California Case.	0.3	\$	990.00	\$	297.00
9/5/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Conference with Plaintiffs' counsel L. Ho re potential	0.3	\$	625.00	\$	187.50
9/5/2018	Abrahamson Justin Swartz	JMS	cooperation with California Case. Correspondence with SJA and L. Ho re potential	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
9/6/2018	Sally J.	SJA	cooperation telephone conference. Correspondence with Plaintiff re status of case.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/6/2018	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	Telephone conference with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/6/2018	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel, opposing counsel		\$	625.00	\$	62.50
3/3/2010	Abrahamson	Journ	re telephone conference with opposing counsel.	0.1	l $^{\psi}$	020.00	ı Ψ	02.50
9/6/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from SJA re call with opposing counsel re removal motion.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/7/2018	Stephanie Yu	SYU	Conduct research re new associate witnesses.	1.9	\$	270.00	\$	513.00
9/7/2018	Stephanie Yu	SYU	Conduct research re new appraiser witnesses.	1.2	\$	270.00		324.00
9/7/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re Defendant's deadline to answer after removal of complaint.	0.3	\$	270.00	-	81.00
9/7/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
9/7/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save removal of action to case file.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
9/7/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/7/2018		JMS	Correspondence with California secured	0.1		990.00	\$	00.00
9/7/2018	Justin Swartz Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with California counsel. Conference with JMS re preparation for call from	0.1	\$	625.00		99.00 62.50
9/7/2018	Abrahamson Justin Swartz	JMS	reporter. Conference with SJA re preparation for call from	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
9/7/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	reporter. Calendar Defendant's revised deadline to answer.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
9/7/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re judge assignment.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
9/7/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant's Notice of Appearance to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
9/7/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant's corporate disclosure statement to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
9/7/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re California counsel.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
9/10/2018	Stephanie Yu	SYU	Conduct research re potential witnesses.	2.3	\$	270.00	\$	621.00
9/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	File SJA's District Court of DC bar renewal fees.	0.3	\$	270.00		81.00
9/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft SJA's notice of appearance.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
9/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research local rules re formatting of notice of appearance.	0.2	\$	270.00		54.00
9/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re clerk's notice re counsel's appearance.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
9/10/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Complete DDC attorney registration.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
L	,anamoon						<u> </u>	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 16 of 124

9/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MTL and accounting re payment for SJA's District Court of DC bar renewal.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update SJA's contact information in District Court of DC system.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save notice re Judge Howell's assignment to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save errata re removal of complaint to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/10/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re filing notice of appearance.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re admission to the District Court of DC.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar Plaintiff's deadline to remand case to state court.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re DDC admission application.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re amending caption of notice of appearance.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/11/2018	Stephanie Yu	SYU	Conduct research re potential witnesses.	0.9	\$ 270.00	\$ 243.00
9/11/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with clerk re Notice of Appearance.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/11/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re notice of appearance.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/12/2018	Stephanie Yu	SYU	Conduct Quality Control on contact list.	0.9	\$ 270.00	\$ 243.00
9/12/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review potential witness profiles.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$ 360.00
9/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re state court complaint filing against Defendant.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
9/12/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Judge's standing order.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
9/12/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS, TM re notice of removal.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review newly filed WI case.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re intakes.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review Judge Howell's standing order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re intakes.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/12/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re additional case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/12/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re status.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
9/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re state court complaint filing against Defendant.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Add PAD to docket alerts.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar parties' deadline to meet and confer and submit proposed scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review Judge Howell's standing order for civil cases.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/13/2018	Stephanie Yu	SYU	Conduct research re potential witnesses and add to contacts list.	2.8	\$ 270.00	\$ 756.00
9/13/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review Defendant's answer to complaint.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
9/13/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review Defendant's answer to complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/13/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re Defendant's answer.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/13/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re reviewing potential witness profiles.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/13/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save mailed copy of errata re Defendant's Motion to Dismiss to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/13/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review answer to complaint.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
9/13/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re next steps.	0.1	\$ 990.00	99.00
9/17/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho re possibly co-counseling.	0.6	\$ 625.00	\$ 375.00
9/17/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with co-counsel L. Ho re cooperation between California Case and DC case.	0.6	\$ 990.00	\$ 594.00
9/17/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/18/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re CA co-counsel and negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
			, ,	1		

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 17 of 124

9/20/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re CA co-counsel and negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
9/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
9/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re removal and next steps.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
9/20/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re removal and next steps.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
9/20/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz re potential CA co-counsel.	0.1	\$ 990.00	ļ .	99.00
9/24/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with L. Ho and SJA re cooperation with California Case.		\$ 990.00		99.00
9/25/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft Pro Hac Vice admission motions, declarations and proposed orders for JMS and DAA.	, 1.9	\$ 270.00	\$	513.00
9/25/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Finalize and file JMS Pro Hac Vice admission application.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
9/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with CA co-counsel re strategy for litigation and negotiation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
9/25/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Revise Pro Hac Vice motion for JMS.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
9/25/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re case status, Pro Hac Vice motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
9/25/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review draft Pro Hac Vice motion papers.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
9/25/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, LXM re draft Pro Hac Vice motion papers.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
9/25/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re Pro Hac Vice motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
9/25/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re case hearing in Superior Court.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
9/25/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise JMS's Pro Hac Vice declaration.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
9/25/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Remove calendar deadline re Superior Court hearing.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
9/25/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re local rules re Certificate of Good Standing.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
9/25/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re local rules re Certificate of Good Standing.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
9/25/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with accounting re receipt for JMS's Pro Hac Vice application.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
9/25/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with CA co-counsel re strategy for litigation and negotiation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
9/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise, finalize, and file DAA's Pro Hac Vice admission application.	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$	135.00
9/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
9/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD re scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
9/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save DAA and JMS's Pro Hac Vice admission motion to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
9/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with accounting re receipt for DAA's Pro Hac Vice admission.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
9/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Orders re DAA and JMS's Pro Hac Vice admission to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
9/27/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review standing orders and local rules re filing an initial joint status report and scheduling order.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
9/28/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re local rules re scheduling orders, standing orders filed in Judge Howell's cases.	0.8	\$ 270.00	\$	216.00
9/28/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review local rules, federal rules, and Judge's standing order re 23(f) conference and content of the meet and confer report.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$	150.00
9/28/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review sample Meet and Confer Reports and Scheduling Orders.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$	150.00
9/28/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD, co-counsel, and 26(f) conference.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
9/28/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with SJA re the 23(f) conference and proposed scheduling order.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
9/28/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re research re local rules, standing orders filed in Judge Howell's cases	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
9/28/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
10/1/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft Proposed Joint Scheduling Order.	1.0	\$ 375.00	\$	375.00
10/1/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft the meet and confer report.	1.0	\$ 375.00		375.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 18 of 124

10/1/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Revise scheduling order.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$ 250.00
10/1/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with SJA re scheduling order.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
10/1/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with PAD re scheduling order.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
10/2/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft meet and confer report.	0.9	\$ 375.00	\$ 337.50
10/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with L. Ho re case status.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$ 187.50
10/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Revise scheduling order.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
10/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re Rule 26f conference.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
10/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re scheduling order and meet and confer statement.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
10/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz and L. Ho re cooperation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
10/2/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review draft tolling agreement and proposed attachment.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
10/2/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re meet and confer.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
10/2/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re meet and confer.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
10/2/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review draft scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
10/3/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Meet and confer with PAD, opposing counsel re scheduling order.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$ 250.00
10/3/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Meet and confer with SJA, opposing counsel re scheduling order.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
10/3/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft Meet and Confer notes.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
10/3/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Meet and Confer Report requirements to prepare for Meet and Confer with opposing counsel.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
10/3/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz and L. Ho	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
10/3/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with PAD re drafting meet and confer report.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
10/3/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with L. Ho re the meet and confer and status of the case.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
10/3/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with SJA re drafting the meet and confer report.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
10/4/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and revise meet and confer report.	2.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 825.00
10/4/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review conference notes from L. Ho.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
10/5/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
10/5/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re meet and confer report.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
10/9/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Revise Joint Discovery Statement.	0.8	\$ 625.00	\$ 500.00
10/9/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review SJA revisions to the joint meet and confer report.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
10/9/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review calendar and update task list.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
10/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise and format meet and confer statement.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
10/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise and format scheduling order.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
10/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Finalize proposed order and joint statement.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
10/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	File meet and confer report with scheduling order.	0.2	\$ 270.00	54.00
10/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	62.50
10/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Further correspondence with opposing counsel re scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
10/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conference with PAD re filed meet and confer report with scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/12/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with LXM re filed meet and confer report with scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
10/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Finalize meet and confer report and scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save filed meet and confer report to case files.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/12/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re Court's order re courtesy copies.	0.1	\$ 270.00	27.00
10/12/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
10/15/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar scheduling order deadlines.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
10/15/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re Court order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 19 of 124

101962018 Sally J. SAA Abrahamson Sally J. SAA Conference with Planniff R. Seltz 0.1 S 025,00 S 025,00 S 197,50 Sally J. SAA Conference with Planniff R. Seltz in toolket 0.2 S 270,00 S 045,00 S 197,50 S 197,700 S	10/15/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review court scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
Abrahamana	10/15/2018	Pamela A. Disney					37.50
Abrahamson	10/16/2018		SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
Sally J. SAL Correspondence with turn or litigation strategy 0.1 \$ 0.25.00 \$ 0	10/17/2018		SJA	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$ 187.50
Abrahamson	10/17/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM		0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
1917/2018 Justin Swartz	10/17/2018		SJA	Correspondence with team re litigation strategy.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
19.017/2018 Justin Swartz MIS Correspondence with SJA re named Plaintiff issue 0.1 \$ 990.00 \$ 990.00 19.018/2018 Sally J. SJA Conference with JMS re status of case and next studies. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 \$ 6	10/17/2018		JMS		0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
10/18/2018 Lynsey Major LXM Save Order granting Pro Hat Vice admission to 0,1 \$ 270.00 \$ 270.00 \$ 270.00	10/17/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS		0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
Abrahamson Stopes Sally J. SJA Conference with DAA re case status. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50	10/18/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Order granting Pro Hac Vice admission to	0.1	270.00	27.00
Abrahamson	10/18/2018		SJA		0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
Sally J.	10/18/2018		SJA	Conference with DAA re case status.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
Sally J. Abrahamson S.J.A Conference with JMS te discovery and settlement 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50	10/18/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re case status.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/18/2018 Justin Swartz JMS	10/18/2018		SJA		0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
	10/18/2018		JMS	Conference with SJA re discovery and settlement	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
	10/22/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Compare proposed scheduling order against Judge Howell's scheduling order and calendar missing	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$ 135.00
Pamela A. Disney PAD Correspondence with team re interrogatories and 0.2 \$ 375.00 \$ 75.00	10/22/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review scheduling order and calendar entries.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
Abrahamson	10/22/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with team re interrogatories and	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
additional deadlines. additional deadlines.	10/22/2018		SJA	·	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
10/29/2018	10/22/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD		0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
10/29/2018	10/29/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft initial disclosure template.	0.6	\$ 270.00	\$ 162.00
DC rules	10/29/2018	Sally J.	SJA		0.5		312.50
Lynsey Major LXM	10/29/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM		0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
10/29/2018 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50	10/29/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update discovery matrix with client documents.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
Abrahamson Sally J. SJA Draft initial disclosures. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50	10/29/2018				0.2		54.00
Abrahamson		Abrahamson		·	0.1		\$ 62.50
11/1/2018		Abrahamson			0.1	\$	
	10/29/2018	Lynsey Major			0.1	\$	27.00
11/1/2018	11/1/2018	Rania Tootla	RXT		1.0	\$ 270.00	\$ 270.00
11/1/2018	11/1/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM		0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
electronic service between parties.	11/1/2018						108.00
Abrahamson Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re timing and client ssues. 11/5/2018 Pamela A. Disney PAD Review case file and correspondence, and draft interrogatories and requests for production. 11/5/2018 Lynsey Major LXM Review and revise initial disclosures. 0.4 \$ 270.00 \$ 108.00 \$ 11/5/2018 Lynsey Major LXM Finalize and serve initial disclosures on opposing 0.2 \$ 270.00 \$ 54.00 \$ 11/5/2018 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Edit initial disclosures and supervise service. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 11/5/2018 Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence re initial disclosures. 0.1 \$ 375.00 \$ 37.50 \$ 37.50 \$ 11/5/2018 Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with PAD, SJA re initial 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 11/5/2018 Sally J. Abrahamson Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re settlement 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50							
Issues. Issues. Issues. Issues. Issues. Issues. It It It It It It It I				Draft initial disclosures.	0.8	\$	500.00
Interrogatories and requests for production.	11/4/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS		0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
Lynsey Major LXM Finalize and serve initial disclosures on opposing counsel. Sally J. Abrahamson PAD Review correspondence re initial disclosures. Lynsey Major LXM Finalize and serve initial disclosures on opposing counsel. Sally J. Abrahamson PAD Review correspondence re initial disclosures. Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with PAD, SJA re initial constant of the constant of	11/5/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD		1.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 487.50
Counsel Coun	11/5/2018			Review and revise initial disclosures.			108.00
Abrahamson Pamela A. Disney PAD Review correspondence re initial disclosures. Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with PAD, SJA re initial disclosures. Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with PAD, SJA re initial disclosures. Sally J. Abrahamson Abrahamson Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re initial disclosures and potential stay.	11/5/2018	Lynsey Major		counsel.		\$	\$ 54.00
Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with PAD, SJA re initial 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00	11/5/2018		SJA	Edit initial disclosures and supervise service.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
disclosures. 11/5/2018 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS resettlement 0.1 \$625.00 \$62.50	11/5/2018	Pamela A. Disney			0.1	\$	\$ 37.50
Abrahamson negotiations. 11/5/2018 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re initial disclosures and potential stay. Correspondence with SJA re initial disclosures and potential stay.	11/5/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM		0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
11/5/2018 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re initial disclosures and 0.1 \$ 990.00 \$ 99.00 potential stay.	11/5/2018		SJA		0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
	11/5/2018		JMS	Correspondence with SJA re initial disclosures and	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
	11/6/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 20 of 124

11/6/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with co-counsel re initial disclosures.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
11/6/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case memo.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
11/6/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant's initial disclosures to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
11/7/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft Plaintiffs' first set of requests for production of documents.	2.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 787.50
11/7/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft Plaintiff's first set of interrogatories.	2.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 900.00
11/7/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review sample interrogatories and requests for production in misclassification cases.	0.9	\$ 375.00	\$ 337.50
11/8/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re meet and confer times.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
11/12/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise first set of requests for production of documents and first set of interrogatories.	1.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 660.00
11/12/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and revise Plaintiff's first set of requests for production and first set of interrogatories.	0.8	\$ 375.00	\$ 300.00
11/12/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review recent District Court opinion re misclassification of appraisers.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 187.50
11/12/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re first set of requests for production and first set of interrogatories.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/12/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Update task list.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
11/12/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review recent opinion re adjusters,	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
11/14/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft stipulation for stay of litigation and tolling agreement.	3.4	\$ 375.00	1,275.00
11/14/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Finalize discovery requests and draft enclosure letter.	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$ 135.00
11/14/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re potential stay to explore mediation.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
11/14/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/14/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re updated discovery	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/14/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	requests. Correspondence with SJA, PAD re stipulation to	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/14/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	stay case for mediation. Correspondence with SJA, DAA re drafting a	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
11/14/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	stipulation. Correspondence with SJA, PAD, LXM re discovery	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/14/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	requests. Correspondence with LXM re finalizing discovery	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
			requests for service.			
11/14/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review final discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/14/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/14/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA and PAD re electronic service.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
11/14/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review stay agreement.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
11/14/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence re potential revisions to stay agreement.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
11/15/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Revise stipulation to stay litigation and toll statute of limitations according to DAA revisions.	0.7	\$ 375.00	\$ 262.50
11/15/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise stipulation in support of stay.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
11/15/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, PAD re stipulation in support of stay.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/15/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review final stipulation re stay.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/15/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re final stipulation re stay.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/15/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant's discovery requests to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
11/15/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar Plaintiff's deadline to respond to discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 270.00	27.00
11/15/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review Defendant's document request and interrogatories.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
11/15/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA and PAD re tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
11/15/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re stay, stipulation and mediation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
11/19/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise stipulation re tolling.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
11/19/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, PAD re stipulation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/19/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re stipulation re tolling.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/19/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re mediators, discovery for mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/19/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re stipulation to stay matter.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant's edits to stipulation re stay.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
		_			 	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 21 of 124

11/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re Defendant's edits to stipulation re stay.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
11/20/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review Defendant changes to stay stipulation.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
11/20/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re mediators.	0.1	\$	990.00		99.00
11/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re stipulation re tolling.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re mediators.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/20/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re potential mediators.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
11/20/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator's office re potential mediators.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
11/21/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Finalize and file stipulation to stay action.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
11/21/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re local rules re stipulation filing.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
11/21/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar deadline to meet and confer re mediation.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
11/21/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar deadline to hold mediation and file status report.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
11/22/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re discovery meet and confer call.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Research appraisal cases and draft documents to request.	2.7	\$	625.00	\$	1,687.50
11/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research and save docket entries re related case (Boyd v BOA).	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
11/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research and save docket entries of related case (Karali v. Branch Banking).	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
11/26/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review compensation plan.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
11/26/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator's office re	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
11/20/2010	oustin owartz	OIVIO	availability.	0.1	"	330.00	Ψ	33.00
11/26/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review court order re stay.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/26/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Review court order re stay.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
44/00/0040	Abrahamson	D 4 4	O	0.4		000.00	Φ.	00.00
11/26/2018 11/26/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron Sally J.	DAA SJA	Correspondence with SJA re mediators. Correspondence with DAA re stipulation.	0.1	\$ \$	600.00 625.00	\$	60.00 62.50
11/26/2018	Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re stipulation.	0.1	Ф	625.00	Э	62.50
11/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save minute order to case file re stay.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
11/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Cancel deadline to respond to discovery requests, re stay of discovery.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
11/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Cancel deadline to amend pleadings, re stay of proceedings.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
11/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update calendar deadline to submit joint status report.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
11/26/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case memo re stayed deadlines.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
11/26/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re limited mediation discovery.	. 0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re limited mediation discovery.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
11/26/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel and opposing counsel re limited mediation discovery.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
11/26/2018	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
	Abrahamson		mediation.					
11/26/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re compensation plan.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/26/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review recent case re denial of summary judgment for appraisers.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/27/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conduct research re salary basis requirement.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
11/27/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re salary basis test.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/28/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conduct research re salary basis requirement.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
11/28/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft targeted discovery list.	0.3	\$	625.00	\$	187.50
11/28/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with team re pre-mediation discovery.	0.2	\$	600.00		120.00
11/28/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with team re pre-mediation discovery.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
11/28/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review California complaint.	0.2	\$	600.00	_	120.00
11/28/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator's office.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
11/28/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re California complaint.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/28/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re salary basis test.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/28/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re salary basis test.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
11/28/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re preparing for mediation.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
11/28/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with mediator H. Hughes re mediation availability.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/28/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re correspondence with mediator's office.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
	<u> </u>		modiator o omoo.				Ь	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 22 of 124

11/28/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel and client re targeted discovery list.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
11/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$	250.00
11/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft correspondence with opposing counsel re co- counsel review.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$	187.50
11/29/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review documents and correspondence re targeted discovery in preparation for conference with co-counsel and opposing counsel.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
11/29/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with team and opposing counsel, pre-mediation discovery.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
11/29/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with team and opposing counsel re mediation, pre-mediation discovery.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$	150.00
11/29/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with team and opposing counsel re mediation, pre-mediation discovery.	0.4	\$ 990.00	\$	396.00
11/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review client notes re discovery in preparation for meet and confer.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
11/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re mediation dates.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
11/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with mediator re mediation dates.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
11/29/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re data exchange for mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
11/29/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft notes from telephone conference with team and opposing counsel re mediation and targeted discovery.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
11/29/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with mediator H. Hughes offices re mediation dates.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/29/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re scheduling mediation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
11/29/2018	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re selecting mediator.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
11/30/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review stipulation and upcoming calendar deadlines.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
11/30/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re mediation date and information for mediator.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
11/30/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with mediator D. Rotman and JMS re mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
11/30/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar mediation date.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
12/10/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from SJA, opposing counsel re pre-mediation discovery.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/10/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
12/10/2018	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz and SJA re working with the client.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
12/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with mediator's assistant re invoice.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
12/10/2018	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar internal deadline to submit check request for mediation.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
12/11/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from SJA, opposing counsel re pre mediation logistics.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/17/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
12/17/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with SCH re severance agreement issue.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
12/20/2018	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel and co- counsel re mediation date.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
12/20/2018	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from SJA, co counsel re mediation data.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/2/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/7/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/10/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co- counsel re settlement data.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/10/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel and opposing counsel re data request.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/15/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re opposing counsel transition.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/28/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review tolling agreement re confidentiality.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/28/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re tolling agreement re confidentiality.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
1/28/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case memo re changes in Defendant's	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
		1	counsel.	ļ		<u> </u>	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 23 of 124

1/28/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant's Notice of Appearance to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
1/30/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/30/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement data exchange.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
2/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re pre-mediation discovery.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
2/1/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re pre-mediation discovery.	0.1	\$ 625.00		62.50
2/4/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
2/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from SJA, client re mediation, deposition.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
2/6/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz and PAD re case status, next steps.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
2/6/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz and SJA re case status and next steps.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
2/6/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review correspondence from Defendant re protective orders.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
2/6/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, PAD re call with client.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
2/6/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re correspondence from Defendant re protective orders.	0.1	\$ 625.00		62.50
2/6/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re following up on the conference.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
2/6/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence from DAA re status of the case.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
2/6/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with LXM re saving documents, creating a contact list.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
2/7/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research local rules and Judge Beryl's rules re protective order templates.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
2/7/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Revise proposed protective order.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$	187.50
2/7/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Create Plaintiff contact list.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
2/7/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re researching District Court of DC model protective order.	0.1	\$ 625.00		62.50
2/7/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re Court's rules re	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
2/7/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	protective order templates. Save draft of stipulated confidentiality order to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
2/7/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar Defendant's deadline to respond re outstanding discovery.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
2/7/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re proposed protective order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
2/8/2019	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with LBB re general release.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
2/8/2019	Abrahamson Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re proposed	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
2/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	protective order. Review proposed confidentiality order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
2/12/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with L. Ho re mediation preparation.	0.2	\$ 990.00		198.00
2/12/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review opposing counsel's edits to protective order.		\$ 625.00		62.50
2/12/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re opposing counsel's edits to protective order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
2/12/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re proposed protective order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
2/13/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with LXM re timing of confidentiality stipulation.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
2/13/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conference with PAD re timing of confidentiality stipulation.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
2/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review protective order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
2/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re protective order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	_	60.00
2/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel and opposing counsel re protective order.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
2/14/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with LXT re filing the protective order.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
2/15/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, SJA re stipulation re protective order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
2/15/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re motion for stipulation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
2/15/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re motion for stipulation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
2/15/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MCD re protective order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
				•	 		

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 24 of 124

2/15/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence re filing the protective order.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
2/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JET re covering case.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
2/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re .	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re scheduling client deposition.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with DAA and Plaintiff R. Seltz re providing tax documents.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
2/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JET re case background.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re status of mediation, deposition, staffing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise motion for protective order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re motion for protective order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/22/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence re status of the case.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
2/22/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Order re Pro Hac Vice admission to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2/22/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Order re Stipulated Protective Order to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re case transition, mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/22/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re preparing mediation binder.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2/22/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re Defendant's production for mediation.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2/22/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant's mediation production to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2/22/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re staffing.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re case status, staffing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re strategy for discovery and mediation.	0.4	\$ 600.00	 240.00
2/25/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re strategy for discovery and mediation.	0.4	\$ 990.00	\$ 396.00
2/25/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft notes from conferences with JMS, DAA, and update task list accordingly.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
2/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re case status, mediation, depositions.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
2/25/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re case status, mediation, depositions.	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$ 198.00
2/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS, PAD re case status, mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/25/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA, PAD re case status, mediation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
2/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re damages calculations, mediation statement, depositions.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/25/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2/25/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with JMS, DAA re case status, mediation.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
2/25/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re damages calculations, mediation statement, depositions.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
2/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review case documents re case status and discovery.	0.9	\$ 375.00	\$ 337.50
2/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Revise joint status report.	0.8	\$ 375.00	\$ 300.00
2/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Defendants' proposed joint status report.	0.3	\$ 375.00	112.50
2/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review notes from intakes with potential witnesses.	0.3	\$ 375.00	112.50
2/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondences with SJA re potential depositions, case staffing.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
2/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with team re joint status report.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
2/26/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re co-counsel's Pro Hac Vice status.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2/26/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Format joint status report.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with DAA re setting up team conference.	0.1	\$ 375.00	37.50
2/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with team re joint status report.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
2/26/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review joint status report.	0.1	\$ 990.00	99.00
2/26/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re mediation logistics.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
2/26/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re staffing.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 25 of 124

2/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review case documents, correspondence with team and opposing counsel, and notes re the status of the discovery and update task list accordingly.	1.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 562.50
2/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review joint status report.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
2/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with opposing counsel S. Montani re Plaintiffs' approval.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
2/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with team re scheduling conference re case status.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
2/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with DAA re potential deponents.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
2/28/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with team re scheduling a check-in conference.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
3/1/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Defendant's document production and initial disclosures.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 187.50
3/1/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with team re mediation preparation.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
3/1/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with team re mediation preparation.	0.4	\$ 990.00	\$ 396.00
3/1/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with team re discovery and depositions in preparation for conference with team.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
3/1/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft notes from conference with team re next steps.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
3/1/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Update task list re next steps.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
3/1/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re mediation production.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
3/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re document and data production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
3/4/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save joint status report to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
3/4/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save order re joint status report to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
3/4/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar joint status report deadline re extending stay or entering scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
3/5/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review notes and update task list.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
3/9/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re logistics for telephone conference.		\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
3/12/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re mediation preparation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
3/12/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	production and status of mediation.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
3/13/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review case status notes, mediation statement, Defendant's production.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 187.50
3/13/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with JMS re case status notes, mediation statement, Defendant's production.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
3/14/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re deposition logistics.	0.1	\$ 990.00	99.00
3/15/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, PAD re mediation update to client.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
3/15/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with PAD re settlement structure.	0.1	\$ 990.00	 99.00
3/15/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with L. Ho re mediation and mediation scheduling.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
3/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with team re mediation rescheduling and contacting Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
3/18/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar internal deadline to follow up re outstanding document production.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
3/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re scheduling a conference re case status.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
3/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz re case status and mediation.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
3/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Prepare for conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz re case status.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
3/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
3/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with DAA re case status.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
3/20/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with L. Ho re mediation scheduling.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
3/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re rescheduling mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
3/21/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re rescheduling mediation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
3/21/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with L. Ho re potential mediators and dates.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
3/22/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re rescheduling mediation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
3/24/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re client issues.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 26 of 124

3/26/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar revised mediation date.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
3/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with team re rescheduling mediation.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
3/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re rescheduling mediation.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
4/3/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save stipulation to continue stay to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
4/3/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review joint stipulation and calendar tentative date to submit further joint status report.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
4/3/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review status report.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/22/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar internal deadline re following up on outstanding production.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
4/30/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re status of	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
5/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	the case. Correspondence with PAD re client update.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence re mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/9/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with JMS, co-counsel re sending correspondence to opposing counsel re Defendant's production.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
5/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with opposing counsel re their failure to produce targeted discovery ahead of mediation.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
5/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence and agreement re what discovery Defendant agreed to produce in advance of mediation.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
5/20/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD re data production.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
5/20/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Revise PAD correspondence with opposing counsel re mediation data.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
5/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with SJA re status of Defendant's production of targeted mediation discovery.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
5/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with SJA re agreement for Defendant to produce targeted discovery in advance of mediation.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
5/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re case staffing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/21/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re case staffing.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
5/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with SJA re following-up with opposing counsel re data and document production.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
5/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re data request.	0.1	\$ 600.00	s	60.00
5/24/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD re mediation data.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
5/28/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar production deadline.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
6/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review mediation document production.	0.5	\$ 600.00		300.00
6/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Attempt to review Defendant's mediation production.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
6/3/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Extract and save Defendant production to case file.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
6/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re status of the case.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
6/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, SJA re data.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
6/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
6/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re data records.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
6/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re update to Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
6/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re damages calculations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
6/3/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re Defendant production, damage calculations.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
6/3/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review correspondence re file transfer.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
6/3/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re Defendant production.		\$ 270.00		27.00
6/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with team re Defendant's production.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
6/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with team re Defendant's production for mediation.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
6/3/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re document production.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 27 of 124

6/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review prior mediation statement, correspondence re mediation and stay of proceedings, review caselaw and check for recent developments in advance of mediation.	0.7	\$ 600.00	\$ 420.00
6/4/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re mediation preparation, damages calculations.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
6/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re mediation preparation, damages calculations.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
6/4/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence and draft agenda for co- counsel conference and proposed task list to prepare for mediation.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
6/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re telephone conference with team.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re conference to discuss mediation preparation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re scheduling conference.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/5/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel, L. Ho re pre- mediation conference	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/5/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re term sheet.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/5/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re updates to term sheet, mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/5/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re preparing for mediation.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/6/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re preparing for mediation.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
6/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft and revise mediation statement.	3.0	\$ 375.00	\$ 1,125.00
6/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review documents produced by Defendants re employment policies.	1.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 562.50
6/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA, co-counsel P. Miereles, and L. Ho re drafting the mediation statement and calculating damages estimates.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 187.50
6/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD, co-counsel P. Meireles, and L. Ho re drafting the mediation statement and calculating damages estimates.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$ 300.00
6/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re drafting the mediation statement, the FLSA salary basis test.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
6/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD and Plaintiff R. Seltz re upcoming mediation.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
6/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA and Plaintiff R. Seltz re upcoming mediation.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
6/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re drafting the mediation statement, the FLSA salary basis test.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
6/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review notes and mediation statement to prepare for conference with co-counsel re mediation preparations.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
6/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft notes re conference with co-counsel re mediation preparations.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
6/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with client.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re conference with client.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
6/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel P. Meireles re mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Left a voicemail with Plaintiff R. Seltz re mediation preparations.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
6/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re scheduling a conference re mediation preparation.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
6/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review 6th Circuit case re pay commissions and salary basis test.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re pay commissions and salary basis test.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review prior research re salary basis test.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
6/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant's policy documents.	0.4	\$ 600.00	 240.00
6/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendants' document production, CA complaint in preparation for mediation.	0.9	\$ 600.00	\$ 540.00
6/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re Defendants' document production, CA complaint.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
6/11/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Search case file for co-counsel's client documents.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
6/11/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with DAA re recoverable draws.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
6/11/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re co-counsel's client documents.	0.1	\$ 270.00	27.00
			L			

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 28 of 124

6/11/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save SJA's correspondence re client documents to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
6/11/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Research salary basis test and correspondence with DAA re same.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$ 250.00
6/12/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft term sheet for mediation.	1.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 450.00
6/12/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and revise mediation statement based on DAA's feedback.	0.9	\$ 375.00	\$ 337.50
6/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise mediation statement.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$ 360.00
6/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, PAD re demand at last mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further correspondence with SJA, PAD re demand at last mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise mediation statement.	0.6	\$ 600.00	360.00
6/13/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with DAA, SJA, JMS re mediation statement.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
6/13/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Revise mediation statement.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
6/13/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re prior mediation and settlement demands.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
6/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re prior mediation and settlement demands.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further correspondence with SJA, PAD re	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	mediation statement. Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles, L. Ho	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/13/2019	Sally J.	SJA	re mediation statement. Conference with DAA re mediation	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
	Abrahamson					
6/13/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit mediation statement.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
6/16/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review damages emails and draft mediation statement in preparation for mediation.	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$ 198.00
6/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with co-counsel P. Meireles re damages calculations, tolling.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
6/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD and co-counsel re edits to the mediation statement, calculating damages.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
6/17/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Revise draft mediation statement.	0.3	\$ 990.00	\$ 297.00
6/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA and co-counsel re edits to the mediation statement, calculating damages.		\$ 375.00	112.50
6/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Prepare for conference with team re revisions to the mediation statement, calculating damages.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
6/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review recently filed complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re pre-mediation telephone conference with L. Ho.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz re premediation team telephone conference.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/17/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD, SJA, and DAA re preparing materials for mediation.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
6/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz, JMS, PAD re pre-mediation conference.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/17/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save docket of related case for SJA.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
6/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, PAD re recently filed complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
6/17/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/17/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with PAD re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/17/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re mediation	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	preparation. Correspondence with LXM re preparing for	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
6/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	mediation. Conference with JMS, PAD, and co-counsel re past mediation discussions and preparing for upcoming mediation.	0.9	\$ 600.00	\$ 540.00
6/18/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA, PAD, and co-counsel re past mediation discussions and preparing for upcoming mediation.	0.9	\$ 990.00	\$ 891.00
6/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with JMS, DAA, and co-counsel re past mediation discussions and preparing for upcoming mediation.	0.9	\$ 375.00	\$ 337.50
6/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review damages calculations.	0.7	\$ 600.00	\$ 420.00
6/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review and revise mediation statement.	0.7	\$ 600.00	\$ 420.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 29 of 124

Pemola A. Disney PAD Page PAD	6/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review damages calculations and draft of mediation statement.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 187.50
Parrella A. Disney PAD Proposer for conference with team by reviewing correspondence, notes, and task lists are mediation. S 375.00 \$ 112.50	6/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	· ·	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
SJA, and update task list accordingly Centers A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with IAS and review prior correspondence re Private Attorneys General Act darranges. Centers A. Aaron DAA Review form shoot. Centers A. Aaron DAA Centerspondence with Marchanges Calculations. Centers A. Aaron DAA Centerspondence with PAD re co-current centers. Centers A. Aaron DAA Centerspondence with PAD re mediation statement. Centers A. Centerspondence with PAD re mediation statement. Centerspondence with Centerspondence with PAD re mediation statement. Centerspondence with Centerspo	6/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Prepare for conference with team by reviewing	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
Correspondence verb inhebet Colore	6/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD		0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
St182019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review term sheet. Q.2 \$ 600,00 \$ 120,00 \$ 1802019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-coursed P., Meirodes re Q.1 \$ 600,00 \$ 600,00 \$ 1802019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with EAD re co-coursed P. Meirodes re Q.1 \$ 600,00 \$ 600,00 \$ 1802019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with EAD re decoursed P. Meirodes re Q.1 \$ 600,00	6/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	correspondence re Private Attorneys General Act	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
Strig2019 Deiridre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with Co-counsel P. Meireles re 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00	6/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
Strist2019	6/18/2019			Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re			60.00
Sife Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD re mediation statement. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.	6/18/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re co-counsel contract.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
Delidra A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re Delidra A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re Delidra A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re Private Attorneys General Act damages Delidra A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with the man re damage Delidra A. Delidra A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with the man re damage Delidra A. Delid	6/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re term sheet.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
Selection Correspondence with co-coursel P, Mereles re 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00	6/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
Private Attorneys General Act damages.	6/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	,	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
Service Correspondence with team re damage calculations Service Correspondence with team re damage calculations Service Calculation	6/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re Private Attorneys General Act damages.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
Calculations and mediation preparation.	6/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron					60.00
	6/18/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS		0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
Calculations. Calculations. Calculations. Section Sectio	6/18/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re damage calculations.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
Pamela A. Disney PAD Revise term sheet and mediation statement. 1.2 \$ 375.00 \$ 450.00	6/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD		0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
Side Delidre A. Aaron DAA Review and revise mediation statement. 0.3 S. 600.00 S. 180.00 Side Si	6/18/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	· ·	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
26/19/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Revise term sheet. 0.2 \$ 600.00 \$ 120.00 \$ 120.00 \$ 179/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with JMS re damages calculations. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00	6/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Revise term sheet and mediation statement.	1.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 450.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with JMS re damages calculations. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00 \$	6/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise mediation statement,	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
Sally J. Abrahamson	6/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise term sheet.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
Abrahamson	6/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re damages calculations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
and term sheet.	6/19/2019		SJA	Correspondence with LXM re second filed case.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
Pamela A. Disney PAD Draft correspondence with team re term sheet and mediation statement. Sar5.00	6/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
mediation statement.	6/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Format mediation brief.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
Pamela A. Disney Pamela A. Disney PAD Review co-counsel's revisions to the mediation Sar5.00 S	6/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with team re term sheet and	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
Pamela A. Disney PAD Draft correspondence with DAA re co-counsel's revisions to the mediation statement. S 375.00 \$ 37.50 \$ 37	6/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD		0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
Review notes re outstanding tasks and update task 0.1 \$ 375.00 \$ 37.50	6/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD		0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
Side		·		revisions to the mediation statement.			
and mediation brief.		•		list.			
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel, JMS, PAD re damages calculations. Signal of the property of the p				and mediation brief.			
damages calculations.							99.00
Abrahamson Lynsey Major Pamela A. Disney Pamela A. Disn	6/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	·	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
letter for mediator Rotman.	6/19/2019	-	SJA	Conference with team re mediation preparation.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$ 312.50
Co-counsel edits. Co-c	6/20/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM		1.9	\$ 270.00	\$ 513.00
6/20/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Prepare exhibits for mediation brief. 0.6 \$ 270.00 \$ 162.00 6/20/2019 Pamela A. Disney PAD Review updated damages calculations. 0.4 \$ 375.00 \$ 150.00 6/20/2019 Pamela A. Disney PAD Revise proposed term sheet. 0.4 \$ 375.00 \$ 150.00 6/20/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Revise and update mediation exhibits. 0.3 \$ 270.00 \$ 81.00 6/20/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Conference with co-counsel P. Meireles re mediations. 0.3 \$ 600.00 \$ 180.00 6/20/2019 Pamela A. Disney PAD Correspondence with team re revisions to the mediation statement and terms sheet. 0.3 \$ 375.00 \$ 112.50 6/20/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Revise and finalize term sheet and mediation statement with exhibits. 0.3 \$ 270.00 \$ 81.00	6/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and revise draft mediation statement with	1.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 450.00
6/20/2019Pamela A. DisneyPADReview updated damages calculations.0.4\$ 375.00\$ 150.006/20/2019Pamela A. DisneyPADRevise proposed term sheet.0.4\$ 375.00\$ 150.006/20/2019Lynsey MajorLXMRevise and update mediation exhibits.0.3\$ 270.00\$ 81.006/20/2019Deirdre A. AaronDAAConference with co-counsel P. Meireles re mediation statement, damages calculations.0.3\$ 600.00\$ 180.006/20/2019Pamela A. DisneyPADCorrespondence with team re revisions to the mediation statement and terms sheet.0.3\$ 375.00\$ 112.506/20/2019Lynsey MajorLXMRevise and finalize term sheet and mediation statement with exhibits.0.3\$ 270.00\$ 81.00	6/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review exhibits and finalized mediation statement.	0.7	\$ 375.00	\$ 262.50
6/20/2019Pamela A. DisneyPADRevise proposed term sheet.0.4\$ 375.00\$ 150.006/20/2019Lynsey MajorLXMRevise and update mediation exhibits.0.3\$ 270.00\$ 81.006/20/2019Deirdre A. AaronDAAConference with co-counsel P. Meireles re mediation statement, damages calculations.0.3\$ 600.00\$ 180.006/20/2019Pamela A. DisneyPADCorrespondence with team re revisions to the mediation statement and terms sheet.0.3\$ 375.00\$ 112.506/20/2019Lynsey MajorLXMRevise and finalize term sheet and mediation statement with exhibits.0.3\$ 270.00\$ 81.00	6/20/2019		_				162.00
Eynsey Major LXM Revise and update mediation exhibits. 0.3 \$ 270.00 \$ 81.00	6/20/2019						150.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Conference with co-counsel P. Meireles re mediation statement, damages calculations. Pamela A. Disney PAD Correspondence with team re revisions to the mediation statement and terms sheet. Correspondence with team re revisions to the mediation statement and terms sheet. Correspondence with team re revisions to the mediation statement and terms sheet. Correspondence with team re revisions to the mediation statement and terms sheet. Correspondence with team re revisions to the mediation statement and terms sheet.	6/20/2019						150.00
mediation statement, damages calculations. Pamela A. Disney PAD Correspondence with team re revisions to the mediation statement and terms sheet. Correspondence with team re revisions to the mediation statement and terms sheet. Correspondence with team re revisions to the mediation statement and terms sheet. Correspondence with team re revisions to the mediation statement and terms sheet.				· ·			81.00
mediation statement and terms sheet. Mediation statement and terms sheet.				mediation statement, damages calculations.			
statement with exhibits.	6/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD		0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
	6/20/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM		0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
	6/20/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review damages calculations.	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$ 198.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 30 of 124

6/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re mediation statement,	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
6/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	damages calculations. Correspondence with PAD re timeline of prior	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
6/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	mediation and litigation. Conference with PAD re mediation statement.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
6/20/2019	Delitite A. Aaron	DAA	damages calculations.	0.2	T D	000.00	Ф	120.00
6/20/2019	Deirdre A, Aaron	DAA	Review workweek data,	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
6/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with LXM re sending mediation statement.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
0/00/0040	Luna a su Mada n	LXM		0.0		070.00	Φ.	F4.00
6/20/2019	Lynsey Major		Send mediation statement to mediator.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
6/20/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save co-counsel's redlines to mediation brief to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/20/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re damage calculations in preparation for mediation.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/20/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re exhibits for mediation brief.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with LXM re outstanding mediation exhibits.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
6/20/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conference with PAD re outstanding mediation exhibits.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Update term sheet.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel, L. Ho re term	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
0/00/00/10	D	 	sheet.	0.4		000	_	00.55
6/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re workweek data, term sheet, revisions to damages portion of mediation statement.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re damages calculations.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further revise term sheet	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, LXM re mediation statement.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re sharing mediation statement with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/20/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re mediation preparation.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/21/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review documents to prepare for mediation.	0.3	\$	375.00	\$	112.50
6/21/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review Defendant's mediation brief.	0.2	\$	990.00	\$	198.00
6/21/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review final mediation brief.	0.2	\$	990.00	\$	198.00
6/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re mediation statement, term sheet.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/21/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with DAA and JMS re mediation preparation.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
6/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re pre-mediation telephone conference.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/21/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review draft mediation term sheet.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review documents and correspondence in case, and draft timeline of events for mediation preparation.	2.6	\$	375.00	_	975.00
6/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with team and co-counsel re damages calculations, preparation for mediation.	0.8	\$	600.00	\$	480.00
6/24/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with team and co-counsel re damages calculations, preparation for mediation.	0.8	\$	990.00	\$	792.00
6/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review damages calculations in preparation for pre- mediation conference with co-counsel.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
6/24/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save updated dockets to mediation file.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
6/24/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review data in preparation for pre-mediation call.	0.2	\$	990.00	\$	198.00
6/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendants' mediation statement.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
6/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re scheduling pre- mediation telephone conference.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS, PAD re Defendants' mediation statement.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/24/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re stipulation to stay action and toll statute of limitations.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review negotiation and litigation timeline in preparation for mediation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re docket.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re prior settlement.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re Defendants' mediation statement.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 31 of 124

6/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re dates of meet and confer, case management conference, and initial disclosures.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
6/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Stein case.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
6/25/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re client facts.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re client facts.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60,00
6/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update timeline of events.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re timeline of events.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS, PAD re Stein case.	0.1	\$		_	60.00
6/25/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review Stein case.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/25/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with PAD, DAA re Stein case.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/25/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with LXM re mediation preparation.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
6/25/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re mediation.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/26/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Travel to mediation.	8.5	\$	990.00	\$	8,415.00
6/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Travel to San Francisco for mediation.	5.4	\$	600.00	\$	3,240.00
6/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendants' document production.	0.6	\$	600.00	\$	360.00
6/26/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Prepare for mediation.	0.6	\$	990.00	\$	594.00
6/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review client intake notes.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
6/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Draft notes re Defendants' document production.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
6/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA DAA	Correspondence with client re intake notes.	0.1	\$ \$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron		Correspondence with client re Defendant's defenses.	0.1		600.00		60.00
6/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review prior version of Cushman website for client biography.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with client re preparation for mediation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/26/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save revised damage calculations to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with mediator's office re mediation logistics	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re conference start time.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/26/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re negotiation status.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/26/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence from team re mediation.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with team and opposing counsel re mediation conference.	5.5	\$	600.00		3,300.00
6/27/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with team and opposing counsel re mediation conference.	5.5	\$	990.00	\$	5,445.00
6/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re mediation preparation.	0.6	\$	600.00	\$	360.00
6/27/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re mediation preparation.	0.6	\$	990.00	\$	594.00
6/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS, PAM re prior	0.0	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
			negotiations, senior appraisers.					
6/27/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise calendar re mediation start time.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
6/28/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Travel from mediation.	9.9	\$			9,801.00
6/28/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Return travel from mediation.	3.9	\$	600.00	\$	2,340.00
6/28/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with client re outcome of mediation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/28/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re status report and negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
7/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Draft joint status report.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
7/1/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare attorney registration form for DAA	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
7/1/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Format and finalize joint status report.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
7/1/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research local rules re admission and electronic filing.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
7/1/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re joint status report.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re continuing stay, status report.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with client re case status.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review draft status report in Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re draft Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al. status report.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/1/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re draft status report.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
7/1/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re discovery strategy.	0.1	\$	990.00		99.00
7/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re joint status report.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
7/1/2019	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re discovery strategy.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/1/2019	Abrahamson Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re initial discovery	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
		1	requests.	ĺ			l	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 32 of 124

7/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re Pro Hac Vice admission.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/1/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with attorney admissions re electronic case filing credentials for DAA.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/1/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re Pro Hac Vice admission.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise joint status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re joint status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
7/1/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re electronic case filing credentials and filing joint status report.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho, LXM re joint status report	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	File joint status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/1/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Draft notes re prior document requests.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
7/1/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review draft status reports.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
7/1/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA and DAA re division of work.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
7/1/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
7/2/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save joint status report and stipulation lifting stay to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/2/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save DAA's electronic case filing credentials to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/2/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save order lifting stay and modifying schedule to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/2/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar Plaintiff's deadline to amend pleadings.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/2/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review deadlines against Judge Howell's order.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
7/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review prior scheduling orders.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
7/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re prior scheduling orders.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
7/2/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar internal deadlines re serving final discovery requests and extending time to file class certification.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/2/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re filing deadlines.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review prior scheduling order.	0.2	\$ 600.00		120.00
7/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS, SJA re revised proposed scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
7/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further correspondence with L. Ho re scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
7/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with team and co-counsel re damages calculations, preparation for mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re proposed scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/3/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re revised scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
7/3/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re scheduling issues.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
7/5/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re settlement status and next steps.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
7/8/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with team re mediation.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
7/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re case check-in.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
7/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re mediation, discovery, next steps.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
7/9/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re mediation, discovery, next steps.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
7/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA, PAD re judge assigned, initial conference, electronically stored information discussions with opposing counsel.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
7/9/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with PAD, DAA re judge assigned, initial conference, electronically stored information discussions with opposing counsel.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
7/9/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with SJA, DAA re judge assigned, initial conference, electronically stored information discussions with opposing counsel.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
7/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re compensation structure, applicable regulations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/9/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA and PAD re litigation strategy.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
7/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re conference with client.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re client intake notes.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
					 	-	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 33 of 124

7/10/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re discussing the status of the	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
7/11/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	case. Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz re status of	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
7/11/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	mediation and litigation. Correspondence with DAA re conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
7/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re call with opposing counsel, revised scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
7/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re revised scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
7/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho, opposing counsel re scheduling call re scheduling order, next steps.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
7/12/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft proposed scheduling order.	1.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 412.50
7/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise proposed amended scheduling order.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
7/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re amended scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
7/12/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with DAA re proposed scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
7/15/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
7/16/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence re discovery, deadlines and scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
7/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re co-counsel revisions to scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
7/16/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with DAA re proposed scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
7/16/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Court's previous scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
7/16/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with the team re Court's previous scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
7/16/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with SJA and DAA re proposing bifurcated discovery.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
7/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review prior scheduling order, co-counsel proposals re revised scheduling order, local rules re scheduling orders.	0.7	\$ 600.00	\$ 420.00
7/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with co-counsel, DAA re proposed scheduling order.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
7/17/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, co-counsel re proposed amendments to scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
7/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re internal conference, conference with opposing counsel re scheduling order, next steps.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
7/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re revisions to scheduling order, coordinating conference with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
7/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re meet and confer re prior scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
7/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with co-counsel re proposed amended scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
7/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with opposing counsel re setting up a conference to discuss scheduling.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
7/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with team re strategy for meet and confer and settlement.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$ 360.00
7/18/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with team re strategy for meet and confer and settlement.	0.6	\$ 990.00	\$ 594.00
7/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with team re strategy for meet and confer and settlement.	0.6	\$ 375.00	\$ 225.00
7/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with team, opposing counsel re scheduling order, 216(b) timing.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$ 300.00
7/18/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with team, opposing counsel re scheduling order, 216(b) timing.	0.5	\$ 990.00	\$ 495.00
7/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with team and opposing counsel re scheduling order, 216(b) timing.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 187.50
7/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review current and past scheduling orders to prepare for conference with opposing counsel.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
7/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Update scheduling order and circulate to team.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
7/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re scheduling order and sequence of motion practice.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
7/18/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re scheduling order and sequence of motion practice	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$ 198.00
				1		

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 34 of 124

7/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Defendant's edits to the proposed scheduling order.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
7/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re proposed scheduling order.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
7/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re proposed scheduling order.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
7/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft notes from conference with team, opposing counsel re scheduling order.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
7/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Update scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re updated scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re further settlement discussions, 216(b) timing.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re stipulation for scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with team re proposed scheduling order changes.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
7/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft stipulation re the amended scheduling order.	1.9	\$	375.00	\$	712.50
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re stipulation, 216(b) timing.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
7/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA, L. Ho, and B. Holtzman re discovery coordination.	0.3	\$	375.00	\$	112.50
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re drafting a stipulation discussing the proposed scheduling order.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
7/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re drafting a stipulation discussing the proposed scheduling order.	0.3	\$	375.00	\$	112.50
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with L. Ho, B. Holtzman, and PAD re	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
7/40/2040	Deindre A Asses	D 4 4	discovery coordination.	0.0		000.00	•	400.00
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re scheduling order, stipulation, initial disclosures, electronically stored information protocol and coordinating discovery.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
7/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence and scheduling orders in preparation for conference with co-counsel and DAA.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re scheduling order, 216(b) timing.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant revisions to scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with attorney team re scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further correspondence with PAD re stipulation for scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with DXS re model electronically stored information order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re case website.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re electronically stored information protocol, scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review case website.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re case website.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise stipulation re amended scheduling order.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
7/21/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence from DAA re revisions to the stipulation re scheduling order.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
7/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re revised stipulation re amended scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendants' revisions to stipulation re scheduling order.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
7/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Finalize stipulation and file stipulation re scheduling order.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
7/22/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review stipulation and proposed scheduling order.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
7/22/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with LXM re filing the stipulation and proposed order.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
7/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise stipulation re amended scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re amended scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
7/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re stipulation re amended scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	stipulation re scheduling order. Correspondence with co-counsel re Defendants' revisions to stipulation re scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Finalize scheduling order.	0.1	\$	600.00	¢	60.00
112212019	Deliule A. Aaron	IDAA	p manze scheduling order.	JU. 1	Φ	000.00	Φ	00.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 35 of 124

600.00 600.00 270.00 270.00 270.00 600.00 375.00	\$ \$ \$	60.00 60.00 60.00 27.00 27.00 27.00
600.00 270.00 270.00 270.00 600.00	\$ \$	60.00 27.00 27.00 27.00
270.00 270.00 270.00 600.00 375.00	\$ \$	27.00 27.00 27.00
270.00 270.00 600.00 375.00	\$	27.00 27.00
270.00 270.00 600.00 375.00	\$	27.00 27.00
270.00 600.00 375.00	\$	27.00
375.00	\$	
		60.00
	\$	37.50
600.00	\$	780.00
270.00	\$	135.00
270.00	\$	54.00
600.00	\$	120.00
600.00	\$	60.00
270.00	\$	27.00
270.00	\$	27.00
270.00	\$	27.00
270.00	\$	27.00
		27.00
625.00	\$	62.50
600.00	\$	60.00
600.00	s	60.00
		60.00
270.00	\$	27.00
		27.00
		27.00
270.00	\$	27.00
600.00	\$	60.00
600.00	\$	60.00
600.00	\$	60.00
600.00	\$	60.00
990.00	\$	99.00
		37.50
375.00		37.50
	\$	37.50
375.00		37.50
375.00 375.00	\$	
		575.00
375.00	\$	
375.00 250.00	\$	575.00
	270.00 600.00 270.00 270.00 270.00 270.00 625.00 600.00 270.00 270.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00	270.00 \$ 600.00 \$ 270.00 \$ 270.00 \$ 270.00 \$ 270.00 \$ 270.00 \$ 270.00 \$ 600.00 \$ 600.00 \$ 270.00 \$ 270.00 \$ 600.00 \$ 600.00 \$ 600.00 \$ 600.00 \$ 375.00 \$

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 36 of 124

7/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DC Law Clerk re research re class actions in DC and status of the litigation.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$	150.00
7/24/2019	DC Law Clerk	DCLC	Conference with PAD re research re class actions in DC and status of the litigation.	0.4	\$ 250.00	\$	100.00
7/24/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar amended deadlines from scheduling order.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
7/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Status conference with Court,	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
7/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD, co-counsel re coordinating	0.3	\$ 600.00		180.00
			discovery.				
7/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with opposing counsel, co- counsel re coordination of discovery and scheduling with Dixon case.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
7/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Status conference with the Court.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
7/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA, co-counsel re coordinating discovery.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
7/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with opposing counsel, co- counsel re coordination of discovery and scheduling with Dixon case.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
7/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review co-counsel revisions to electronically stored information and discovery order.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
7/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft notes from status conference hearing and circulate to DAA.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
7/24/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re listserv for Plaintiffs.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/24/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Set up listserv for Plaintiff correspondence.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
7/24/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save scheduling order to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
7/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re electronically stored information and discovery stipulation, timing of 216(b).	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re case website.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, LXM re case email.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re co-counsel revisions to electronically stored information and discovery order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/24/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Research DC wage and hour issue.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
7/24/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re DC wage and hour issue.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
7/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with DAA and law clerks re researching numerosity requirement in DC.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
7/25/2019	DC Law Clerk	DCLC	[MMX] Conduct research re class numerosity requirement.	5.9	\$ 250.00	\$	1,475.00
7/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise draft electronically stored information and discovery coordination protocol.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
7/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review new deadlines.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re new deadlines.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review District Court of DC's rules re attorney admissions.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
7/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re District Court of DC's rules re attorney admissions.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save PAD's electronic case filing credentials to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re tolling, proposed electronically stored information and cooperation agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re follow-up conference with opposing counsel re discovery.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, LXM re case, request for admissions and expert disclosure deadlines.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise PAD's notice of appearance.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	File PAD's notice of appearance.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
7/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save docketed notice of appearance to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
7/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re meet and confer deadlines.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
7/25/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with LXM re notice of appearance filing.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
7/25/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence re discovery plan and strategy for case coordination.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
7/26/2019	DC Law Clerk	DCLC	[MMX] Draft memo for PAD re class numerosity requirement.	5.1	\$ 250.00	\$	1,275.00
7/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re case website.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/29/2019	DC Law Clerk	DCLC	[MMX] Revise memo for PAD re class numerosity requirement.	2.2	\$ 250.00		550.00
		•		•		•	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 37 of 124

7/29/2019	DC Law Clerk	DCLC	[MMX] Revise memo re class numerosity requirement.	1.4	\$ 250.00	\$	350.00
7/29/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re case website.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/29/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re case check in, additional potential witnesses.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/30/2019	DC Law Clerk	DCLC	[MMX] Finalize memo re class numerosity requirement and circulate to PAD.	1.1	\$ 250.00	\$	275.00
7/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Dixon joint statement.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
7/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re joint status report re Dixon case.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re Dixon join statement, 216b coordination.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re scope of 216(b) motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with opposing counsel, L. Ho, PAD re electronically stored information and discovery coordination, 216(b) timing and tolling initial discovery requests, Dixon schedule.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
7/31/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with opposing counsel, L. Ho, DAA re electronically stored information and discovery coordination, 216(b)b timing and tolling initial discovery requests, Dixon schedule.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$	150.00
7/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re discovery response, preparing for the 216(b) motion.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
7/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review initial discovery requests, compare with Dixon complaint for possible revisions.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
7/31/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re discovery response, preparing for the 216(b) motion.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
7/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re 216(b) motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/31/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re case management conference and scope of case.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
7/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Draft agenda for conference with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re draft agenda for conference with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re agenda for call.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re 216(b) briefing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re initial discovery requests, 216b timing	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
7/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re follow-up with mediator D. Rotman re mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/1/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conduct research re potential class members re 216(b) certification.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$	150.00
8/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise initial discovery requests.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
8/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from L. Ho re mediator update.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendants' edits to Dixon 26(f).	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re Defendant's edits to Dixon 26(f).	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/1/2019 8/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron Justin Swartz	DAA JMS	Correspondence with PAD re potential witnesses. Review correspondence from team re status of negotiations.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/1/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re strategy for 16b timing.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revision of initial discovery requests.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
8/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise first set of interrogatories.	0.2	\$		120.00
8/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re initial discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
8/7/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise and format discovery requests.	1.0	\$ 270.00	\$	270.00
8/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise amended discovery requests.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
8/7/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re serving discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 270.00	,	27.00
8/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re amended discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re amended discovery requests.	0.1	\$	\$	60.00
8/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re amended discovery requests and service of requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re scope of 216(b).	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
8/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re co-counsel edits to discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 38 of 124

8/8/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re negotiations and damages.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/9/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and finalize Plaintiff's first set of interrogatories and requests for production.	0.9	\$ 375.00	\$	337.50
8/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re finalizing and serving amended discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/9/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with opposing counsel re discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
8/11/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re discovery status.	0.1	\$ 990.00		99.00
8/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Draft tolling agreement.	0.6	\$ 600.00		360.00
8/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re deadline to respond to discovery requests.		\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re case investigation and class member communications.		\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re status of conversations with mediator D. Rotman.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
8/12/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar Defendant's deadline to respond to discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise tolling agreement.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
8/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re draft 216(b) tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re revised tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re draft tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re initial disclosures in Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/14/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Dixon intitial disclosures and compare with Seltz initial disclosures to ensure consistency.	0.6	\$ 375.00	\$	225.00
8/14/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re Dixon initial disclosures.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/16/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re scheduling conference re discovery.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
8/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re electronically stored information protocol, tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Defendants' discovery requests and documents produced by client.	0.8	\$ 375.00	\$	300.00
8/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review newly filed District of Colorado complaint.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
8/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with DAA re discovery requests.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
8/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review discovery requests to prepare for telephone conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
8/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with team re scheduling conference re Bursey v. Cushman.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
8/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re District of Colorado complaint.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
8/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re Defendants' edits to electronically stored information protocol and cooperation agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA and DAA re complaint from related case.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/19/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review newly filed case.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/19/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re newly filed case.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendent's discovery requests to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar response deadline.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
8/19/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re newly filed CO case.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conduct research re complaint from related Colorado case.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with team re 216(b), settlement negotiations, and Bursey v. Cushman.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
8/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with team re 216(b), settlement negotiations, and Bursey v. Cushman.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
8/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review electronically stored information protocol and Defendant's edits.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
8/20/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with team re CO case,	0.5	\$ 990.00	\$	495.00
		1	216(b) and settlement strategy.	Ļ		<u> </u>	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 39 of 124

8/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re 216(b) declarations, briefing, timeline for same, and electronically stored information agreement.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
8/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re 216(b) declarations, briefing, timeline for same, and electronically stored information agreement.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
8/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Bursey v. Cushman complaint to prepare for conference with co-counsel.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
8/20/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re CO case and negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re 216(b) class member communications.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with OM re staffing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/20/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Register DAA and SJA for docket alerts in related case.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with DXS re electronically stored information protocol.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
8/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re case background, 216(b) motion.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
8/21/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with MJF re case background, 216(b) motion.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
8/21/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Revise electronically stored information protocol per DXS edits.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
8/21/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review co-counsel's edits to electronically stored information protocol.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
8/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from L. Ho re conference with opposing counsel re 216(b).	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re electronically stored information agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re case orientation meeting.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re revisions to	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/21/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	electronically stored information agreement. Correspondence with DXS re revisions to	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
8/21/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	electronically stored information protocol. Draft correspondence with DAA re co-counsel's	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
0/04/0040	In the Constant	IMC	edits to protocol.	0.4	 000.00	Φ.	00.00
8/21/2019 8/22/2019	Justin Swartz Deirdre A. Aaron	JMS DAA	Correspondence with CO firm re new filing. Review prior 216(b) filings in appraiser cases in preparation for 216(b) briefing.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00 360.00
8/22/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Defendant and co-counsel's edits to the electronically stored information protocol.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
8/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re electronically stored information agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/22/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with L. Ho, DAA, opposing counsel re revisions to electronically stored information protocol.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
8/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re preparation for 216(b) briefing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/22/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re 216(b).	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re 216(b).	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/23/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with DAA, LXM re organizing documents from Dixon v. Cushman.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
8/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re Dixon initial disclosures.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Dixon initial disclosures.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from JMS re correspondence with CO attorneys.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/23/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save initial disclosures and complaint from related case.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/23/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re initial disclosures, complaint from related case.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/26/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save related case [Dixon] court documents to case file.	0.7	\$ 270.00	\$	189.00
8/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review potential witness profiles.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
8/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re class member communications.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with DAA re status of Defendant's discovery responses.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
8/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft responses and objections to Defendant's requests for production.	2.0	\$ 375.00	\$	750.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 40 of 124

0.107.100.10		Ti va a	<u> </u>	1.0	Ι.α.	070.00	I	054.00
8/27/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare template of responses and objections to Defendant's first discovery requests.	1.3	\$	270.00	\$	351.00
8/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Defendant's requests for production; and review local rules and scheduling order re the same.	0.9	\$	375.00	\$	337.50
8/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conduct research re potential declarants for 216(b) motion.	0.8	\$	375.00	\$	300.00
8/27/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save related case [Dixon] court documents to case file.	0.5	\$	270.00	\$	135.00
8/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re discovery requests.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re draft discovery	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
			responses, 216 (b) declaration.					
8/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re requests for production responses, collecting client documents.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with DAA re Defendants' requests for production.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
8/28/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Revise discovery responses to Defendant's requests for production.	3.8	\$	375.00	\$	1,425.00
8/28/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Prepare declaration for 216(b) motion.	1.1	\$	375.00	\$	412.50
8/28/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with DAA re electronically stored	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
			information protocol edits.					
8/29/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review client and Defendant's production and draft 216(b) declaration template.	2.5	\$	375.00	\$	937.50
8/29/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise draft responses to discovery requests and review supporting case law.	1.8	\$	600.00	\$	1,080.00
8/29/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with DAA re Defendant's discovery	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
8/29/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	requests. Correspondence with PAD re electronically stored	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
			information agreement.					
8/29/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re 216(b) declarations.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/29/2019 8/29/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendants' revisions to tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ \$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/29/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re tolling agreement revisions, status of CO case.	0.1	•	600.00	Þ	60.00
8/29/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re 216(b) declarations.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/29/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re 216b declarations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
8/29/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review local rules re discovery requests.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/29/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re responses to discovery requests.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/29/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with DAA re electronically stored information protocol draft.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
8/30/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review and format electronically stored information protocol.	1.4	\$	270.00	\$	378.00
8/30/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft motion for entry of electronically stored	0.5	\$	270.00	\$	135.00
0/20/2040	Lumanu Mainn	LVM	information protocol.	0.2	•	270.00	<u></u>	04.00
8/30/2019 8/30/2019	Lynsey Major Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review local rules re stipulations. Review revisions to the electronically stored	0.3	\$	270.00 375.00	\$	81.00 112.50
0,00,2010	amola 7 t. Biorioy	1,7,0	information protocol and local rules re stipulations.	0.0	*	070.00	*	112.00
8/30/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conference with PAD re filing format of electronically stored information protocol.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
8/30/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review electronically stored information agreement.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
8/30/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with LXM re filing format of	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
8/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	electronically stored information protocol. Correspondence with PAD, DXS re electronically	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	stored information protocol. Correspondence with PAD re format for filing	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
			electronically stored information protocol.					
8/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re draft declaration, class member communications.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with DXS re electronically stored information protocol.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/30/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with LXM re preparing for filing.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
8/30/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with DAA re filing the electronically stored information protocol.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
8/31/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DXS re E-discovery issue.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
9/1/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review mediation statement and documents; correspondence re same.	0.6	\$	350.00	\$	210.00
9/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review declarations in support of 216b (1.1);	1.2	\$	600.00	\$	720.00
			correspondence with PAD re same (.1).	<u> </u>				

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 41 of 124

9/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review discovery request responses and draft questions for Plaintiff R. Seltz to prepare for conference with R. Seltz re the same.	1.1	\$	375.00	\$	412.50
9/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz re responses to discovery requests and 216(b) declaration.	1.0	\$	375.00	\$	375.00
9/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise investigation message; correspondence with PAD re same.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
9/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft notes from conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz re discovery responses and 216(b) declaration.	0.4	\$	375.00	\$	150.00
9/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Edit draft 216(b) declaration.	0.3	\$	375.00	\$	112.50
9/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft questions for Plaintiff R. Seltz to prepare for	0.3	\$	375.00	\$	112.50
9/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	conference re draft 216(b) declaration. Review protocol for investigation letters to	0.3	\$	375.00	\$	112.50
			communicate with potential collective members.					
9/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re discussing discovery requests.		\$	375.00	\$	37.50
9/3/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re settlement strategy.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re status of 216(b) preparation, Colorado case.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review Defendant's edits to tolling agreement.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review JMS correspondence with Colorado	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
0.10.100.10	1 " 2 1	11.10	attorneys.					
9/3/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re Colorado case.	0.1	\$	990.00		99.00
9/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Correspondence with DAA re E-discovery protocol.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
9/4/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review solicitation and advertisement rules for multiple jurisdictions and edit communications to potential collective members to comply with each state's requirements.	1.8	\$	375.00	\$	675.00
9/4/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and edit E-discovery stipulation and joint motion for entering the E-discovery stipulation.	1.6	\$	375.00	\$	600.00
9/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review and revision of draft discovery responses.	0.7	\$	600.00	\$	420.00
9/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review motion for E-discovery stipulation, further revision to E-discovery protocol; correspondence to co-counsel, PAD re same.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
9/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with DXS re co-counsel E-discovery protocol metadata edits.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
9/4/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with DAA and DXS re the E-discovery protocol.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
9/4/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with DAA re the E-discovery stipulation.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
9/4/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re settlement	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
9/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	negotiations. Correspondence with L. Ho re E-discovery protocol	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	negotiations. Correspondence with PAD re edits to E-discovery	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Protocol. Correspondence with JMS, SJA re potentially	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	resuming mediation discussions. Correspondence with DXS re E-discovery protocol.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with DXS re E-discovery	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/5/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	agreement. Review and edit draft joint motion and E-discovery	0.4	\$	375.00	\$	150.00
3/3/2013	amola A. Dishey	l'Ab	stipulation; correspondence with opposing counsel re the same.	0.4		070.00	ľ	100.00
9/5/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	File motion and stipulation re E-discovery with LXM.	0.4	\$	375.00	\$	150.00
9/5/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re discovery, 216b strategy, tolling agreement, status of Bursey v. Cushman case and motion practice strategy.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
9/5/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re discovery, 216b strategy, tolling agreement, status of Bursey v. Cushman case and motion practice strategy.	0.2	\$	990.00	\$	198.00
9/5/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with SYU re communications to potential collective members.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
	l .	1		L	1		<u> </u>	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 42 of 124

discovery to prepare for filing. 9/5/2019	0.2 0.1 0.3 0.2 0.2 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	375.00 270.00 375.00 350.00 270.00 600.00 600.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	75.00 27.00 112.50 70.00 54.00 60.00 99.00 60.00
discovery to prepare for filing.	0.1 0.3 0.2 0.2 0.2 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	270.00 375.00 350.00 270.00 600.00 990.00 600.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	70.00 54.00 60.00
signatures. 9/6/2019 Pamela A. Disney PAD Review past correspondence re service of discovery requests; draft correspondence to DAA re the same. 9/6/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Research and draft 216(b) motion. 9/6/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Update calendar invites with MJF. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Further correspondence with PAD re Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al. discovery requests and check file re same. 9/6/2019 Justin Swartz JMS Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re discovery strategy and negotiation strategy. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with L. Ho re follow up with Brendan re Bursey v. Cushman case, potential mediation. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD re discovery requests in Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al.	0.3 0.2 0.2 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1	\$ \$ \$ \$	375.00 350.00 270.00 600.00 990.00 600.00	\$ \$ \$	70.00 54.00 60.00 99.00
discovery requests; draft correspondence to DAA re the same. 9/6/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Research and draft 216(b) motion. 9/6/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Update calendar invites with MJF. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Further correspondence with PAD re Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al. discovery requests and check file re same. 9/6/2019 Justin Swartz JMS Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re discovery strategy and negotiation strategy. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with L. Ho re follow up with Brendan re Bursey v. Cushman case, potential mediation. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD re discovery requests in Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al.	0.2 0.2 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1	\$ \$ \$ \$	350.00 270.00 600.00 990.00 600.00	\$ \$ \$	70.00 54.00 60.00 99.00
9/6/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Research and draft 216(b) motion. 0 9/6/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Update calendar invites with MJF. 0 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Further correspondence with PAD re Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al. discovery requests and check file re same. 9/6/2019 Justin Swartz JMS Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re discovery strategy and negotiation strategy. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with L. Ho re follow up with Brendan re Bursey v. Cushman case, potential mediation. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD re discovery requests in Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz and P. Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz	0.2 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1	\$ \$ \$ \$	270.00 600.00 990.00 600.00	\$ \$	54.00 60.00 99.00 60.00
9/6/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Update calendar invites with MJF. C 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Further correspondence with PAD re Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al. discovery requests and check file re same. 9/6/2019 Justin Swartz JMS Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re discovery strategy and negotiation strategy. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with L. Ho re follow up with Brendan re Bursey v. Cushman case, potential mediation. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD re discovery requests in Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz and P. Corresp	0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1	\$ \$ \$ \$	270.00 600.00 990.00 600.00	\$ \$	99.00
Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al. discovery requests and check file re same. 9/6/2019 Justin Swartz JMS Conference with co-counsel G. Shavitz re discovery strategy and negotiation strategy. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with L. Ho re follow up with Brendan re Bursey v. Cushman case, potential mediation. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD re discovery requests in Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz and P. Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz and C. Correspondence with co-co	0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1	\$	990.00 600.00	\$	99.00
9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with L. Ho re follow up with Brendan re Bursey v. Cushman case, potential mediation. Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD re discovery requests in Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al. Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz and P. Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz and C. Correspon	0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Brendan re Bursey v. Cushman case, potential mediation. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD re discovery requests in Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz and P. Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz and C. Correspond	0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1	\$	600.00	,	
Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western, Inc. et al. 9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz and P. Correspondence with co-counsel G. Shavitz and C. Shavitz and C	0.1 0.1 0.1	,		\$	60.00
	0.1 0.1	\$	00		l.
i interese la discover y response proposal.	0.1		600.00	\$	60.00
9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review approved E-discovery order.		\$	600.00	\$	60.00
		\$	600.00	\$	60.00
, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel re defense counsel's request for an extension of discovery responses.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/6/2019 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with DAA re Defendant's extension C request.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/6/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with LXM re calendaring deadlines 0	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
9/6/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Conference with MJF re 216b motion, discovery responses.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/6/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conference with DAA re 216b motion, discovery responses.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
9/6/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re 216b motion.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
,	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
collective members.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
communications to potential collective members.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
advertisements to potential collective members.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
9/6/2019 Pamela A. Disney PAD Correspondence with DXR re Arizona compliance letter for sending advertisements to potential collective members.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
9/9/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review L. Ho edits to Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western E-discovery order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/9/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD, MJF re 216b motion. 0	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
9/9/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with LXM re updating discovery deadlines.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/9/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Calendar Defendant's extended deadline to respond to discovery requests.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
scheduling order.	0.1	\$		\$	60.00
responses.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
,	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
amendment deadline.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/9/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with SJA re amending complaint to 0 add Cushman of DC.		\$	600.00	\$	60.00
re declarations.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
9/9/2019 Pamela A. Disney PAD Review and respond to correspondence with DAA re the 216b motion.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 43 of 124

9/9/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with DAA re call with Plaintiff R. Seltz re discovery responses.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
9/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Research re amending complaint - review client documents, check local rules and FRCP 15 and prior motions to amend, check DC secretary of state website, other filed complaints against Cushman, and review Cushman's answer.	1.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 660.00
9/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review and revise draft requests for production responses.	0.9	\$ 600.00	\$ 540.00
9/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review of Defendant's edits to tolling agreement; correspondence with JMS re same; additional revisions to same.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
9/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD, MJF re 216b motion, declaration drafting, discovery responses, potential amendment of complaint.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
9/10/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with PAD, DAA re 216b motion, declaration drafting, discovery responses, potential amendment of complaint.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
9/10/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA, MJF re 216b motion, declaration drafting, discovery responses, potential amendment of complaint.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
9/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re client discovery responses, document production.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
9/10/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re client discovery responses, document production.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
9/10/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
9/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re amending complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re amending complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with DXS re E-discovery production question.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re client discovery responses.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/10/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence with DAA and DXS re document production methods and E-discovery protocol.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
9/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review 216(b) motion from other case for preparation of 216(b) motion.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
9/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with CMM, MCD re objections to tax requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re discovery responses.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MCD re objections to tax record requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re response to requests for production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Finish reviewing and revising discovery responses, research and review prior briefing re production of tax documents and compelling of collective/class list.	1.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 720.00
9/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant's responses to requests for production and data production; correspondence with LXM re same.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
9/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review tolling agreement and correspondence from opposing counsel re same.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
9/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondences with LXM re Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western case updates.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with CAPG re recent motions to compel class/collective lists.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/16/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Download and save Defendant's document production to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/16/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re save Defendant's document production to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/16/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise calendar deadline re Plaintiff's deadline to respond to discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/16/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case memo re DAA's credentials for Defendant's file transfer site.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/16/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re update to case memo re DAA's credentials for Defendant's file transfer site.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re responses to Defendant's requests for production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 44 of 124

9/16/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Set up docket alert in related case; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review instructions for producing E-discovery and client documents, and send to Plaintiff R. Seltz for his responses to the discovery requests.	0.6	\$ 375.00	\$ 225.00
9/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review notes and correspondence.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
9/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re response to Defendant's document requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re collecting and reviewing client documents.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with DAA re document production in response to Defendant's	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
9/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	requests for production of documents. Update task list accordingly re note and	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
9/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	correspondence reviewal. Review notes and correspondence, and update task	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
9/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	list accordingly. Conference with MJF re response Defendant's	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
9/18/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	refusal to produce collective contact information. Conference with DAA re response to Defendant's	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
9/18/2019	Deirdre A, Aaron	DAA	refusal to produce collective contact information Correspondence with LXM re finalizing tolling	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
			agreement.	_		
9/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re production of collective list.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re meet and confer request for response to RFPD 1.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/18/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Format tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/18/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re Defendant's response to RFP No. 1	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
9/23/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Edit requests for document production.	3.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 1,200.00
9/23/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft deficiency letter in response to Defendant's production.	1.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 420.00
9/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review materials re compelling production of collective list; correspondence with MJF re same.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
9/23/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Defendant's answer in Bursey v. Cushman.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
9/23/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review tolling agreement.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
9/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re pulling Colorado complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re discovery dispute.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/23/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save answer in related case to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/23/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Circulate answer in related case to case file to DAA.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re discovery responses.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review final tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re final tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re client document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/23/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save executed tolling agreement to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/23/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re documents for discovery responses.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
9/23/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re document production.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
9/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Edit responses to Defendant's requests for production.	1.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 562.50
9/24/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Collect client documents, and correspondence with PAD and CCA re same.	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$ 135.00
9/24/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Correspondence with LXM re E-discovery protocol.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
9/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with LXM re discovery responses.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
9/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with LXM re status of producing documents and responses to the requests for production.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
9/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re 216b deadline, stipulation re tolling.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/24/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar deadline to file 216b motion.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/24/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar internal deadlines to prep for filing of 216(b) motion.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
	1		1 1	•		

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 45 of 124

9/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re authority re production	0.1	 \$	600.00	\$ 60.00
			of pre certification notice list.				
9/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review client documents.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$ 37.50
9/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Ringtail protocol.	0.1	\$	375.00	37.50
9/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence to team re processing client documents for production in response to discovery requests.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$ 37.50
9/24/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence with CCA re document production in response to discovery requests.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$ 37.50
9/25/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Edit responses and objections to the requests for production.	2.2	\$	375.00	\$ 825.00
9/25/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Ingest client documents to Nuix; correspondence with team re same.	1.4	\$	270.00	\$ 378.00
9/25/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Plaintiff R. Seltz's documents re discovery responses.	1.4	\$	375.00	\$ 525.00
9/25/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft deficiency letter re Defendant's response to first set of request for production of documents.	1.2	\$	350.00	\$ 420.00
9/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review draft discovery dispute law and caselaw re production of collective list.	0.6	\$	600.00	\$ 360.00
9/25/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Correspondence with team re collecting client documents.	0.6	\$	270.00	\$ 162.00
9/25/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Create casebook in Nuix; add team to same; correspondence with same re same.	0.4	\$	270.00	\$ 108.00
9/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with GW re case investigation.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$ 120.00
9/25/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with CAA, DAA re producing documents.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$ 75.00
9/25/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Correspondence with team in preparation for upcoming Plaintiff production.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$ 54.00
9/25/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz re documents production for responses to discovery requests.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$ 37.50
9/25/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with Bursey v. Cushman counsel.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
9/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, DXS re preparing document production.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$ 60.00
9/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re reviewing client's document production.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$ 60.00
9/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondences from CCA, DXS re document production.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$ 60.00
9/25/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with team re loading client's documents onto Ringtail for production to Defendant.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$ 37.50
9/25/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with LXM re collecting client documents.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$ 37.50
9/25/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with LXM re client document duplicates.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$ 37.50
9/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conference with PAD re collecting client documents.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$ 27.00
9/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re instructions on transferring client documents.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$ 27.00
9/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conference with PAD re client document duplicates.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$ 27.00
9/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save client documents to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$ 27.00
9/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with CCA re save client documents to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$ 27.00
9/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re caselaw in support of production of collective list.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$ 60.00
9/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re case investigation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$ 60.00
9/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondences from PAD, DXS re client document production.	0.1	\$	600.00	60.00
9/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re client document production issues.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$ 60.00
9/25/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Correspondence with team re upcoming Plaintiffs' productions.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$ 27.00
9/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re preparing fee approval.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$ 60.00
9/25/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with LH re Bursey v. Cushman strategy.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$ 99.00
9/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Plaintiff R. Seltz's documents and mark for relevance, confidentiality, and redactions.	4.7	\$	375.00	\$ 1,762.50
9/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review of caselaw and revision of discovery dispute letter and correspondence from co-counsel re same.	1.3	\$	600.00	\$ 780.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 46 of 124

9/26/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Ingest client emails to Nuix; correspondence with team re same.	0.9	\$ 270.00	\$ 243.00
9/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review local rules re discovery and method of raising discovery disputes, and correspondence from SJA, LBB, PAD, HCC re same.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
9/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re client document production.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
9/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re client document production.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
9/26/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz and PAD re how to export documents for production.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
9/26/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Correspondence with PAD re training for Nuix.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
9/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz and CCA re how to export documents for production.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
9/26/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Research class list case law.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
9/26/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Conference with PAD re coding documents for upcoming Plaintiff production in Nuix.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
9/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with CCA re coding documents for upcoming Plaintiff production in Nuix.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
9/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft notes re Plaintiffs' production to prepare for call with DAA re confidentiality questions.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
9/26/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with DAA and CCA re document production.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
9/26/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re discovery dispute.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re discovery dispute.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re amending complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re questions about potentially responsive documents.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re amending complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/26/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re deficiency letter	0,1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
9/27/2019	Christopher C. Alter		Prepare plaintiff production in Nuix; correspondence with team re same.		\$ 270.00	\$ 540.00
9/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise discovery deficiency letter and send to team.	0.9	\$ 600.00	\$ 540.00
9/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review client's documents for production.	0.7	\$ 600.00	\$ 420.00
9/27/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Prepare for, attend, and memo re call with B. Sosa Morris re Bursey v. Cushman case.	0.5	\$ 990.00	\$ 495.00
9/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with L. Ho re class and collective list dispute.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
9/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with CCA re client document production.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
9/27/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Conference with DAA re client document production.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
9/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review clients' documents for production re CCA's question re the production.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
9/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re client's document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with CCA re client's document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Check client document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with CCA re client document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
9/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondences with MJF re status of 216b motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re status of 216b.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with CCA re client document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with HCC re research on Judge.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/27/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Show DAA coding privileges on Nuix.	0.1	\$ 270.00	27.00
9/27/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Reset DAA Nuix password.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with DAA re and CCA re discovery production.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
9/27/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with DAA re Plaintiff's production of documents.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
9/30/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review all documents prepared for sending to Defendant in response to the requests for production; draft correspondence to CCA, DAA re the same.	2.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 862.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 47 of 124

9/30/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review and re corresponden 9/30/2019 Christopher C. Alter CCA Prepare Plain team re same	ency letter in response to Defendant's duction	1.0	\$ 270.00	\$	297.00
9/30/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review and re corresponden 9/30/2019 Christopher C. Alter CCA Prepare Plain team re same	evise client document responses; ce from PAD re same. tiff production; correspondence with ency letter in response to Defendant's duction		\$ 600.00	_	
team re same	ency letter in response to Defendant's duction	0.8	000.00	\$	600.00
9/30/2019 Molly I Francian MIF Revise deficie	duction		\$ 270.00	\$	216.00
discovery pro	1	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
9/30/2019 Pamela A. Disney PAD Review enclose for document	sure letter and COS for the requests production.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
	cate of service; transfer document and correspondence with Defendant re same.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
CCA re docur	espond to correspondence with DAA, nent production in response to iscovery requests.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
9/30/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Corresponder	nce with P. Meireles re cases cited.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
9/30/2019 Sally J. SJA Corresponder Abrahamson	nce with DAA re class list issue.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
9/30/2019 Sally J. SJA Corresponder Abrahamson	nce with JMS re potential mediation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
9/30/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Corresponder request respo	nce with PAD re service of document nses.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
9/30/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Corresponder dispute.	nce with co-counsel re class list	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
9/30/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Corresponder letter.	nce with MJF re class list dispute	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
9/30/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correst document pro	spondences from PAD, CCA re client duction.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
	ith PAD re sources and attachments	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
9/30/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Conference w	ith PAD re revisions to discovery d service of same.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
·	y v. Cushman docket updates.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
	memo re FTP template.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
	ant's discovery responses to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
9/30/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Corresponder Cushman cas	nce with JMS re status of Bursey v. e.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
9/30/2019 Christopher C. Alter CCA Corresponder	nce with PAD re Nuix login difficulties.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
9/30/2019 Sara Olson SXO Corresponder	nce with team re Plaintiffs productions.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
9/30/2019 Pamela A. Disney PAD Conference win Plaintiff pro	ith LXM re sources and attachments duction.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
	ith LXM re revisions to discovery d service of same.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
	iff R. Seltz's finalized discovery ket for sending to Defendant.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
	ondence to LXM re Plaintiff R. Seltz's overy response packet for sending to	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
9/30/2019 Justin Swartz JMS Corresponder case.	nce re Judge in Bursey v. Cushman	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
10/1/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Further revision	on of discovery dispute letter and ce with L. Ho re same.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$	360.00
10/1/2019 Pamela A. Disney PAD Search for an	d review sample motions to amend prepare for drafting motion to amend	0.6	\$ 375.00	\$	225.00
	ith PAD, MJF re discovery, 216b g, case management.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
10/1/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conference w	ith DAA, PAD re discovery, 216b g, case management.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
10/1/2019 Pamela A. Disney PAD Conference w	ith DAA, MJF re discovery, 216b g, case management.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$	150.00
10/1/2019 Pamela A. Disney PAD Draft notes ar DAA, MJF re	nd update task list re conference with tasks and next steps for discovery, complaint, and the 216b motion.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 48 of 124

10/1/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Prepare for conference with DAA, MJF re tasks and next steps for discovery, amending the complaint, and the 216b motion.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
10/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Northern District of California rules re discovery conferral requirements.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re ND Cal rules re discovery conferral requirements	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Draft master task list.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re biweekly check in calls, master task list.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF, LXM re master task list.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Finalize deficiency letter.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re finalized deficiency letter.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/1/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re Defendant production.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/1/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant production to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/1/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with CCA re saved defendant production to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/2/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Run Defendant's production import on Nuix.	1.0	\$ 270.00	\$ 270.00
10/2/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re deficiency in Plaintiffs' discovery responses, review discovery responses; draft correspondence to DAA re the same.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
10/2/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare report of Defendant production, and correspondence with DAA re same.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
10/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re prior correspondence with opposing counsel re discovery requests, Ediscovery and discovery stipulation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re Defendant's document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review index of document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re discovery responses.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review prior correspondence with opposing counsel re discovery requests, E-discovery and discovery stipulation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with co- counsel re Plaintiff's responses and objections to the production of documents.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
10/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re initial discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re discovery responses.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondences with PAD, LXM re initial discovery requests.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with LXM re sending discovery responses to co-counsel.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
10/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review rules re amendment of complaint; correspondence with PAD re motion to amend.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
10/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft motion to amend the complaint.	2.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 862.50
10/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re drafting motion to amend the complaint.	0.7	\$ 375.00	\$ 262.50
10/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review complaints and answers in cases against Cushman & Wakefield re identifying the proper party to add to the complaint; and draft correspondence with DAA re the same.	0.6	\$ 375.00	\$ 225.00
10/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re drafting motion to amend the complaint.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
10/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re drafting motion to amend the complaint.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
10/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review sample complaint and prepare for conference with DAA re drafting motion to amend complaint.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
10/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review research re corporate structure of Cushman and Wakefield and its Washington, DC subsidiary for amending the complaint.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
10/7/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with LXM re researching Cushman & Wakefield of Washington, DC re adding the company as a Defendant in the complaint.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 49 of 124

10/8/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Research case law re amending complaints and	5.4	 375.00	\$ 2,025.00
	·		draft motion to amend complaint.			
10/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise complaint into first amended complaint.	1.9	\$ 600.00	1,140.00
10/8/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research Defendant's incorporation for amended complaint.	1.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 324.00
10/8/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review draft of first amended complaint and draft correspondence with DAA re the same.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
10/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re drafting amended complaint.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
10/8/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re drafting amended complaint.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$ 187.50
10/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Proofread and edit amended complaint.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
10/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review company reports for Cushman and Cushman DC.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
10/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re jury demand.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re draft amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re motion to amend complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise motion to amend and check cases cited.	1.5	\$ 600.00	\$ 900.00
10/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Draft case investigation correspondence.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$ 360.00
10/9/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research Defendant's background.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
10/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with GW re case investigation.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
10/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re motion to amend.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re meet and confer on collective/class list.		\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re further company investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/9/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re motion to amend edits.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/10/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review DAA comments and edit motion to amend complaint accordingly.	0.7	\$ 375.00	\$ 262.50
10/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review sample stipulations re amending complaint and draft stipulation to amend complaint.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$ 360.00
10/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW, C. Walker re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re stipulation re amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review revised motion to amend.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re reviewal of revised motion to amend.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re stipulation to amend complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re stipulation to amend complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review local rules re procedure to amend complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Proof stipulation re amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re proof stipulation re amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/11/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review amended complaint documents to finalize for filing.	0.6	\$ 375.00	\$ 225.00
10/11/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft notice for amended complaint.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 187.50
10/11/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	File amended complaint and notice of same; correspondence with PAD re same.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
10/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with C. Walker, GW, SL re case investigation.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
10/11/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise and finalize amended complaint and exhibits to notice.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
10/11/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with LXM re amended complaint filing.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
10/11/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conference with PAD re amended complaint filing.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
10/11/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise and format stipulation re amended complaint.	0.2	\$ 270.00	54.00
10/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise notice of filing amended complaint.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
		1		ļ		

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 50 of 124

10/11/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with LXM re amended complaint filing.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
10/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re pro hac vice admission.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re pro hac vice admission forms.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re filing first amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/11/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review local rules re filing stipulations and notices.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re filing amended complaint and notice re same.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD re amended complaint filing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with HCC re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re finalizing amended complaint for filing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/11/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Accept redlines to stipulation.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/11/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save amended complaint to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/11/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA re amended complaint filing.	0.1	\$ 375.00	37.50
10/15/2019 10/15/2019	Molly J. Frandsen Pamela A. Disney	MJF PAD	Review Defendant's response re class list dispute. Correspondence with team re acceptance of service for the amended complaint.	0.2	\$ 350.00 375.00	\$ 70.00 75.00
10/15/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD and DAA re serving first amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/15/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save notice of filing first amended complaint and exhibits thereto to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/15/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD, DAA re co-counsel G. Shavitz's pro hac vice motion.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/15/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM, PAD re pro hac vice motion, service of amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/15/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, PAD re class list dispute.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/15/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF, PAD re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/15/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA, PAD re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
10/15/2019 10/15/2019	Pamela A. Disney Lynsey Major	PAD LXM	Conference with MJF, DAA re case investigation. Correspondence with DAA re local rule requiring sponsoring attorney for pro hac vice motions.	0.1	\$ 375.00 270.00	\$ 37.50 27.00
10/16/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and summarize Defendant's response re class list dispute.	1.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 525.00
10/16/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft 216b motion.	0.8	\$ 350.00	\$ 280.00
10/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with PAD, MJF re discovery dispute, amended complaint, and conditional certification motion.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$ 300.00
10/16/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA, PAD re discovery dispute, amended complaint, and conditional certification motion.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
10/16/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with DAA, MJF re discovery dispute, amended complaint, and conditional certification motion.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 187.50
10/16/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research rules for serving amended complaint on new party, and correspondence with PAD and DAA re same.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
10/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with tech support re case investigation.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
10/16/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with GW, DAA, PAD, C. Walker re collective member communications.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
10/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with GW, MJF, PAD, C. Walker re collective member communications.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/16/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with GW, DAA, MJF, C. Walker re collective member communications.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
10/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re updates to client.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
10/17/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft summary and response to Cushman response re class list dispute.		\$ 350.00	\$ 385.00
10/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conduct research re service of complaint and summons re amended complaint; correspondence with team re the same.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 187.50
10/17/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review local rules re waiver of service, and correspondence with PAD, DAA re same.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
10/17/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and draft 216b motion.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
10/17/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Check amended complaint issues.	0.1	\$ 990.00	99.00
10/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re class list dispute.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
10/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, LXM re service of amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 51 of 124

10/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review ethics rules re advertising in various states and correspondence with marketing re investigation.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
10/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant's letter re class/collective list and MJF summary of cases cited in Defendant's discovery dispute letter; correspondence with MJF re same.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
10/18/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspond with SFLC re 216b motion section drafting.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
10/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re options for moving to compel class/collective list.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
10/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re Judge's rules.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re options for filing motion to compel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/21/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and edit draft of putative class member declaration for 216(b) motion.	1.2	\$ 375.00	\$	450.00
10/21/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Check distribution re Dixon case; save Dixon case documents to case file; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
10/21/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re status of the case.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
10/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with technology support re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re cases in support of compelling collective list.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review online collective member communication materials.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with tech support re online collective member communication materials.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re compelling class/collective list.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re draft 216b declaration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/22/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re scheduling call with co counsel.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
10/23/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and draft motion for conditional certification.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
10/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review stipulation re extension of time to answer; correspondence with opposing counsel re same.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
10/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with CCA, PAD, MJF re compelling class/collective list, outstanding discovery, status of Bursey v. Cushman case.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
10/23/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with CCA, DAA, MJF re compelling class/collective list, outstanding discovery, status of CO case.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
10/23/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with CCA, DAA, PAD re compelling class/collective list, outstanding discovery, status of Bursey v. Cushman case.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
10/23/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with EXI re 216(b) motion.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
10/23/2019	Christopher C. Alter		Telephone conference with DAA, PAD, MJF re compelling class/collective list, outstanding discovery, status of Bursey v. Cushman case.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
10/23/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	EXI: Conference with MJF re 216(b) motion.	0.3	\$	_	75.00
10/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise correspondence with opposing counsel re class list dispute; correspondence with MJF re same.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
10/23/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft correspondence to opposing counsel re class list dispute.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
10/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re status of Bursey v. Cushman case.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re status of Bursey v. Cushman case.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re drafting Ediscovery dispute correspondence with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Check status of Bursey v. Cushman	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/23/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	EXI: Conference with MJF re 216(b) motion.	0.1	\$ 250.00	\$	25.00
10/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re collective/class list dispute.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re service of first amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
10/23/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar tentative answer to first amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 52 of 124

10/23/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review Defendant's stipulation re extended answer.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/23/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re Defendant's stipulation re extended answer.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/23/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with EIX re 216b motion.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
10/23/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	Inwald: draft and revise 216(b) Motion Parts I, II, and IIIA.	4.8	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,200.00
10/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review tolling agreements; correspondence with SJA re same and calculate effective tolling period.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
10/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Calculate tolling; correspondence with SJA re same	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
10/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re meet and confer.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re tolling lapse.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
10/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
10/24/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
10/25/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with SFLC re 216(b) motion.	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$ 245.00
10/25/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re tolling and DC wage claims.	0.1	\$ 625.00	62.50
10/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review caselaw re tolling for collective certification.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re caselaw re tolling for collective certification.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re meet and confer call.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re meet and confer call.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save motion and order extending answer to first amended complaint to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re saved motion and order extending answer to first amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/25/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise calendar deadline re answer to first amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/25/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re 216(b) motion and tolling.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
10/25/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and draft 216(b) motion.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
10/25/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	Inwald: Discuss with MJF the 216(b) Motion Parts I, II, and IIIA and next work assignment for Parts IIIB-D.	1.0	\$ 250.00	\$ 250.00
10/25/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	Inwald: Legal research of conditional certification of appraiser cases.	2.2	\$ 250.00	\$ 550.00
10/25/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	Inwald: Draft 216(b) motion Part IIIB-C.	1.4	\$ 250.00	\$ 350.00
10/25/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	Inwald: Discuss with MJF the status of the 216(b) Motion.	0.2	\$ 250.00	\$ 50.00
10/28/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with PAD, MJF re 216b motion, Defendant's discovery responses, and collective/class list dispute.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
10/28/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA, PAD re 216(b) motion, Defendant's discovery responses, and collective/class list dispute.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
10/28/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with DAA, MJF re 216(b) motion, Defendant's discovery responses, and collective/class list dispute.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
10/28/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re team call.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/28/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with C. Walker re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/29/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re meet and confer call.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/30/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	EXI: Draft 216b motion Part III.B-C.	5.4	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,350.00
10/30/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	EXI: Research appraiser cases.	2.0	\$ 250.00	500.00
10/30/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	EXI: Review and analyze discovery for 216b motion draft.	1.2	\$ 250.00	\$ 300.00
10/30/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant's corporate disclosure statement to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re class and collective list dispute.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re class and collective list dispute.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re class and collective list dispute.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 53 of 124

Abriahamson Daridrus A, Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD, MJF re declaration Davidrus A, Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD, MJF re declaration Davidrus A, Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD, MJF re declaration Davidrus A, Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD, MJF re declaration Davidrus A, Aaron DAA Correspondence with PAD, MJF re declaration Davidrus A, Aaron DAA Correspondence with pad, MJF re declaration Davidrus A, Aaron DAA Correspondence with Davidrus A, Da	10/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re potential class list compromise.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1931/2019	10/30/2019		SJA		0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
Design A. Aaron DAA Programmence with PAD, NulF re declaration 0.4 \$ 600.00 \$ 240.	10/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review declarations for 216b	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
Delirdre A. Aaron DAA Review mediation data and calculate collective 0.3 \$ 600.00 \$ 180.				Correspondence with PAD, MJF re declaration			240.00
1931/2019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Teleptone conference with GBDH co-coursel, MJF 0.2 \$ 600.00 \$ 120, reads 1903/12019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Teleptone conference with GBDH co-coursel, DAA 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Review correspondence from I. Ho, opposing 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with C. Walker re case 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with SR. Aero discassional certification 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with SR. Aero discassional certification 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with SR. Certification 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with DAA re classicollective list dispute. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with DAA re classicollective list dispute. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with DAA re classicollective list dispute. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with DAA re classicollective list dispute. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with DAA re classicollective list dispute. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with DAA re potential motion to 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with JEC re feedback on 2160 0.7 \$ 250.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with JEC re feedback on 2160 0.7 \$ 250.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with DAA re potential motion to 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A. Aeron DAA Correspondence with DAA re potential motion to 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60, reads 1903/12019 Derirde A.	10/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review mediation data and calculate collective members outside California; correspondence with	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
1931/2019	10/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with GBDH co-counsel, MJF	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
Delirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with SLAr e class/collective list negotation. S 600.00 S 60.00	10/31/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
Investigation Dendre A Aaron DAA Correspondence with SIA re class/collective list dispute. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.	10/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
Deirdre A. Asron DAA Correspondence with PAD, MJF re declaration 0.1 \$ 600,00 \$ 60.	10/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
Digital Digi	10/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re class/collective list dispute.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SFLC re 216(b) motion. 0.1 \$ 390.00 \$ 35.	10/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
Sally J. Sally J. Sally J. Conference with DAA re class/collective/list dispute. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.	10/31/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
10/31/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel re collective/class 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. \$ 60.11/1/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review and edit 216(b) motion drafted by SFLC. 1.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 385. \$ 350.00 \$ 245. \$ 350.00 \$ 250. \$ 350.00		Sally J.			1		 62.50
11/1/2019	10/31/2019		DAA		0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/1/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conference with SFLC re feedback on 216(b) 0.7 \$ 350.00 \$ 245.	11/1/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		1.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 385.00
motion m	11/1/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.7	\$ 350.00	\$ 245.00
Collective member communications. Correspondence with MJF re potential motion to compel. S 600.00 \$ 60.	11/1/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC		0.7	\$ 250.00	\$ 175.00
11/1/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re potential motion to 0.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 35.	11/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
Compel	11/1/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	· ·	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/3/2019 Molfy J. Frandsen MJF Draft complaint and correspondence with co-counsel L. Pardell, P. Meireles, and RMB re same. 0.7 \$350.00 \$245.	11/1/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
Counsel L. Pardell, P. Meireles, and RMB re same.	11/3/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review discovery and draft 216(b) motion.	2.9	\$ 350.00	\$ 1,015.00
Correspondence with team re same.	11/3/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.7	\$ 350.00	\$ 245.00
11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review documents produced by Defendant for potential use in 216b motion. 0.8 \$600.00 \$480.	11/4/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA		1.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 324.00
11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Telephone conference with PAD, MJF re 216b 0.6 \$600.00 \$360.	11/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review documents produced by Defendant for	0.8	\$ 600.00	\$ 480.00
11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Telephone conference with PAD, MJF re 216b 0.6 \$600.00 \$360.	11/4/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and draft 216(b) motion.	0.8	\$ 350.00	\$ 280.00
motion, discovery, class list dispute.				Telephone conference with PAD, MJF re 216b			360.00
11/4/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Telephone conference with DAA, PAD re 216b motion, discovery, class list dispute. 0.6 \$ 350.00 \$ 210. 11/4/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Download and extract Defendant production. 0.2 \$ 270.00 \$ 54. 11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re tolling, documents for 216b, and letter to potential opt-ins. 0.2 \$ 600.00 \$ 120. 11/4/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft correspondence to DAA re 216(b) motion questions. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70. 11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Draft task list for team call. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondence from opposing counsel, coccursely reproduction of class and collective list. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/5/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with GW re case investigation. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/5/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with consultant re case investigation. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/5/2019	11/4/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with MJF, DAA re 216b	0.6	\$ 375.00	\$ 225.00
11/4/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Download and extract Defendant production. 0.2 \$ 270.00 \$ 54. 11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re tolling, documents for 216b, and letter to potential opt-ins. 0.2 \$ 600.00 \$ 120. 11/4/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft correspondence to DAA re 216(b) motion questions. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70. 11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Draft task list for team call. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondence from opposing counsel, cocounsel re production of class and collective list. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with GW re case investigation. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/5/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft 216(b) motion. 2.9 \$ 350.00 \$ 1,015. 11/5/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with consultant re case investigation. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/5/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA	11/4/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA, PAD re 216b	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00
11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re tolling, documents for 216b, and letter to potential opt-ins. 0.2 \$ 600.00 \$ 120. 11/4/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft correspondence to DAA re 216(b) motion questions. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70. 11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Draft task list for team call. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondence from opposing counsel, cocounsel re production of class and collective list. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/4/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with GW re case investigation. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/5/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft 216(b) motion. 2.9 \$ 350.00 \$ 1,015. 11/5/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with consultant re case investigation. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/5/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with S. Levy, consultants re online case investigation. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/5/2019 Lynsey Major	11/4/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM		0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
Questions. Questions. Questions.	11/4/2019			Correspondence with MJF re tolling, documents for	0.2		120.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondence from opposing counsel, cocounsel re production of class and collective list. Section	11/4/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft correspondence to DAA re 216(b) motion	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondence from opposing counsel, cocounsel re production of class and collective list. Section	11/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Draft task list for team call.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/5/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft 216(b) motion. 2.9 \$ 350.00 \$ 1,015. 11/5/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with consultant re case investigation. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/5/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with S. Levy, consultants re online case investigation. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/5/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Save Plaintiff's responses to Defendant's first set of document requests to case file. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27. 11/6/2019 SF Law Clerk SFLC EXI: Draft tolling and notice sections of 216b motion. 3.5 \$ 250.00 \$ 875.	11/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/5/2019 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft 216(b) motion. 2.9 \$ 350.00 \$ 1,015. 11/5/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with consultant re case investigation. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/5/2019 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with S. Levy, consultants re online case investigation. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60. 11/5/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Save Plaintiff's responses to Defendant's first set of document requests to case file. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27. 11/6/2019 SF Law Clerk SFLC EXI: Draft tolling and notice sections of 216b motion. 3.5 \$ 250.00 \$ 875.	11/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re case investigation	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/5/2019Deirdre A. AaronDAACorrespondence with consultant re case investigation.0.1\$ 600.00\$ 60.11/5/2019Deirdre A. AaronDAACorrespondence with S. Levy, consultants re online case investigation.0.1\$ 600.00\$ 60.11/5/2019Lynsey MajorLXMSave Plaintiff's responses to Defendant's first set of document requests to case file.0.1\$ 270.00\$ 27.11/6/2019SF Law ClerkSFLCEXI: Draft tolling and notice sections of 216b motion.3.5\$ 250.00\$ 875.							1,015.00
case investigation. 11/5/2019 Lynsey Major LXM Save Plaintiff's responses to Defendant's first set of document requests to case file. 11/6/2019 SF Law Clerk SFLC EXI: Draft tolling and notice sections of 216b motion. 5 270.00 \$ 27. \$ 250.00 \$ 875.				Correspondence with consultant re case			60.00
11/5/2019Lynsey MajorLXMSave Plaintiff's responses to Defendant's first set of document requests to case file.0.1\$ 270.00\$ 27.11/6/2019SF Law ClerkSFLCEXI: Draft tolling and notice sections of 216b motion.3.5\$ 250.00\$ 875.	11/5/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with S. Levy, consultants re online case investigation.		\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/6/2019 SF Law Clerk SFLC EXI: Draft tolling and notice sections of 216b 3.5 \$ 250.00 \$ 875. motion.	11/5/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Plaintiff's responses to Defendant's first set of	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
	11/6/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	EXI: Draft tolling and notice sections of 216b	3.5	\$ 250.00	\$ 875.00
	11/6/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and draft 216(b) motion.	3.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 1,190.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 54 of 124

11/6/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant's discovery responses and summary of deficiencies.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
11/6/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with SFLC re 216(b) motion.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
11/6/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	EXI: Conference with MJF re 216(b) motion.	0.3	\$	250.00	\$	75.00
11/6/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant's E-discovery document production.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
11/6/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with SFLC re 216(b) motion.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
11/6/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel GBDH re E-	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/6/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	discovery document production error. Correspondence with DXS re issue with Defendant's		\$	600.00	\$	60.00
			document production.					
11/6/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re discovery deficiencies.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/6/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with consultant re online case investigation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/7/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and draft 216(b) motion.	1.4	\$	350.00	\$	490.00
11/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise discovery deficiency chart.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
11/7/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft correspondence to class list members.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
11/7/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel B. Holtzman re Defendant's E-discovery production.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re E-discovery production issues.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with consultant re case investigation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/9/2010	Doirdro A Assas	D		0.1		600.00	ď	60.00
11/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with consultants re case website.	0.1	\$ \$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/8/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re document review workflow, moving standing call.	0.1	,	600.00	\$	60.00
11/8/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA, PAD re rescheduling team call.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
11/12/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft correspondence to send to collective list.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
11/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise E-discovery tags.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
11/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD, MJF re 216b drafting and declaration project, document review.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
11/12/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with PAD, DAA re 216b drafting and declaration project, document review.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
11/12/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with MJF, DAA re 216b drafting and declaration project, document review.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
11/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re 216(b) briefing deadline.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re potential extension of 216b briefing deadline.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review draft 216b brief.	0.6	\$	600.00	\$	360.00
11/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review declarations for 216b.	0.4	\$	600.00		240.00
11/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise document review tags.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
11/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re communications to	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
	Donard 7 tt 7 taron		potential collective members.			000.00	Ψ	
11/13/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re communications to potential collective members.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
11/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re declaration for 216b.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re declarations for 216(b).	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/14/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case memo.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
11/14/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re class and collective list, 216b deadline, E-discovery issues.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/14/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re draft 216b declaration.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/14/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re class	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/15/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	and collective list, E-discovery metadata issue. Import Defendant overlay file to update document subject lines; thread same; correspondence with	0.5	\$	270.00	\$	135.00
			team re same.	<u> </u>			<u> </u>	
11/15/2019 11/15/2019	Lynsey Major Deirdre A. Aaron	LXM DAA	Save Defendant production to case file. Correspondence with SJA re letter to potential opt	0.1	\$	270.00 600.00	\$	27.00 60.00
11/15/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	ins. Correspondence with PAD, MJF, LXM re class and	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/15/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	collective list. Save Defendant production to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
11/15/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA, PAD re contact	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
			information for class members.		, i		Ċ	
11/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review class list and draft correspondence to team	0.4	\$	375.00	\$	150.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 55 of 124

11/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD, MJF, LXM re correspondence with potential collective members, 216b motion, E-discovery review.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
11/18/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conference with DAA, PAD, MJF re correspondence with potential collective members, 216b motion, E-discovery review.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
11/18/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Import Defendant production to Nuix; correspondence with team re same.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
11/18/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA, PAD, LXM re correspondence with potential collective members, 216b motion, E-discovery review.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
11/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA, LXM, MJF re correspondence with potential collective members, 216b motion, E-discovery review.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
11/18/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare call log for declaration intake project.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
11/18/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit letter to witnesses.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
11/18/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft correspondence to collective list.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
11/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review collective list data.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
11/18/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit pro hac vice motion.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
11/18/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review class member contact data.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
11/18/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re class member contact data.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
11/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re letter to potential opt ins.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review collective list.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re reviewal of collective list.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/18/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re correspondence with potential opt-ins and opt-in questions.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
11/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re correspondence with potential opt-ins and opt-in questions.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with DXS re document review.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise correspondence with potential opt ins.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re revised correspondence with potential opt-ins.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/18/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Compare Defendant production re class data.	0.1	\$ 270.00	27.00
11/18/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re Defendant production compared to class data.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
11/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JA, MJS, MNL, MB, MLS re communications to potential opt-ins.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Finalize and file pro hac vice motion; correspondence with SJA re same.	0.6	\$ 270.00	\$ 162.00
11/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise and format co-counsel G. Shavitz' pro hac vice motion.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
11/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise intake recipient list.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
11/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re setting up declaration intakes.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
11/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re case status and next steps.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
11/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re communications to potential opt-ins.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with IT re revising case listserv.	0.1	\$ 270.00	27.00
11/19/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit motion for pro hac vice.	0.1	\$ 625.00	62.50
11/19/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re edit motion for pro hac vice.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
11/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with BXS, accounting re payment for pro hac vice motion.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
11/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Record payment notes re payment for pro hac vice motion.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
11/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save docketed motion to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
11/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with technology consultant re communications to potential opt-ins.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
11/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re correspondence with potential opt-ins.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
11/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with DAA re class list review.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
11/20/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with SFLC re feedback on draft of 216(b) motion.	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$ 245.00
11/20/2019	SF Law Clerk	SFLC	EXI: Conference with MJF re feedback on draft of 216(b) motion.	0.7	\$ 250.00	\$ 175.00
		•	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •			

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 56 of 124

11/20/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft correspondence to collective incorporating edits from DAA; correspondence with DAA, cocunsel re same.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
11/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review witness list for potential opt-ins; correspondence with MJF, PAD re same.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
11/20/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with BK re review of class list.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
11/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review confidentiality order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re confidentiality order	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/20/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re confidentiality order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
11/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with technology consultant re potential witness investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated correspondence from potential collective members.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re updated correspondence from potential collective members.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/20/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re co-counsel's notice of appearance.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
11/20/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re admission.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
11/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Draft intake form for 216b.	0.7	\$ 600.00	\$	420.00
11/21/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review potential class member data for intakes.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
11/21/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA, co-counsel P. Meireles re revised correspondence with collective list.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
11/21/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save order granting co-counsel G. Shavitz's pro hac vice admission to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
11/21/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re potential witness investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/21/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise correspondence with collective list.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
11/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re case investigation project.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re E-discovery review.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re draft 216b.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with DXS re E-discovery review.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review co-counsel edits to potential collective member communication.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re co-counsel edits to potential collective member communication.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/22/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with OG team re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/22/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save job search data to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
11/22/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SYU, DAA, PAD re further research re class member job titles.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
11/22/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from DAA re correspondence with collective.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
11/24/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise correspondence with collective.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
11/24/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re revised correspondence with collective.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
11/25/2019	Rania Tootla	RXT	Research re potential witnesses.	3.2	\$ 270.00		864.00
11/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review draft of 216b motion.	0.3	\$ 600.00		180.00
11/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with MJF re case investigation.	0.2	\$	Ċ	120.00
11/25/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA re case investigation.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
11/25/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with JWG re term sheet.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
11/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re reviewal of collective list.		\$ 600.00	,	60.00
11/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re 216b brief.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
11/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review collective list.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
11/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re communication to potential collective members.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/25/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re case investigation communication to potential collective members.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/25/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise correspondence with the collective.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
11/25/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re revised correspondence with the collective.	0.1	\$ 350.00		35.00
11/26/2019	Rania Tootla	RXT	Research re potential witnesses.	1.5	\$ 270.00		405.00
11/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise draft of 216b motion.	0.7	\$ 600.00	\$	420.00
11/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Improve draft of 216b intake form.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 57 of 124

11/26/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review answer to amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
11/26/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re reviewed answer to amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
11/26/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated case investigation letter to potential opt ins.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/26/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save answer to first amended complaint to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
12/2/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise and coordinate mailing and email blast of communication to collective; correspondence with DAA, BXB, SYU re same.	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$	245.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Draft intake template.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$	360.00
12/2/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Defendant's discovery production.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
12/2/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA, PAD re case investigation, E-discovery review.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with MJF, PAD re case investigation, E-discovery review.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
12/2/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with DAA, MJF re case investigation, E-discovery review.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$	150.00
12/2/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re status of the case.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
12/2/2019	Rania Tootla	RXT	Review discovery data.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
12/2/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SYU re sending mail chimp blast to class members.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SYU re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, PAD re intake template, investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Finalize investigation letter to potential collective members.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re finalized investigation letter to potential collective members.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, PAD re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re 216b declaration project.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re case investigation communications to former appraisers.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re comparison of answer to amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re coverage during paid time off leave.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re workflow for 216b December project.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/2/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with CYH re investigation outreach.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/2/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re litigation strategy and witness declarations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
12/2/2019	Rania Tootla	RXT	Correspondence with MJF re information from communications with former appraisers.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
12/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Prepare for call with DXS re discovery.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$	150.00
12/3/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DXS re discovery review.	0.4	\$ 375.00		150.00
12/3/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential client and correspondence with PAD and DAA re same.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
12/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re updates to case website.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
12/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated website.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re updated website.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
12/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, PAD, CYH re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	·	60.00
12/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re intakes.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/3/2019 12/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA DAA	Correspondence with SJA re 216(b) motion. Correspondence with MJF, PAD, CYH re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	investigation. Correspondence with GW re case website updates.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/3/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Review correspondence from DAA and team re blast correspondence with clients.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
12/3/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise finalizing and sending email blast to collective list.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
12/3/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/4/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update contact log re correspondence with potential class members, format log; correspondence with MJF re intake.		\$ 270.00		324.00
		•	-	•			

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 58 of 124

12/4/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review document production; draft correspondence to team re plan for review.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
12/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re case investigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/4/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save stipulation re Belaire notice in related case to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re response from potential collective member.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/4/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re 216b intake project.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/5/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise 216(b) motion; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
12/5/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re E-discovery review.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/5/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from PAD, DAA re reviewing discovery.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
12/6/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Record class member correspondence.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/6/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save order re Belaire notice in related case to case	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/6/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	file. Forward class member correspondence to PAD for intake.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/9/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with potential class member L. Margolis; prep re the same.	1.0	\$ 375.00	\$ 375.00
12/9/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with LXM re Cushman's E-discovery production.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
12/9/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save and extract Defendant production to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/9/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with CCA re save and extract Defendant production to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/10/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Import Defendant's production to Nuix;	0.6	\$ 270.00	\$ 162.00
12/10/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	correspondence with team re same. Telephone conference with potential declarant re	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
12/10/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	case and schedule intake call. Review and respond to correspondence with DXS, CAA re issue with Defendant's discovery production.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
12/10/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Review correspondence with team re supplemental Defendant's discovery productions.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/11/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential declarant; correspondence with DAA, PAD re same.	1.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 385.00
12/11/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA, MJF, LXM re 216b declaration project, document review.	0.6	\$ 375.00	\$ 225.00
12/11/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conference with PAD, DAA, MJF re 216b declaration project, document review.	0.6	\$ 270.00	\$ 162.00
12/11/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA, PAD, LXM re 216b declaration project, document review.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00
12/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD, MJF, LXM re 216b declaration project, document review.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$ 360.00
12/11/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re intake.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/11/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review discovery correspondence.	0.1	\$ 990.00	99.00
12/11/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with potential declarants re case and scheduling calls.	0.1	\$ 350.00	35.00
12/11/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re weekly team call.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/12/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Create recipients lists and prepare letter to putative class members.	1.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 297.00
12/12/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential opt-in for 216b motion and potential declaration.	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$ 245.00
12/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re 216b declarations.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
12/12/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with team re data production bates-stamping issue.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
12/12/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with LXM, MJF re calling potential collective members.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 75.00
12/12/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD re intake with potential collective members.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/12/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review privilege log.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
12/12/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re review privilege log.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
12/12/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re 216b motion.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
12/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re 216b declarations, Bursey v. Cushman case, case check-in.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM, SCG re additional notice mailing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 59 of 124

12/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re additional case investigation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/12/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re outreach to Defendant re E-discovery order.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/12/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from DAA, LXM re declaration.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
12/12/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant's privilege log to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
12/12/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SYU re mass correspondence with putative class members.		\$	270.00		27.00
12/13/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise and finalize letters re potential declarations; correspondence with DAA, DMC re same.	0.6	\$	270.00	\$	162.00
12/13/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update records re investigation efforts and circulate intakes to PAD, DAA, and MJF.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
12/13/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with DAA, opposing counsel re Defendant's document production.	0.3	\$	375.00	\$	112.50
12/13/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re witness intake.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
12/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re intakes.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review intake questionnaire.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re Plaintiff R. Seltz declaration.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re 216b strategy.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM, DMC re additional mailing.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from PAD, DXS re Ediscovery production issues.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re investigation mailing.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review summary of intakes.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re summary of intakes.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/13/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Review correspondence from team re Defendant's productions.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
12/13/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re intake.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
12/13/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re document production in Dixon v. Cushman & Wakefield Western case.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/14/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re 216b motion, status of settlement negotiations.		\$	600.00		60.00
12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise 216b motion.	1.9	\$	600.00		1,140.00
12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re 216b declaration project, discovery review.	0.6	\$	600.00		360.00
12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with MJF, PAD, LXM, SJA re status of declarations and intakes.		\$	600.00		300.00
12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with MJF, PAD re 216b motion and declarations.	0.5	\$	600.00		300.00
12/16/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA, LXM, SJA, PAD restatus of declarations and intakes.		\$	350.00		175.00
12/16/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA, PAD re 216b motion and declarations.	0.5	\$	350.00		175.00
12/16/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with DAA, MJF, SJA, PAD re status of declarations and intakes.		\$	270.00		135.00
12/16/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with DAA, MJF, LXM, SJA re status of declarations and intakes.		\$	375.00		187.50
12/16/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with DAA, MJF re 216b motion and declarations.	0.5	\$	375.00		187.50
12/16/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with DAA, MJF, PAD, LXM re status of declarations and intakes.	0.5	\$	625.00		312.50
12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with LBB re settlement administration issues.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with OM re associate staffing.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/16/2019	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re Bursey v. Cushman	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
12/16/2019	Abrahamson Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	case. Correspondence with JMS, SJA re status of Bursey	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	v. Cushman case. Review correspondence from opposing counsel,	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/16/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	LXM, PAD re E-discovery production issues. Correspondence with PAD re Defendant's duplicate	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	production values. Correspondence with OG team re intake check-in	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/16/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	call. Record class members' communication and forward	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
12/16/2019	Deirdre A Agree	DAA	to PAD for intake. Check document production.	0.1	\$	600.00	¢	60.00
12/10/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	IDAA	Check accument production.	JU. I	\$	000.00	ĮΦ	60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 60 of 124

12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re duplicate bates numbers.		\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Search document production for documents re director.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re 216b motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise template declaration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/16/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re review and revise template declaration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/16/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with potential opt-in re scheduling intake call.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
12/16/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Analyze number of potential class members with director title.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/16/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re intake tracker.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with potential class member B. Blake; preparation re the same.	1.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 562.50
12/17/2019	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Import Defendant productions to Nuix; correspondence with team re same.	1.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 324.00
12/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Edit Plaintiff R. Seltz's declaration; draft correspondence to team re the same.	1.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 450.00
12/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review document production and draft correspondence to team re plan for review.	0.9	\$ 375.00	\$ 337.50
12/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft notes from conference with potential class member B. Blake; draft correspondence to team re the same.	0.9	\$ 375.00	\$ 337.50
12/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with potential collective members.	0.3	\$ 375.00	\$ 112.50
12/17/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	. Conference with JMS, DAA re 216b motion, case strategy.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$ 187.50
12/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS, SJA re 216b motion, case strategy.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
12/17/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA, SJA re strategy for 216b motion, case strategy.	0.3	\$ 990.00	\$ 297.00
12/17/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review discovery and strategy for 216b motion.	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$ 198.00
12/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re team call.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence to Plaintiff R. Seltz re status of the case.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
12/17/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re E-discovery review.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/17/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA, PAD re indexing Defendant discovery production and timing of 216(b) motion.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
12/17/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant's revised production to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/17/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with CCA re Defendant's revised production saved to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
12/17/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft correspondence to team re status of Defendant's December 9 production.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
12/18/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential class member and declarant for 216(b) motion.	1.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 490.00
12/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz and preparation re the same.	1.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 450.00
12/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Defendant's document production; draft correspondence to team re the same.	0.7	\$ 375.00	\$ 262.50
12/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further revise draft 216b declaration.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$ 360.00
12/18/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Edit Plaintiff R. Seltz's declaration for 216(b) motion in preparation for the call.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 187.50
12/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Update intake questionnaire.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
12/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re team call.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re updated intake and declaration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/18/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re document review.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
12/18/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review PAD intake notes.	0.1	\$ 625.00	62.50
12/19/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS, MJF, PAD re 216(b) strategy, timing, and defining the class and collectives.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$ 312.50
12/19/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA, MJF, PAD re 216(b) strategy, timing, and defining the class and collectives.	0.5	\$ 990.00	\$ 495.00
12/19/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with JMS, SJA, PAD re 216(b) strategy, timing, and defining the class and collectives.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
12/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with MJF, JMS, SJA re 216(b) strategy, timing, and defining the class and collectives.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 187.50
		•	+			

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 61 of 124

12/19/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re potential settlement	0.3	\$	990.00	\$	297.00
10/10/00/10	B : 1 A A		structure and strategy	0.0		200.00		100.00
12/19/2019 12/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA DAA	Review pay data re recoverable draw. Conference with JMS re potential settlement	0.3	\$ \$	600.00		180.00 180.00
12/19/2019	Delidie A. Aalon	DAA	structure and strategy.	0.3	Ψ	000.00	"	100.00
12/19/2019	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Preparation for call with co-counsel.	0.3	\$	375.00	\$	112.50
12/19/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re strategy for 216b, scope of collective.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
12/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re strategy for 216b, scope of collective.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
12/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review potential plaintiff intake notes.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re intake notes.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re Plaintiff R. Seltz declaration for 216b.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re 216b intakes.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/19/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re declaration.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
12/19/2019	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA post team call re follow up tasks.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
12/19/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS post team call re follow up tasks.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/19/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update declaration tracker with intake.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
12/19/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with IT re adding L. Pardell to Plaintiffs' counsel list.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
12/19/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA, SJA, and PAD re intake for 216(b) motion.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
12/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re 216(b) strategy, intakes, and scope of collective.	0.8	\$	600.00	\$	480.00
12/20/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re 216(b) strategy, intakes,	0.8	\$	350.00	\$	280.00
12/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	and scope of collective. Review compensation document production.	0.7	\$	600.00	\$	420.00
12/20/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise 216(b) motion incorporating edits from DAA.	0.6	\$	350.00		210.00
	,		σ				'	
12/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review class list, document production re 216b; correspondence with SJA, MJF, PAD re same.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
12/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re 216(b) strategy.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
12/20/2019	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re 216(b) strategy.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
12/20/2019	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save class list to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
12/20/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Revise security settings on issue codes.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
12/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review 216(b) witness intake.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/20/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re 216(b) witness intake review.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review compensation documents produced by Defendant.	0.9	\$	600.00		540.00
12/23/2019	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft correspondence to collective list.	0.2	\$	350.00		70.00
12/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with internal team re settlement conference in Bursey v. Cushman case.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review additional investigation materials.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/23/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re additional investigation materials.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/24/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise Plaintiff R. Seltz declaration.	8.0	\$	600.00		480.00
12/27/2019 12/27/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA DAA	Review Defendant's document production. Correspondence with PAD re Plaintiff R. Seltz and	0.5	\$	600.00		300.00 60.00
40/00/0046	Date 1 A 1	1000	potential witness declaration for 216b.	14.4		000.00		0.10.00
12/30/2019 12/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA DAA	Review Defendant's document production. Draft document review notes; correspondence with	0.4	\$	600.00		840.00 240.00
12/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	PAD, MJF re same. Correspondence with Litigation Operations team re	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
12/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	potential witness research. Correspondence with SJA, PAD, MJF re status of	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/30/2019	Sally J.	SJA	document review, 216b project. Correspondence with DAA re intakes.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
10/00/22 15	Abrahamson	ļ	10 11 212 212 1 1			000 -:	L_	
12/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re 216b declarations.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/30/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re additional witness investigation.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
12/31/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Save potential client profiles to case file.	0.4	\$	270.00		108.00
12/31/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Correspondence with team re client communication request.	0.3	\$	270.00		81.00
12/31/2019	Sara Olson	sxo	Review letter template for NY solicitation rules and compliance.	0.3	\$	270.00		81.00
12/31/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Revise contacts log for investigation outrach.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 62 of 124

12/31/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Save client profiles to case file.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
12/31/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Send DAA letter to clients.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
12/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with Litigation Operations team re case investigation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SXO re 216b investigation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/31/2019	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SXO re 216b investigation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
12/31/2019	Sara Olson	SXO	Correspondence with team re letter dissemination.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
1/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research alternative addresses, prepare and save	1.2	\$	270.00	\$	324.00
			new correspondence re declarations, and update					
			investigation notes re same.				L	
1/2/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant's document production.	0.6	\$	600.00	\$	360.00
1/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Record putative class member's correspondence; update address; correspondence with PAD re same.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
1/2/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review potential collective member intake.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
1/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update log with putative class member correspondence.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
1/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re update log with putative class member correspondence.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
1/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Record undeliverable mailing address.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
1/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re undeliverable mailing address.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
1/2/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re research re potential witnesses.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/3/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant's document production.	1.4	\$	600.00	\$	840.00
1/3/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential declarant for 216(b)	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
17372020	Iviolity 6. 1 randscri	IWIOI	motion.	0.5	"	000.00	Ψ	175.00
1/3/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Summarize intake and correspondences with potential declarants; correspondence with DAA, PAD, SJA re same.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
1/3/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and index discovery documents.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
1/3/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
1/3/2020	Famela A. Dishey	FAD	potential class members re scheduling times to speak.	0.2	Ψ	373.00	Ψ	75.00
1/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review MJF intake investigation notes.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
1/3/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re status of the case.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
1/3/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review 216b intake.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/3/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re review 216b intake.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/6/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant's document production.	2.5	\$	600.00		1,500.00
1/6/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review documents in Defendant's file for relevance; draft correspondence to MJF re the same.	1.9	\$	375.00	\$	712.50
1/6/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential declarant.	1.1	\$	350.00	\$	385.00
1/6/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential declarant E. Hix.	1.1	\$	350.00		385.00
1/6/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz re status of the case and the declaration for 216(b).	0.5	\$	375.00		187.50
1/6/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA, PAD re status of discovery, 216(b) motion.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
1/6/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with PAD, MJF re status of discovery, 216(b) motion.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
1/6/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with DAA, MJF re status of discovery, 216(b) motion.	0.5	\$	375.00	\$	187.50
1/6/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with PAD re indexing documents.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
1/6/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Prepare for call re 216(b) motion and status of discovery.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
1/6/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with MJF re indexing documents.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
1/6/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re status of the case.	0.1	\$	375.00	\$	37.50
1/6/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re status of case.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
1/6/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review documents.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
1/6/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re document review.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
1/6/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re team call to discuss case strategy.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/6/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re document review.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
								

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 63 of 124

1/6/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with potential class member re scheduling a time to speak.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
1/7/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review case file re status of discovery, pending issues and deadlines, and draft case transition memo for SJA.	1.8	\$ 600.00	\$ 1,080.00
1/7/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with potential class member re experience at Cushman; preparation re the same.	1.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 562.50
1/7/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with potential class member re experience at Cushman; preparation re the same.	1.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 562.50
1/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and index discovery documents.	1.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 385.00
1/7/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review documents in Cushman's production for relevance.	1.0	\$ 375.00	\$ 375.00
1/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential declarant K. Pierno; correspondence with DAA, PAD, and SJA re same.	0.8	\$ 350.00	\$ 280.00
1/7/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Edit Plaintiff R. Seltz declaration; draft correspondence to team re the same.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
1/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA, PAD, LXM re including E. Hix as a declarant and sending him a consent-to- join form.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
1/7/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review DAA notes on discovery documents.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/7/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review potential class member intake.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/7/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence re information and document production.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
1/7/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re discovery deadlines.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
1/7/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re call to discuss 216b motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/7/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re potential reclassification.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/7/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re intake review.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/7/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review intake notes.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/7/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re intake.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/7/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re potential 216b declarant.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/8/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Defendant's document production re relevance and draft summary of hot documents.	1.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 562.50
1/8/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Finish review of documents and draft notes of relevant documents; correspondence with team re the same.	1.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 450.00
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review documents re potential reclassification; correspondence with SJA, PAD, MJF re same.	0.7	\$ 600.00	\$ 420.00
1/8/2020	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Import Defendant production to Nuix; correspondence with team re same.	0.6	\$ 270.00	\$ 162.00
1/8/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SJA, DAA, PAD, co- counsel P. Meireles, L. Pardell re 216(b) motion and potential mediation.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
1/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with MJF, DAA, PAD, co- counsel P. Meireles, L. Pardell re 216b motion and potential mediation.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$ 250.00
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with SJA, MJF, PAD, co- counsel P. Meireles, L. Pardell re 216b motion and potential mediation.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
1/8/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Telephone conference with SJA, MJF, DAA, co- counsel P. Meireles, L. Pardell re 216b motion and potential mediation.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$ 150.00
1/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Record class member correspondence and team assignments.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Plaintiff R. Seltz declaration; correspondence to PAD re same.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise consent to join form.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
1/8/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Prepare for call re 216(b).	0.2	\$ 375.00	75.00
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with OG team re declaration project, intakes.	0.2	\$ 600.00	120.00
1/8/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with potential opt-ins re scheduling calls.		\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
1/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review MJF description of discovery documents.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review intake notes from MJF.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 64 of 124

1/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re MJF intake notes review.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review intake notes for potential 216b declarant.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re 216b motion.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re consent to join form.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re consent to join form.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD re document review.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re potential intake.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re litigation strategy, 216b motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re litigation strategy, 216b motion.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re updated consent to join form.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar internal deadlines prior to discovery cut- off.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
1/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant production to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review document re junior appraiser classification.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re review document re junior appraiser classification.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/8/2020	Sara Olson	SXO	Review correspondence with team re importing Defendant's productions to Nuix.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
1/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA, MJF re consent form.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
1/8/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with B. Blake and LXM re submitting a consent to join.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$ 37.50
1/9/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft notes from conferences with potential class members [REDACTED]; draft correspondence to team re the same.	1.5	\$ 375.00	\$ 562.50
1/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research alternative mailing addresses and prepare investigation letters.	0.7	\$ 270.00	\$ 189.00
1/9/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review PAD, MJF notes re discovery document review.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
1/9/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re scope of 216b motion, status of negotiations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/9/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re scope of 216b motion, status of negotiations.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
1/10/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with potential class member [REDACTED] and prep re the same.	1.2	\$ 375.00	\$ 450.00
1/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential opt-in K. Pierno.	1.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 420.00
1/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential opt-in [REDACTED].	0.6	\$ 350.00	210.00
1/10/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review additional intakes; correspondence with PAD re same.	0.4	\$ 600.00	240.00
1/10/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Send consent forms to potential plaintiffs.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
1/10/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save signed consent forms to case file.	0.2	\$ 270.00	54.00
1/10/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update contact log re new signed consent forms.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
1/10/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review PAD, MJF document review notes and update memo re notable documents produced, potential custodians.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/10/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Update memo re notable documents produced, potential custodians.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/10/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review documents produced re CBRE classification.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/10/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review documents from potential opt-in.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/10/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re review documents from potential opt-in.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with opt-in E. Hix re consent to join form.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
1/10/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re filing consent forms with Court.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
1/12/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and index documents produced by Defendant.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
1/12/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re status of 216(b).	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/12/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SLG, LXM re document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
1/12/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re consent to join form.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
1/12/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
1/13/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review notes and draft declaration for Plaintiff B. Blake in support of 216(b) motion.	2.0	\$ 375.00	\$ 750.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 65 of 124

1/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft notice of consent to join, prepare exhibit for same, and review local rules re same.	0.8	\$ 270.00	\$	216.00
1/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise, finalize, and docket consent form filing; save to case file.	0.6	\$ 270.00	\$	162.00
1/13/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Summarize intake notes from potential declarants K. Pierno and [REDACTED]; correspondence with DAA, SJA, PAD re same.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA, PAD, MJF re 216b declarations, status of motion, document review.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
1/13/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA, PAD, MJF re 216b declarations, status of motion, document review.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$	312.50
1/13/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA, PAD, SJA re 216b declarations, status of motion, document review.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
1/13/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA, SJA MJF re 216b declarations, status of motion, document review.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review additional potential class member intake notes.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
1/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update intake log re notes re investigation.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
1/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Transfer Defendant production to co-counsel.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, PAD, MJF re status of declarations.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to co-counsel re scheduling call.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles, L. Pardell re 216b status, parental leave coverage.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save consent form to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
1/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re consent form correction.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
1/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re file transfer of Defendant production to co-counsel.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with OG team re covered job titles.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/13/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MRF re intake.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Research re diligence advisory.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with OG team re research re diligence advisory.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review notice of consent to join filing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re review notice of consent to join filing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review final consents for filing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re final consents for filing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise consent to join template.	0.1	\$ 270.00	-	27.00
1/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re revised consent to join template.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
1/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with opt-in plaintiff re receipt of consent form.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
1/14/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Draft notes and summary of conference with potential class member [REDACTED]; circulate to team.	0.6	\$ 375.00	\$	225.00
1/14/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS, L. Ho re strategy for pursuing claims, defining class and collective.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
1/14/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA, L. Ho re strategy for pursuing claims, defining class and collective.	0.4	\$ 990.00	\$	396.00
1/14/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re call with L. Ho.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/14/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with potential class member M. Radoja re scheduling a time to speak.	0.1	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
1/15/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential opt-in plaintiff for 216(b).	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$	245.00
1/15/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research alternative contact information; prepare investigation letters.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
1/15/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re litigation strategy.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
1/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re litigation strategy.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
1/15/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review potential class member intakes.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review potential class member intake.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/15/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Call PC [REDACTED] re scheduling a time to speak.	0.1	\$ 375.00		37.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 66 of 124

1/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re document review re reclassification.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with L. Ho.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/15/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with PAD re intake reviews.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
1/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Update case transition memo.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re case transition.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review document re reclassification.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
1/16/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Defendant's January 6 production of documents; draft correspondence to team re the same.	0.7	\$	375.00	\$	262.50
1/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review junior appraiser declaration; correspondence with PAD re same.	0.6	\$	600.00	\$	360.00
1/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review mediation pay data; correspondence with SJA, JMS re same.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
1/16/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re Defendant's data.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
1/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Additional damages calculations for juniors and appraisers with draws.	0.8	\$	600.00	\$	480.00
1/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Calculate damages scenarios in preparation for call with L. Ho.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
1/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review pay data and mediation notes; correspondence with L. Ho re same.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
1/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with L. Ho re scope of class, potential damages, and following up with Rotman re same.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
1/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re damages calculations.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
1/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS, SJA re recap of call with Laura, next steps.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
1/17/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review notes and draft correspondence re status of potential 216b declarants.	0.2	\$	375.00	\$	75.00
1/17/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re damages and negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
1/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re mediation negotiations.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/17/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re litigation strategy.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
1/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF, SJA re 216b motion.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re declarations, 216b motion.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/17/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re declarations, 216b motion.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
1/20/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review of tip worksheets in preparation for mediation.	0.6	\$	600.00	\$	360.00
1/20/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with OM re staffing.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
1/20/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$	990.00		99.00
1/21/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Prepare declarations in support of 216(b).	1.9	\$	350.00	\$	665.00
1/22/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Edit declaration and send to Plaintiff B. Blake for review.	0.5	\$	375.00	\$	187.50
1/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review declaration for 216b; correspondence with MJF re same.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
1/22/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Prepare for call with mediator, attend call, and follow up call with L. Ho.	0.3	\$	990.00	\$	297.00
1/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review and revise draft 216b motion.	0.3	\$	600.00		180.00
1/22/2020 1/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA DAA	Review documents from opt in-plaintiff. Review correspondence from L. Ho re call with	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00 60.00
1/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	mediator S. Rotman. Correspondence with JMS, SJA re correspondences from L. Ho re call with mediator S. Rotman.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re 216b declarations.	0.1	\$	600.00	¢	60.00
1/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re call with mediator.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
1/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS, SJA re fee petition.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
1/22/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re potential for settlement and litigation steps.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
1/23/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with potential class member H. Elliott re her experience and draft summary of call.	1.0	\$	375.00	\$	375.00
1/23/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS, SJA re call with mediator S. Rotman, 216b filing.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/23/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save client documents to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
1/23/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review edits to 216(b) declarations from DAA.	0.1	\$	350.00		35.00
1,20,2020	iniony of Lianusen	10101	1. Conow Callo to 2 ro(b) decidiations from DAA.	10.1	Ψ	000.00	ıΨ	00.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 67 of 124

1/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with opt-in plaintiff K. Pierno and prepare declaration.	1.4	\$ 350.00	\$	490.00
1/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with and prepare declaration in support of 216(b) for Opt-In Plaintiff E. Hix.	0.8	\$ 350.00	\$	280.00
1/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise draft of 216b motion; correspondence with MNF re same.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$	360.00
1/24/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Edit call notes and draft correspondence to team re summary of potential class member intakes.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
1/24/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review and respond to correspondence with SJA re conferences with potential class members.	0.2	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
1/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review potential class member intake.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MNF re 216b declarations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re intake review.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review tolling agreement re 216b.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, PAD re potential opt-in.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re 216(b) motion.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
1/27/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review additional declarations in support of 216b.	0.7	\$ 600.00		420.00
1/27/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with PAD, MJF re potential settlement	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
			negotiations, 216b declarations and motion.				
1/27/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA, PAD re potential settlement negotiations, 216b declarations and motion.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
1/27/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Conference with DAA, MJF re potential settlement negotiations, 216b declarations and motion.	0.5	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
1/27/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review 216b declaration; correspondence with MNF re same.		\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
1/27/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential declarant for 216(b) motion; correspondence with DAA, SJA, PAD re same.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
1/27/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Plaintiff B. Blake's edits to his declaration in support of 216b.	0.4	\$ 375.00	\$	150.00
1/27/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise complaint; correspondence with MLS, JWG re same.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
1/27/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise 216(b) motion incorporating edits from DAA.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
1/27/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review edits to declarations in support of 216(b) from DAA.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
1/27/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re 216b declaration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/27/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with PAD, MJF re task list.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/28/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise 216(b) motion incorporating edits from DAA.	1.1	\$ 350.00	\$	385.00
1/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with OM re case staffing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re potential referral for intake.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/28/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Record online submission notes and contact information.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
1/28/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re recorded online submission notes and contact information.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
1/28/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review case transition memo.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/28/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re reviewal of case transition memo.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re potential California client.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/28/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review 216b declaration.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/28/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re 216b declaration.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
1/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, PAD re 216b declarations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/28/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re declarations in support of 216(b) motion.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
1/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise 216(b) motion incorporating edits from DAA.	1.7	\$ 350.00	\$	595.00
1/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Index discovery produced by Defendant.	1.5	\$ 350.00	\$	525.00
1/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with Plaintiff K. Pierno and prepare 216(b) declaration.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
1/29/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re 216b motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
1/29/2020	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re witness statements.	0.1	\$ 625.00		62.50
	Abrahamson						
1/29/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re 216b declarations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	ĮΦ	60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 68 of 124

	600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	120.00 60.00 35.00 420.00 300.00 105.00 60.00 187.50
	350.00 600.00 350.00 600.00 600.00 375.00	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	35.00 420.00 300.00 105.00 60.00 60.00
	600.00 600.00 350.00 600.00 375.00 600.00	0	\$ \$ \$ \$	420.00 300.00 105.00 60.00 187.50
	600.00 600.00 600.00 375.00 600.00	0	\$ \$ \$ \$	300.00 105.00 60.00 60.00
	350.00 600.00 375.00 600.00	0	\$ \$ \$	105.00 60.00 60.00 187.50
	600.00 600.00 375.00 600.00)))	\$	60.00 60.00 187.50
	600.00 375.00 600.00)	\$	60.00
	375.00 600.00)	\$	187.50
))	600.00			
; ;)	\$	60.00
; ;	625.00			- 3.00
;)	\$	62.50
	600.00)	\$	60.00
;	600.00)	\$	60.00
	350.00)	\$	210.00
6	600.00)	\$	540.00
;	600.00)	\$	540.00
3	625.00)	\$	312.50
3	350.00)	\$	105.00
;	600.00)	\$	60.00
6	600.00)	\$	60.00
;	600.00)	\$	60.00
;	600.00)	\$	60.00
;		_		60.00
;	990.00)	\$	99.00
3				250.00
6	600.00)	\$	240.00
}	270.00)	\$	81.00
	600.00	1	\$	60.00
;				189.00
3	375.00)	\$	150.00
6	625.00)	\$	187.50
;	350.00)	\$	105.00
;	375.00)	\$	112.50
6	270.00)	\$	54.00
;	625.00)	\$	62.50
3	270.00)	\$	27.00
3	375.00)	\$	187.50
3	270.00		\$	81.00
;	625.00		\$	62.50
;	270.00	, †	\$	27.00
	625.00			62.50
		600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 625.00 600.00 270.00 625.00	600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 600.00 625.00 625.00 600.00 270.00 625.00 625.00 625.00 625.00 625.00 625.00 625.00 625.00 625.00 625.00	\$ 600.00 \$ 6

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 69 of 124

2/12/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LBB, SJA re potential declarant inquiry.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
2/13/2020	Pamela A. Disney	PAD	Review Defendant's production and mark for relevance.	3.0	\$	375.00	\$	1,125.00
2/19/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise motion for substitution and withdrawal.	0.8	\$	270.00	\$	216.00
2/19/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review co-counsel edits to 216b motion; correspondence with LBB re same.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
2/19/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Record class members' correspondence and	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
2/19/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	attorney assignment. Correspondence with LBB, SJA, clients re intake with non-junior appraisers.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
2/20/2020	Sally J.	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re potential	0.5	\$	625.00	\$	312.50
2/20/2020	Abrahamson Lynsey Major	LXM	mediation. Draft correspondence to Named Plaintiff R. Seltz re	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
2/20/2020	Lyrisey Major	LXIVI	notice of substitution and send same via DocuSign.	0.5	ľ	270.00	Ψ	01.00
2/20/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review counsel substitution form.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
2/20/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Record class member's inquiry.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
2/20/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with LBB, MJF re follow up re class member's inquiry.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
2/21/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save executed notice of substitution to case file and update re attorney signatures.	0.5	\$	270.00	\$	135.00
2/21/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	File substitution of counsel.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
2/21/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save docketed file substitution of counsel to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
2/21/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re complaint filed in related Colorado case.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
2/21/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS, co-counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
2/21/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review Bursey v. Cushman complaint.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
2/21/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re Bursey v. Cushman complaint review.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
2/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review edits to declaration from co-counsel; correspondence with LBB, SJA re same.	0.6	\$	350.00	\$	210.00
2/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conduct intake with potential declarant for 216(b) motion T. Simone.	0.6	\$	350.00	\$	210.00
2/24/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review co-counsel's revisions to declarations in advance of meeting with MJF.	0.4	\$	270.00	\$	108.00
2/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with LBB, MJF re 216(b) motion and litigation strategy.	0.3	\$	625.00	\$	187.50
2/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with SJA, LBB re 216(b) motion and litigation strategy.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
2/24/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA, LH re strategy for settlement negotiations.	0.2	\$	990.00	\$	198.00
2/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS, L. Ho re mediation.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
2/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA, LXM re finalizing declarations.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
2/24/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA, L. Ho re mediation.	0.2	\$	990.00	\$	198.00
2/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re intakes.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
2/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re additional intakes.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
2/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit 216(b) declarations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
2/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re edited declarations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
2/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review intake.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
2/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re intake review.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
2/24/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar internal meeting re declaration project.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
2/25/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update declarations per co-counsel's revisions; correspondence with MJF re substantive edits.	2.3	\$	270.00	\$	621.00
2/25/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise declarations incorporating edits from co- counsel; correspondence with LXM, SJA, clients re same.	0.7	\$	350.00	\$	245.00
2/25/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with Plaintiff E. Hix to finalize declaration.	0.6	\$	350.00	\$	210.00
2/25/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with Opt-In Plaintiff E. Hix to revise declaration in support of 216(b).	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
		1	provide deciaration in Support of 210(b).	<u> </u>	1			

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 70 of 124

Correspondence to MJF re same.							
	2/25/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	, and the second	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
22552000 Lynsey Major LM Selegations in support of 2198 motion.	2/25/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	'	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
2255/2020 Sally J. SAL Correspondence with NLF LBB re-class member D. \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00	2/25/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with MJF re finalizing	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
Abrahamson	2/25/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF, LBB re class member	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2262/2020 Lynsey Mejor Lym M.F. Conduct intake with potential 216(b) declarant. 0.5 \$ 350.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 226/2020 Lynsey Mejor LYM Francisconduction with MJF or samu. 0.5 \$ 350.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 226/2020 Lynsey Mejor LYM Francisconduction with MJF or samu. 0.4 \$ 270.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 226/2020 Lynsey Mejor LYM Francisconduction with MJF or samu. 0.3 \$ 270.00 \$ 81.00 \$ 226/2020 Lynsey Mejor LYM Correspondence with LMR restricted for the clearant of interviews. Lynsey Mejor LYM Correspondence with LMR restricted for the clearant Lynsey Mejor LYM Correspondence with declarant interviews. Lynsey Mejor LYM Correspondence with Lynsey Mejor LYM Corres	2/25/2020	,	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re declarations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2265/2020 Lynsey Major LYM Revise Plaintiff R. Seltz's declaration; 0.8 \$ 270.00 \$ 216.00 \$ 2266/2020 Moley J. Frandsen MJF Conduct Inske with potential 27(6) declarant. 0.5 \$ 350.00 \$ 105.00 \$ 105.00 \$ 2266/2020 Lynsey Major LYM Enter review and revise E. Hicks deplaration; 0.4 \$ 270.00 \$ 105.00 \$ 2266/2020 Lynsey Major LYM Enter review and revise E. Hicks deplaration; 0.4 \$ 270.00 \$ 81.00 \$ 2660/2020 Lynsey Major LYM Enter review and revise E. Hicks deplaration; 0.3 \$ 270.00 \$ 81.00 \$ 2266/2020 Lynsey Major LYM Deptate inskel log re status of declarations and intakes. Lynsey Major LYM Deptate inskel log re status of declarations and intakes. Lynsey Major LYM Deptate inskel log re status of declarations and intakes. Lynsey Major LYM Deptate inskel log re status of declarations and intakes. Lynsey Major LYM Deptate inskel log re status of declarations and intakes. Lynsey Major LYM Correspondence with JMS re settlement strategy. Lynsey Major LYM Correspondence with declarant re setting up call. Lynsey Major LYM Correspondence with declarants re revising Lynsey Major LYM Revise Plaintiff R. Seltz's declaration. Lynsey Major LYM Revise Diling agreement. Lynsey Major LYM Revise D	2/26/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise and format 216(b) declarations.	2.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 621.00
	2/26/2020		LXM	,		270.00	
Lynsey Major	2/26/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	·	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
facts	2/26/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM		0.4	270.00	108.00
Counsel: correspondence with LXM, LBB, SJA re	2/26/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM		0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
Intakes	2/26/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	counsel; correspondence with LXM, LBB, SJA re	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
Lynsey Major	2/26/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	·	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
Sally J. Sally J. Sally J. Sally J. Correspondence with declarant re setting up call. 1.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 \$	2/26/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with LBB re further declarant	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
Molly J. Frandsen MJF	2/26/2020	1 2	SJA		0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
Molly J. Frandsen MJF	2/26/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with declarant re setting up call.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
declaration: correspondence with SJA re same.	2/26/2020			Correspondence with declarants re revising	0.1	350.00	\$
Sally J. SJA Edit tolling agreement; correspondence with co- counsel re same. Counsel re same.	2/27/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.9	\$ 350.00	\$ 315.00
Abrahamson	2/27/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise Plaintiff R. Seltz's declaration.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
Part	2/27/2020	Sally J.	SJA		0.3	\$ 625.00	\$ 187.50
Abrahamson	2/27/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM		0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
Abrahamson Settlement. Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re setting up call re declaration. Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re setting up call re declaration. S 270.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 27	2/27/2020		SJA		0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
Call re declaration.	2/27/2020		SJA		0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2/27/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA re revised tolling agreement. 0.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 350.00 2/28/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Proof, finalize, and send declarations to declarants for verification. 2.0 \$ 270.00 \$ 540.00 2/28/2020 Molly J. Frandsen Abrahamson MJF Finalize declarations and supervise LXM to send them to declarants via DocuSign for signature. 0.6 \$ 350.00 \$ 210.00 2/28/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Edit 216b motion. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 125.00 2/28/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Edit tolling agreement; correspondence with MJF re declarations. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 2/28/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with MJF re declarations. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 2/28/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Check docket for settlement order in related case. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 2/28/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with SJA re docket alerts. 0.1 \$ 290.00 \$ 990.00 3/2/2020 Lynsey Major	2/27/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM		0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2/27/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA re revised tolling agreement. 0.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 350.00 2/28/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Proof, finalize, and send declarations to declarants for verification. 2.0 \$ 270.00 \$ 540.00 2/28/2020 Molly J. Frandsen Abrahamson MJF Finalize declarations and supervise LXM to send them to declarants via DocuSign for signature. 0.6 \$ 350.00 \$ 210.00 2/28/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Edit 216b motion. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 125.00 2/28/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Edit tolling agreement; correspondence with MJF re declarations. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 2/28/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with MJF re declarations. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 2/28/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Check docket for settlement order in related case. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 2/28/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with SJA re docket alerts. 0.1 \$ 290.00 \$ 990.00 3/2/2020 Lynsey Major	2/27/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise tolling agreement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
For verification. Finalize declarations and supervise LXM to send them to declarants via DocuSign for signature. Corespondence with MJF redeclarations. Corespondence with SJA redecket alerts. Corespondence with SJA redecket alerts. Corespondence with SJA redeclarations.	2/27/2020		MJF	Correspondence with SJA re revised tolling	0.1	350.00	\$ 35.00
Sally J. SJA Edit 216b motion. 0.2 \$625.00 \$125.00	2/28/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM		2.0	\$ 270.00	\$ 540.00
Abrahamson Sally J. SJA Edit tolling agreement; correspondence with 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 125.00	2/28/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00
Abrahamson Opposing counsel re same.	2/28/2020	-	SJA	Edit 216b motion.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
2/28/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with MJF re declarations. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 2/28/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Check docket for settlement order in related case. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 2/28/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with SJA re docket alerts. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 2/28/2020 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re contact with potential client. 0.1 \$ 990.00 \$ 99.00 3/2/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Revise declarations of plaintiffs E. Hix and K. Pierno. 1.3 \$ 270.00 \$ 351.00 3/2/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conduct intake with potential declarant [REDACTED]; correspondence with SJA re same. 1.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 420.00 3/2/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review intakes with non-junior appraisers; correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re same. 0.6 \$ 350.00 \$ 210.00 3/2/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with LXM, SJA re clients' edits to declaration. 0.6 \$ 350.00 \$ 210.00 3/2/2020 Sa	2/28/2020	1 2	SJA		0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
2/28/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with SJA re docket alerts. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 2/28/2020 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re contact with potential client. 0.1 \$ 990.00 \$ 99.00 3/2/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Revise declarations of plaintiffs E. Hix and K. Pierno. 1.3 \$ 270.00 \$ 351.00 3/2/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conduct intake with potential declarant [REDACTED]; correspondence with SJA re same. 1.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 420.00 3/2/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review intakes with non-junior appraisers; correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re same. 0.6 \$ 350.00 \$ 210.00 3/2/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with LXM, SJA re clients' edits to declaration. 0.6 \$ 350.00 \$ 210.00 3/2/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Finalize tolling agreement; correspondence with corresp	2/28/2020	Sally J.	SJA		0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
2/28/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with SJA re docket alerts. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 2/28/2020 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re contact with potential client. 0.1 \$ 990.00 \$ 99.00 3/2/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Revise declarations of plaintiffs E. Hix and K. Pierno. 1.3 \$ 270.00 \$ 351.00 3/2/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conduct intake with potential declarant [REDACTED]; correspondence with SJA re same. 1.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 420.00 3/2/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review intakes with non-junior appraisers; correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re same. 0.6 \$ 350.00 \$ 210.00 3/2/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with LXM, SJA re clients' edits to declaration. 0.6 \$ 350.00 \$ 210.00 3/2/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Finalize tolling agreement; correspondence with corresp	2/28/2020		LXM	Check docket for settlement order in related case.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2/28/2020Justin SwartzJMSCorrespondence with SJA re contact with potential client.0.1\$ 990.00\$ 99.003/2/2020Lynsey MajorLXMRevise declarations of plaintiffs E. Hix and K. Pierno.1.3\$ 270.00\$ 351.003/2/2020Molly J. FrandsenMJFConduct intake with potential declarant [REDACTED]; correspondence with SJA re same.1.2\$ 350.00\$ 420.003/2/2020Molly J. FrandsenMJFReview intakes with non-junior appraisers; correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re same.0.6\$ 350.00\$ 210.003/2/2020Molly J. FrandsenMJFCorrespondence with LXM, SJA re clients' edits to declaration.0.6\$ 350.00\$ 210.003/2/2020Sally J. AbrahamsonSJAFinalize tolling agreement; correspondence with composing counsel re same.0.2\$ 625.00\$ 125.003/2/2020Sally J.SJACorrespondence with team re settlement0.1\$ 625.00\$ 62.50							
Pierno. Pier	2/28/2020		JMS	Correspondence with SJA re contact with potential	0.1	\$	
[REDACTED]; correspondence with SJA re same. 3/2/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review intakes with non-junior appraisers; correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re same. 3/2/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with LXM, SJA re clients' edits to declaration. 3/2/2020 Sally J. SJA Finalize tolling agreement; correspondence with Opposing counsel re same. 3/2/2020 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with team re settlement 0.1 \$625.00 \$62.50	3/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM		1.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 351.00
3/2/2020Molly J. FrandsenMJFReview intakes with non-junior appraisers; correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re same.0.6\$ 350.00\$ 210.003/2/2020Molly J. FrandsenMJFCorrespondence with LXM, SJA re clients' edits to declaration.0.6\$ 350.00\$ 210.003/2/2020Sally J. AbrahamsonSJAFinalize tolling agreement; correspondence with opposing counsel re same.0.2\$ 625.00\$ 125.003/2/2020Sally J.SJACorrespondence with team re settlement0.1\$ 625.00\$ 62.50	3/2/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		1.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 420.00
3/2/2020Molly J. FrandsenMJFCorrespondence with LXM, SJA re clients' edits to declaration.0.6\$ 350.00\$ 210.003/2/2020Sally J. AbrahamsonSJAFinalize tolling agreement; correspondence with opposing counsel re same.0.2\$ 625.00\$ 125.003/2/2020Sally J.SJACorrespondence with team re settlement0.1\$ 625.00\$ 62.50	3/2/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review intakes with non-junior appraisers;	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00
Abrahamson opposing counsel re same. 0.1 \$625.00 \$625.00 3/2/2020 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with team re settlement 0.1 \$625.00 \$625.00	3/2/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM, SJA re clients' edits to	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00
3/2/2020 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with team re settlement 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50	3/2/2020		SJA	Finalize tolling agreement; correspondence with	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	3/2/2020		SJA	•	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 71 of 124

3/2/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re declaration edits.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
3/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re revisions to Plaintiff R Setlz's declaration.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
3/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Void Plaintiff R. Seltz's current declaration.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
3/2/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review settlement correspondence.	0.1	\$	990.00		99.00
3/2/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re settlement review correspondence.	0.1	\$	990.00	Ľ	99.00
3/3/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Finalize declarations and issue for signature.	0.5	\$	270.00		135.00
3/3/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise declarations based on edits from Plaintiff R. Seltz; correspondence with SJA, LXM re same.	0.4	\$	350.00		140.00
3/3/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz re revisions to declaration in support of 216(b).	0.3	\$	350.00	Ċ	105.00
3/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit 216(b) declaration.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
3/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with Plaintiff P. Bursey.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
3/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re call with Plaintiff P. Bursey follow-up.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
3/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Leave voicemail for Plaintiff P. Bursey.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
3/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit Plaintiff R. Seltz's declaration.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
3/3/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Record SJA call note in log.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
3/3/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save executed declaration of Plaintiff R. Seltz to	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
3/3/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	case file. Correspondence with potential opt-in re scheduling	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
3/4/2020	Sally J.	SJA	follow up call. Correspondence with MJF re Plaintiff E. Hix.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
	Abrahamson		·				Ů	
3/4/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save tolling agreement to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
3/4/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re declarations in support of class cert motion.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
3/4/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Void declaration of Plaintiff E. Hix.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
3/4/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with Plaintiff E. Hix re declaration.	0.1	\$	350.00		35.00
3/5/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re settlement strategy.	0.3	\$	625.00	\$	187.50
3/5/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re class certification preparation.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
3/5/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re declarants.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
3/5/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA, LXM, Plaintiff E. Hix re mediation and declarations.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
3/5/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with declarant K. Pierno re declaration and potential mediation.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
3/6/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with [REDACTED].	0.1	S	350.00	\$	35.00
3/6/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM, SJA re call with [REDACTED].	0.1	\$	350.00		35.00
3/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update consent form.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
3/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Transmit updated consent form to opt-in plaintiff.	0.2	\$	270.00		54.00
3/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Void declaration.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
3/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with opt-in plaintiff re void declaration.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
3/9/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence re scheduling mediation.	0.1	\$	990.00		99.00
3/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re pending declaration, opt-in plaintiff's query.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
3/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update tracker re consent form.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
3/9/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA, LXM, client re gathering 216(b) declarations and potential mediation.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
3/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with K. Pierno re rescheduling call.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
3/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
3/16/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA, LBB re potential mediation and canceling team call.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
3/16/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review settlement correspondence and prior settlement correspondence.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
3/17/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
3/23/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA re no mediation update.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
3/26/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Cancel DocuSign re consent to join.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
J, _J, _U_U	i – i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i	-/ XIVI	1 5 a. 1001 Double gri To dolloom to John.	1	Ψ.	_ 0.00	ıΨ	_,.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 72 of 124

3/26/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF and opt-in re canceled	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
2/27/2020	Deinder A Armer	DAA	DocuSign re consent to join.	0.4	 000.00	Φ.	60.00
3/27/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from SJA re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/30/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Telephone conference with mediator.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
4/4/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review settlement correspondence and prior correspondence.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
4/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re settlement negotiation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/13/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel and co- counsel re meet and confer.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/13/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re meet and confer.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/13/2020	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re strategy.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/14/2020	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re settlement	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
4/14/2020	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	negotiations. Correspondence with team re meeting with	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/14/2020	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	opposing counsel. Correspondence with opposing counsel re Bursey v.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
	Abrahamson		Cushman case.				
4/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise docket alert settings.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
4/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re docket alert settings revision.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
4/14/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re Bursey v. Cushman case progression.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/15/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re strategy.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/15/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re Bursey v. Cushman case.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/15/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review Bursey v. Cushman case docket.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
4/15/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re strategy for Bursey v. Cushman case docket.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
4/16/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save notice of withdrawal to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
4/16/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case memo re notice of withdrawal.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
4/17/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/17/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review docket entry in related case.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
4/17/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re reviewal of docket entry in related case.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
4/17/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review documents filed in the Colorado Bursey v. Cushman case.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
4/20/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case memo.	0.7	\$ 270.00	\$	189.00
4/20/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with docket support, SJA re docket alerts in related cases; review dockets and notifications; and revise docket alerts.	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$	135.00
4/20/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review docket and motion for summary judgment, and save to case file.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
4/20/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re 216b motion in Bursey v. Cushman case.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/20/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/20/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re Bursey v. Cushman case docket.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/20/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re docket entry and	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
4/22/2020	Sally J.	SJA	Bursey v. Cushman case issues. Review Court order in related case.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/22/2020	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with team re reviewal of Court	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
4/22/2020	Abrahamson Lynsey Major	LXM	order. Review scheduling order in related case and save	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
4/22/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	to case file. Review correspondence between SJA, JMS, and co	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
4/22/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	counsel re Bursey v. Cushman. Review correspondence re Bursey v. Cushman	0.1	\$ 990.00		99.00
4/22/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	status. Correspondence with team re strategy for Bursey v.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
			Cushman case.				
4/27/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 625.00	Ф	62.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 73 of 124

4/07/0000	Io-II 1	Io ia	10	10.4	——————————————————————————————————————	005.00	Δ.	
4/27/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re correspondence from opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
4/28/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
4/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with co-counsel, opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.3	\$	625.00	\$	187.50
4/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review Bursey Court order.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
4/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team and opposing counsel re Bursey Court order.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
4/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from SJA re conference with Defendant.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
4/29/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
4/30/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar court hearing in related case.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
5/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save orders in related case setting trial dates and staying summary judgment briefing to case file.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
5/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re meet and confer.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/8/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review settlement correspondence.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
5/8/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re settlement correspondence.	0.1	\$	990.00		99.00
5/11/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with client.	0.5	\$	625.00	\$	312.50
5/11/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Leave voicemail for client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/13/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel and L. Ho re settlement negotiations.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
5/13/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with L. Ho re settlement negotiation strategy.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
5/15/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/19/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft email to opposing counsel re stipulating to conditional certification.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
5/19/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/19/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from SJA re conference with Defendant.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
5/19/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
5/20/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re potential stipulation with Defendant.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/21/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA re restarting litigation.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
5/22/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review memo drafted by DAA re summary of case.	0.9	\$	350.00	\$	315.00
5/22/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with MJF, co-counsel re discovery and follow-up email with opposing counsel.	0.5	\$	625.00	\$	312.50
5/22/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SJA, co-counsel re discovery and follow-up email with opposing	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
5/26/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	counsel. Review memo from DAA and draft 216(b) motion and declarations to prepare for conference with SJA	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
5/26/2020	Sally J.	SJA	re resuming litigation and discovery. Telephone conference with MJF, co-counsel re	0.4	\$	625.00	\$	250.00
5/26/2020	Abrahamson Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	scheduling order, 216(b) and resuming discovery. Telephone conference with SJA, co-counsel re	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
5/26/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	scheduling order, 216(b) and resuming discovery. Draft motion to amend scheduling order.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
5/26/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with L. Ho re discovery deadlines.	0.1	\$	625.00		62.50
5/27/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and draft motion to amend scheduling order.	2.1	\$	350.00	\$	735.00
5/27/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondences from SJA re status of negotiations.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
5/27/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re motion for extension.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/27/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review opposing counsel edits to scheduling stipulation.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/27/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel, L. Ho re motion for extension.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
5/28/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft motion to amend scheduling order and proposed order; correspondence with SJA, L. Ho re same.	1.4	\$	350.00	\$	490.00
		1		<u>. </u>				

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 74 of 124

5/28/2020	Sally J.	SJA	Edit scheduling order motion; correspondence with	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$	250.00
5,00,100,00	Abrahamson	0.14	MJF re same.	0.4	205.00		00.50
5/28/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re motion for extension.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
5/28/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re motion for extension.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
5/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise motion to amend scheduling order incorporating edits from Defense counsel; supervise LXM to file.	1.4	\$ 350.00	\$	490.00
5/29/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise motion to amend scheduling order.	0.7	\$ 270.00	\$	189.00
5/29/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Finalize, file, and save docketed motion to amend scheduling order.	0.6	\$ 270.00	\$	162.00
5/29/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review local rules and Judge Howell's standing order; correspondence with MJF re same.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
5/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review Defendant's edits to joint motion.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
5/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re Defendant's edits to joint motion.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
5/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re filing motion for extension.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
5/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re filing motion.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
5/29/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save scheduling motion and order in related case.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
5/29/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re saved scheduling motion and order in related case.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
6/1/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review case management schedule and chart deadlines in related case.	0.7	\$ 270.00	\$	189.00
6/1/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review motions to withdraw; correspondence with BXS, MJF re same.	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$	135.00
6/1/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM, BSX re filing notice of withdrawal for LBB.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
6/3/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review scheduling order, chart deadlines, and calendar same.	0.7	\$ 270.00	\$	189.00
6/3/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar case management deadlines in related	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
6/8/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review discovery produced and create agenda for	1.4	\$ 350.00	\$	490.00
6/9/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	conference with SJA. Review discovery; correspondence with SJA, co-	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
6/9/2020	Sally J.	SJA	counsel re same. Telephone conference with MJF re conditional cert	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$	250.00
6/9/2020	Abrahamson Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	motion and resuming discovery. Telephone conference with SJA re conditional cert	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
6/9/2020	Sally J.	SJA	motion and resuming discovery. Review discovery, correspondence with MJF re	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$	187.50
6/9/2020	Abrahamson Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	same. Telephone conference with SJA and co-counsel re	0.2	\$ 350.00	æ	105.00
			conditional cert motion and resuming discovery.				
6/9/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MXF re discovery strategy.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/9/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re conditional certification.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/9/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with declarants re calls to discuss conditional cert motion/declarations.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
6/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with opt-in plaintiff K. Pierno re 216(b) declaration; prepare declaration; correspondence with SJA re same.	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$	245.00
6/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM, SJA re resuming discovery.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
6/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review previous declaration of Plaintiff K. Pierno.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
6/11/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Draft proof chart.	0.8	\$ 625.00	\$	500.00
6/11/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Format and edit 216(b) declaration and send to declarant for signature.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
6/11/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Transfer document production to co-counsel.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
6/11/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with CCA, SJA, co-counsel re sending intakes and productions to co-counsel.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
6/11/2020	Sally J.	SJA	Review edits to 216(b) declaration.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/11/2020	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re edits to 216(b)	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/11/2020	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	declaration. Correspondence with MJF re document production	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
	Abrahamson		from Defendant.	<u> </u>			

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 75 of 124

Correspondence with team or file transfer protocol								
Polendamin productions to co-counsel	6/11/2020	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Transfer Defendant productions to co-counsel.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
Selection Sele	6/11/2020	Christopher C. Alter	CCA		0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
Pierro P	6/11/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with Plaintiff E. Hix .	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
deciaration; carrespondence with LMA and SJA re	6/11/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
61122020	6/12/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	declaration; correspondence with LXM and SJA re	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
Sally J. Sally J. SALA Correspondence with MJF re 216(b) declaration. 0.1 S 625.00 S 62.50 S 6125020 Sally J. SALA Correspondence with opposing counsel. 0.1 S 625.00 S 62.50 S	6/12/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Proof, finalize, and send declaration for signature.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
Abrahamson								54.00
Abrahamson Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review discovery to draft deficiency letter; 2.2 \$ 550,00 \$ 770.00 \$ 6175/2020 Uynsey Major XM Review discovery to draft deficiency letter; 2.2 \$ 270,00 \$ 594.00 \$ 6175/2020 Sally J. SJA Conference with opposing course fire settlement 0.3 \$ 625.00 \$ 187.51 \$ 6175/2020 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with theam re same. 0.3 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 \$ 6175/2020 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with MJF re discovery. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 \$ 6175/2020 Uynsey Major LYM Correspondence with MJF re discovery. 0.1 \$ 270,00 \$ 27.		Abrahamson						62.50
	6/12/2020			Correspondence with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
Sally J. Sally Correspondence with Sally J. Sally	6/15/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		2.2	\$ 350.00	\$	770.00
Abrahamson	6/15/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM		2.2	\$ 270.00	\$	594.00
Sally J. Sally J. Correspondence with MJF re discovery. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.51	6/15/2020		SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re settlement negotiations; correspondence with team re same.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$	187.50
Lynsey Major LXM	6/15/2020	,	SJA		0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
Lynsey Major LXM	6/15/2020		LXM	Save clean copy of class list to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review discovery and draft deficiency letter; 3.9 \$ 350.00 \$ 1,365.00 \$ 1				Correspondence with MJF re saved clean copy of				27.00
Sally J. Abrahamson	6/16/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review discovery and draft deficiency letter;	3.9	\$ 350.00	\$	1,365.00
Sally J. SAL Telephone conference with MJF re discovery 0.3 \$625.00 \$187.55	6/16/2020		SJA		0.5	\$ 625.00	\$	312.50
Molly J. Frandsen M.JF Telephone conference with SJA re discovery deficiency letter and 216(b) motion. 3 350.00 105.00 6/16/2020 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with Plaintiff. 0.1 5 625.00 5 62.50 6/17/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Revise discovery deficiency email; correspondence 0.4 3 350.00 3 140.00 3 3 3 3 3 3 3 3 3	6/16/2020	Sally J.	SJA		0.3	\$ 625.00	\$	187.50
Sally J. Abrahamson Abrah	6/16/2020		MJF	Telephone conference with SJA re discovery	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
6/17/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Revise discovery deficiency email; correspondence 0.4 \$ 350.00 \$ 140.00	6/16/2020		SJA		0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62,50
Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Edit discovery deficiency letter. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.5i	6/17/2020		MJF	Revise discovery deficiency email; correspondence	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
6/17/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson Abrahamson Abrahamson Abrahamson Calendar Defendant's deadline to respond to deficiencies. Calendar Defendant's deadline to respond to deficiencies. Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with opposing counsel re meet and 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.5i	6/17/2020		SJA	Edit discovery deficiency letter.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
Calendar Defendant's deadline to respond to deficiencies. Sally J.	6/17/2020	Sally J.	SJA		0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/22/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with opposing counsel re meet and 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/22/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with MJF re class cert filing timeline. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 6/22/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with LXM re 216(b) motion. 0.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 350.00 6/23/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re discovery 0.3 \$ 350.00 \$ 350.00 \$ 105.00 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Conference with opposing counsel re discovery. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 125.00 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with team re next steps re call with Abrahamson 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re potential conflict. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Draft email to opposing counsel re discovery. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/24/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence	6/18/2020		LXM	Calendar Defendant's deadline to respond to	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
6/22/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with MJF re class cert filing timeline. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 6/22/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with LXM re 216(b) motion. 0.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 350.0	6/22/2020	A 1 1	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re meet and	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/22/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with LXM re 216(b) motion. 0.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 35.00 6/23/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re discovery deficiencies. 0.3 \$ 350.00 \$ 105.00 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Conference with opposing counsel re discovery. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with L. Ho re discovery. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with team re next steps re call with 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re potential conflict. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Draft email to opposing counsel re discovery. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/24/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA re discovery deficiency and 216(b) motion. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 6/24/2020 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence wi	6/22/2020		LXM	Correspondence with MJF re class cert filing	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
6/23/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re discovery deficiencies. 0.3 \$ 350.00 \$ 105.00 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Conference with opposing counsel re discovery. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 125.00 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Conference with L. Ho re discovery. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with team re next steps re call with 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re potential conflict. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Draft email to opposing counsel re discovery. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 125.00 6/24/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA re discovery deficiency and 216(b) motion. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 6/24/2020 Justin Swartz JMS Correspo	0/00/0000	Malle I Francisco	NA IE		0.4	 250.00	Φ.	25.00
6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Conference with opposing counsel re discovery. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 125.00 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with L. Ho re discovery. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with team re next steps re call with L. Ho. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re potential conflict. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Draft email to opposing counsel re discovery. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 125.00 6/24/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA re discovery deficiency and 216(b) motion. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/24/2020 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re scope of potential settlement class. 0.1 \$ 990.00 \$ 99.00 6/25/2020 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondences re discovery disputes, mediation discussions. 0.2 \$ 600.00 \$ 120.00				Correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re discovery				105.00
6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Conference with L. Ho re discovery. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with team re next steps re call with L. Ho. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re potential conflict. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Draft email to opposing counsel re discovery. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 125.00 6/24/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA re discovery deficiency and 216(b) motion. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/24/2020 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re scope of potential settlement class. 0.1 \$ 990.00 \$ 99.00 6/25/2020 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondences re discovery disputes, mediation discussions. 0.2 \$ 600.00 \$ 120.00 6/25/2020 Lynsey Major	6/23/2020		SJA		0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA L. Ho. Correspondence with team re next steps re call with 0.1 0.1 \$ 625.00 62.50 6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re potential conflict. 0.1 \$ 625.00 62.50 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Draft email to opposing counsel re discovery. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 125.00 6/24/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA re discovery deficiency and 216(b) motion. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00 6/24/2020 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re scope of potential settlement class. 0.1 \$ 990.00 \$ 99.00 6/25/2020 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondences re discovery disputes, mediation discussions. 0.2 \$ 600.00 \$ 120.00 6/25/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Save notice of consent form filing in related case. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 6/26/2020 Sally J.	6/23/2020	Sally J.	SJA	Conference with L. Ho re discovery.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/23/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re potential conflict. 0.1 \$625.00 \$62.50 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Draft email to opposing counsel re discovery. 0.2 \$625.00 \$125.00 6/24/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA re discovery deficiency and 216(b) motion. 0.2 \$350.00 \$70.00 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$625.00 \$62.50 6/24/2020 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re scope of potential settlement class. 0.1 \$990.00 \$99.00 6/25/2020 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondences re discovery disputes, mediation discussions. 0.2 \$600.00 \$120.00 6/25/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Save notice of consent form filling in related case. 0.1 \$270.00 \$27.00 6/26/2020 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$625.00 \$625.00	6/23/2020	Sally J.	SJA	·	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Draft email to opposing counsel re discovery. 0.2 \$ 625.00 \$ 125.00 6/24/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA re discovery deficiency and 216(b) motion. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/24/2020 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re scope of potential settlement class. 0.1 \$ 990.00 \$ 99.00 6/25/2020 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondences re discovery disputes, mediation discussions. 0.2 \$ 600.00 \$ 120.00 6/25/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Save notice of consent form filing in related case. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 6/26/2020 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00	6/23/2020	Sally J.	SJA		0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
6/24/2020 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with SJA re discovery deficiency and 216(b) motion. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 6/24/2020 Sally J. Abrahamson SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50 6/24/2020 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re scope of potential settlement class. 0.1 \$ 990.00 \$ 99.00 6/25/2020 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondences re discovery disputes, mediation discussions. 0.2 \$ 600.00 \$ 120.00 6/25/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Save notice of consent form filing in related case. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 6/26/2020 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00	6/24/2020	Sally J.	SJA	Draft email to opposing counsel re discovery.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
and 216(b) motion.	6/24/2020		MJF	Correspondence with SJA re discovery deficiency	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
Abrahamson 6/24/2020 Justin Swartz JMS Correspondence with SJA re scope of potential settlement class. 6/25/2020 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondences re discovery disputes, mediation discussions. 6/25/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Save notice of consent form filing in related case. 6/26/2020 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$990.00 \$99.00 \$99.00 \$00 \$120.00 \$27	6/24/2020	•	SIA	and 216(b) motion.	0.1			62.50
6/25/2020 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondences re discovery disputes, mediation discussions. 0.2 \$ 600.00 \$ 120.00 6/25/2020 Lynsey Major LXM Save notice of consent form filling in related case. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00 6/26/2020 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 625.00		Abrahamson						
mediation discussions.				settlement class.				
6/26/2020 Sally J. SJA Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ 62.50				mediation discussions.				120.00
								27.00
Abrahamosh	6/26/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re litigation strategy.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 76 of 124

6/26/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re 216(b) motion.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
6/26/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re potential conflict issue.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Edit 216(b) and research supporting documents, including whether to file exhibits under motion to seal; correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re same.	1.7	\$	350.00	\$	595.00
6/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research questions from co-counsel re 216(b) motion to prepare for internal conference.	0.6	\$	350.00	\$	210.00
6/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with MJF re 216(b) motion and litigation strategy.	0.4	\$	625.00	\$	250.00
6/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with SJA re 216(b) motion and litigation strategy.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
6/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit motion for conditional certification.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
6/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with client.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/30/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise 216(b) motion and prepare supporting documents; correspondence with SJA re same.	1.9	\$	350.00	\$	665.00
6/30/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with MJF, co-counsel re litigation and settlement negotiations.	0.7	\$	625.00	\$	437.50
6/30/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with SJA, co-counsel re litigation and settlement negotiations.	0.7	\$	350.00	\$	245.00
6/30/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re litigation strategy.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/30/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with MJF, co-counsel re 216(b) motion.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
6/30/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with SJA, co-counsel re 216(b) motion.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
7/1/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review discovery to determine whether to include salary basis test in motion; correspondence with SJA, LXM re supporting documents.	1.9	\$	350.00	\$	665.00
7/1/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant production to case file, proof; correspondence with MJF re same.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
7/1/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise 216(b) motion; correspondence with cite checkers re same.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
7/1/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re discovery.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62,50
7/1/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM, SJA re discovery production.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
7/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare exhibits and proof re confidentiality for class certification motion, and check local rules re motion filing requirements.	2.1	\$	270.00	\$	567.00
7/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft notice of motion and SJA declaration in support of class certification motions.	2.0	\$	270.00	\$	540.00
7/2/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise 216(b) motion and supporting documents; supervise LXM to create exhibits; correspondence with SJA, LXM re same.	1.8	\$	350.00	\$	630.00
7/2/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit conditional certification documents.	1.6	\$	625.00	\$	1,000.00
7/2/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re motion for conditional certification.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review correspondence re class list production dates.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re correspondence re class list production dates.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/5/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review 216(b) motion in Dixon v. Cushman; draft summary and correspondence to SJA re same with proposals to revise Plaintiff R. Seltz motion.	1.5	\$	350.00	\$	525.00
7/6/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise motion incorporating final edits from co- counsel, cite check edits, and cites to exhibits and declarations.	5.3	\$	350.00	\$	1,855.00
7/6/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review local rules, electronic case file instructions, parties' stipulation re confidentiality, court orders re sealing, and research sealing motions granted by Judge Howell.	1.4	\$	270.00	\$	378.00
7/6/2020 7/6/2020	Lynsey Major Lynsey Major	LXM LXM	Draft motion to seal, proposed order, and exhibit. Prepare filing map for class certification motion.	1.0 0.5	\$ \$	270.00 270.00	\$ \$	270.00 135.00
7/6/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with MJF re motion to seal and class certification filings.	0.5	\$			135.00
			Janu class certification minus.					

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 77 of 124

7/6/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise LXM to draft motion to seal; revise same.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
7/6/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with MJF re 216b motion and discovery.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$ 187.50
7/6/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SJA re 216(b) motion and discovery.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
7/6/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re litigation strategy.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/6/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Dixon counsel re schedule.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/6/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re motion to seal.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/6/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re motion to seal.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/6/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM re Defendant's discovery production.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
7/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise 216(b) motion incorporating edits from SJA and co-counsel; correspondence with SJA re same.	1.7	\$ 350.00	\$ 595.00
7/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise and finalize proposed order, notice, consent to join forms, and reminder notice incorporating edits from co-counsel.	1.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 420.00
7/7/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit 216b documents.	1.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 687.50
7/7/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Further prepare and format exhibits for class certification motion; correspondence with MJF re same.	0.8	\$ 270.00	\$ 216.00
7/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise SJA declaration in support of 216(b) motion drafted by LXM.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00
7/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise motion to seal; correspondence with SJA, LXM re same.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
7/7/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit proposed order.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$ 250.00
7/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft correspondence to LXM, SJA re filing plan and finalize exhibits for 216(b) motion.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
7/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise notice of motion and proposed order drafted by LXM and LBB.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
7/7/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit motion to seal.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/7/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re 216b motion.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/7/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with IT re update to case listserv.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/8/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise filing of 216(b) motion, review LXM proof and table of contents; review and finalize notice of motion, SJA declaration, supporting exhibits, and proposed order.	4.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 1,610.00
7/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise and finalize class certification briefing and exhibits; correspondence with MJF re same.	3.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 837.00
7/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Proof and format memorandum in support of class certification.	2.0	\$ 270.00	\$ 540.00
7/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare tables in conditional cert memorandum; proof same.	1.8	\$ 270.00	\$ 486.00
7/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Finalize and file sealing motion.	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$ 135.00
7/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit notices to collective.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$ 250.00
7/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	File class certification motion.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
7/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit 216(b) declaration.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit 216(b)proposed order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re exhibits to 216b motion.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant's production to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/8/2020			Correspondence with IT, SJA re Defendant's saved	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/8/2020 7/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	production to case file.			
	Lynsey Major Lynsey Major	LXM	production to case file. Correspondence with Defendant re sealed exhibit.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/8/2020				0.1	\$ 270.00 270.00	27.00 216.00
7/8/2020 7/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with Defendant re sealed exhibit. Save Plaintiff R. Seltz and Dixon class certification briefings to case file. Review order to move for briefing schedule;			
7/8/2020 7/8/2020 7/9/2020	Lynsey Major Lynsey Major	LXM LXM	Correspondence with Defendant re sealed exhibit. Save Plaintiff R. Seltz and Dixon class certification briefings to case file.	0.8	\$ 270.00	\$ 216.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 78 of 124

7/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save privilege log to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar meeting to discuss discovery.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save order re briefing schedule to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	27.00
7/10/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save unredacted Dixon v. Cushman filing to case file.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
7/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA and LXM re motion to set briefing schedule.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
7/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Format and revise parties stipulation into motion and proposed order.	0.9	\$ 270.00	\$ 243.00
7/13/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review discovery production from Defendant; correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re same.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
7/13/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with MJF, LXM re litigation and discovery strategy.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$ 250.00
7/13/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review motion to set scheduling order and supervise LXM to file.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
7/13/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SJA, LXM re litigation and discovery strategy.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
7/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with SJA, MJF re litigation and discovery strategy.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
7/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Finalize motion setting class cert schedule; file same.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
7/13/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Create agenda for weekly team meeting.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
7/13/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/13/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/13/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re edited scheduling order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review standing order and local rules re motion for scheduling.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re stipulation and motion filings.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review privilege log for counsel.	1.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 378.00
7/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Format and run hot discovery document report.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
7/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save orders setting class certification briefing schedule to case file, and calendar same for Plaintiff R. Seltz and Dixon cases.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
7/14/2020	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Review and revise report settings in Nuix; correspondence with LXM re same.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
7/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with CCA re production report.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/14/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA, LXM re discovery and notice of withdrawal of LBB.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
7/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re Defendant production status.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review 216b briefing schedule.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
7/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re discovery, document productions.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
7/15/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM re notice of withdrawal.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
7/16/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft and format motion, declaration, and proposed order for MJF's pro hac vice admission.	1.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 297.00
7/16/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Further format privilege log re non-privileged correspondence.	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$ 135.00
7/16/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft notice of withdrawal re LBB.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
7/16/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with defense counsel re reproducing discovery in violation of E-discovery protocol.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
7/16/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review discovery correspondence.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
7/16/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re notice of withdrawal for LBB.	0.1	\$ 625.00	62.50
7/16/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM Re status of production.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
7/16/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant production to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/16/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with IT, SJA, MJF re transfer method and E-discovery.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
7/17/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise motion to withdraw LBB and motion for pro hac vice for MJF drafted by LXM; supervise LXM to file; correspondence with SJA re same.	0.9	\$ 350.00	\$ 315.00
7/17/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise notice of withdrawal; correspondence with MJF re revisions to same.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
7/17/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Finalize MJF's pro hac vice motion, and file same.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
7/17/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re inquiry from potential opt-in.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 79 of 124

7/47/2020	lo-u	IO IA	O	Io 4	—————	605.00	Ι φ	00.50
7/17/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re intakes.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/20/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save notice of withdrawal and MJF pro hac vice motion to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/20/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review order re pro hac vice application.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
7/21/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review new document production and draft summary for SJA.	0.9	\$	350.00	\$	315.00
7/21/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise LXM to draft notice of appearance.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
7/21/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Register MJF with Pacer for court filing, research local rules re appearance, and test filing.	0.4	\$	270.00	\$	108.00
7/21/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant production to case file and review for E-discovery compliance.	0.4	\$	270.00	\$	108.00
7/21/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft notice of appearance for MJF; correspondence re format of same.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
7/21/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with MJF re litigation strategy.	0.3	\$	625.00	\$	187.50
7/21/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with SJA re litigation strategy.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
7/21/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel re discovery	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
	·	LXM	strategy. Save order granting MJF's pro hac vice admission	0.1		270.00		27.00
7/21/2020	Lynsey Major		to case file.		\$		\$	
7/21/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with Defendant re production issues.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/22/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case memo re attorney admissions, Court rules, and passwords.	0.4	\$	270.00	\$	108.00
7/22/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Download Defendant production to case file, extract, proof; correspondence with CCA re same.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
7/22/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SJA and co-counsel re discovery strategy.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
7/22/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM, co-counsel re Defendant's discovery production.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
7/22/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with MJF and co-counsel re discovery strategy.	0.3	\$	625.00	\$	187.50
7/22/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Finalize and file MJF's notice of appearance.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
7/22/2020	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Import Defendant production to Nuix.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/22/2020	Christopher C. Alter	CCA	Correspondence with team re import Defendant production to Nuix.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/22/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re co-counsel access to Defendant production.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/22/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise LXM to file notice of appearance.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
7/22/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with SJA re potential conflict issue.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
7/23/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF, CCA re issues with Defendant production.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
7/23/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re E- discovery production.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/23/2020	Sara Olson	SXO	Correspondence with team re production on Nuix.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/23/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review discovery requests drafted by co-counsel.	0.1	\$	350.00		35.00
7/23/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel re discovery requests drafted by co-counsel.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
7/23/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft email to opposing counsel re discovery deficiencies.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
7/24/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Dixon v. Cushman discovery papers to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/24/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant production to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/24/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Label moot Defendant productions in case file.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
7/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re strategy.	0.1	\$	625.00		62.50
7/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with defense counsel re discovery deficiencies.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
7/27/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review discovery correspondence.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
7/27/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	625.00		62.50
7/27/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re litigation strategy.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
7/27/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re litigation strategy.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
7/27/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar internal deadline re Defendant's supplemental discovery responses.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/27/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review Defendant production re updated wage data.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/27/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA re conference with defense counsel and team meeting schedule.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
			detense counsel and team meeting schedule.				<u> </u>	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 80 of 124

7/28/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re electronic case filing account.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/28/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save correspondence with MJF re electronic case filing account to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/28/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review Defendant production.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
7/28/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re updated pay data.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
7/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel.	0.2	\$ 625.00		125.00
7/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with MJF re Defendant's consent to conditional certification and discovery strategy.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
7/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SJA re Defendant's consent to conditional certification and discovery strategy.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
7/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
7/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re litigation strategy.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
7/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re 216b notice.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
7/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review discovery productions and correspondence from LXM re same.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
7/30/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA, co-counsel re 216b reply in Dixon v. Cushman.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
8/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review Defendant's revisions and correspondence with team re response to Defendant.	0.6	\$ 625.00	\$	375.00
8/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Finalize notice and correspondence with team re same.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$	312.50
8/4/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft production log, format case file, proof Defendant production, and Correspondence with SJA re same.	1.2	\$ 270.00	\$	324.00
8/4/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re notice/notice process.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$	187.50
8/4/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with LXM re electronic discovery.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
8/4/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conference with SJA re electronic discovery.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
8/4/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re	0.1	\$ 625.00		62.50
8/5/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Finalize stipulation re 216b.	1.6	\$ 625.00	\$	1,000.00
8/5/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare and finalize exhibits and joint stipulation, file, and save to case file.	1.1	\$ 270.00	\$	297.00
8/5/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Proof and revise joint stipulation.	0.7	\$ 270.00	\$	189.00
8/5/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Format and proof consent forms and notice.	0.7	\$ 270.00		189.00
8/5/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Finalize 216(b) notices.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$	312.50
8/5/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re finalized notice.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$	312.50
8/5/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with opposing counsel and co- counsel re Defendant productions; proof file re same.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
8/5/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review edits to 216(b) notice.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/5/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re notice.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/5/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review notice Correspondence.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/5/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re edits to notice.	0.1	\$ 625.00		62.50
8/6/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research re administrators, and correspondence with same re notice administration quotes.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
8/6/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Research tolling argument for Dixon case.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$	250.00
	Sally J.	SJA	Conference with co-counsel re litigation strategy.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
8/6/2020	Abrahamson			Î.		<u> </u>	
	Abrahamson Justin Swartz	JMS	Review Defendant opposition in Dixon case	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$	198.00
8/6/2020 8/6/2020 8/6/2020	Abrahamson Justin Swartz Sally J. Abrahamson	JMS SJA	Review Defendant opposition in Dixon case. Correspondence with opposing counsel re third-party administrator.	0.2 0.1	\$ 990.00 625.00		198.00 62.50
8/6/2020	Justin Swartz Sally J.		Correspondence with opposing counsel re third-			\$	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 81 of 124

8/10/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review stipulation and supporting documents re conditional certification, and calendar deadlines therein.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
8/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review response to 216(b) in Dixon case; review Correspondence between SJA and co-counsel re same.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
8/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with L. Ho re Dixon v. Cushman reply in search of 216b and amended complaint.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$	250.00
8/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with MJF and co-counsel re 216(b) reply in Dixon v. Cushman and discovery.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$	250.00
8/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SJA and co-counsel re 216(b) reply in Dixon and discovery.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
8/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence between SJA, co-counsel, opposing counsel, and LXM re notice and consent process for conditional certification.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
8/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re litigation strategy.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
8/10/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re litigation strategy.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
8/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review court order re conditional certification.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review CPT quote.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re CPT quote.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re court order.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review interrogatory response.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re interrogatory response.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/10/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with administrator re quote.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/10/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save quote to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/10/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Quote to case life. Save Defendant's amended responses to	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
			interrogatories to case file.			,	
8/10/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update request for production of documents and production deadline.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/11/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review interrogatories responses from Defendant and correspondence re document production.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
8/11/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with MJF, DAA, and LXM re discovery strategy and responding Dixon opposition to 216(b).	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$	312.50
8/11/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF, SJA and LXM re discovery strategy and responding Dixon opposition to 216(b).	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
8/11/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Conference with MJF, DAA, and SJA re discovery strategy and responding Dixon opposition to 216(b).	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$	135.00
8/11/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with SJA, DAA, and LXM re discovery strategy and responding Dixon opposition to 216(b).	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
8/11/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Chase search terms.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
8/11/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re notice site.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/11/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with GW re website for notice.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/11/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with LXM re Defendant's production.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/11/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re electronic discovery.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/11/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re Chase search terms.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/11/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Corespondence with LXM re document production.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/11/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/11/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re updated administration	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/11/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	quote. Correspondence with Defendant re production issues.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/11/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save production to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	¢	27.00
8/11/2020	Sara Olson	SXO	Review correspondence with team re Defendant's	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
			production of documents to import to Nuix.	1		<u> </u>	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 82 of 124

8/11/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence between SJA, LXM,	0.1	T \$	350.00	\$ 35.00
	ŕ		website creator and settlement administrator re distribution of notice.		·		
8/12/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review produced documents and tag.	0.4	\$	625.00	\$ 250.00
8/12/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update discovery matrix.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$ 81.00
8/12/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save settlement administrator bids to case file.	0.2	\$	270.00	54.00
8/12/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review Dixon case motion to amend.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$ 125.00
8/12/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with vendors re notice administration.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$ 54.00
8/12/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with claims administrator re administration bid.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
8/12/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with claims administrator re administration bid.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
8/12/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with claims administrator re administration bid.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
8/12/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
8/12/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re local rules.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$ 60.00
8/12/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re local rules.	0.1	\$	625.00	62.50
8/12/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re Dixon case motion to amend.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
8/13/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft section of Dixon v. Cushman 216(b) reply.	3.5	\$	350.00	\$ 1,225.00
8/13/2020	Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with third-party administrator re	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
8/13/2020	Abrahamson Lynsey Major	LXM	216b notice. Correspondence with SJA re revised claims	0.1	\$	270.00	\$ 27.00
		MJF	administrator bid.	0.7			245.00
8/14/2020	Molly J. Frandsen		Revise notice section of Dixon 216(b) reply; correspondence with SJA re same.		\$	350.00	\$
8/14/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit notice section of Dixon reply brief.	0.4	\$	625.00	\$ 250.00
8/14/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Research notice issues for Dixon case.	0.3	\$	625.00	\$ 187.50
8/14/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant's document production.	0.2	\$	600.00	120.00
8/14/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research settlement administrators for 216(b) notice.	0.2	\$	350.00	70.00
8/14/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with team re notice bids.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
8/14/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re notice administrator selection.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
8/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA re administrator bids.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$ 27.00
8/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar case management conference in related case.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$ 27.00
8/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save briefings re leave to file second amended complaint.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$ 27.00
8/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Notice setting hearing to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$ 27.00
8/14/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with the class action practice group attorneys, SJA, and DAA re discovery questions.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$ 35.00
8/16/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re third party administrator.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$ 62.50
8/17/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise notice section of 216(b) reply; correspondence with SJA and co-counsel re same.	1.0	\$	350.00	\$ 350.00
8/17/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and index discovery production.	0.7	\$	350.00	\$ 245.00
8/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendants' document production.	0.4	\$	600.00	240.00
8/17/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Revise notice section of Dixon brief.	0.2	\$	625.00	125.00
8/17/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise case management conference date in related case.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$ 27.00
8/18/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update production log and discovery matrix.	5.6	\$	270.00	\$ 1,512.00
8/18/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA and MJF re discovery.	0.4	\$	625.00	\$ 250.00
8/18/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA and MJF re discovery.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$ 240.00
8/18/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM, SJA, and DAA re interrogatories, request for production of documents, and electronic discovery.	0.4	\$	350.00	140.00
8/18/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA and SJA re discovery.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$ 140.00
8/18/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Index discovery production.	0.3	\$	350.00	105.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 83 of 124

8/18/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise EFH to create chart of persons identified in Defendant's interrogatories responses.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
8/18/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review of Defendants' document production.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
8/18/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with SJA and administrators re bids for notice administration.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
8/18/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, MJF re document production.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/18/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review proof chart.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/18/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with opt-in K. Pierno re conditional certification.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
8/18/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re production and supplemental discovery responses.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/18/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with opposing counsel re discovery deficiencies.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
8/18/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Create team meeting agenda.	0.1	\$ 350.00		35.00
8/19/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update discovery matrix.	0.8	\$ 270.00	\$	216.00
8/19/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with administrators re bids.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
8/19/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with opt-in re status of the case and conditional certification.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
8/19/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with claims administrator re administration bid.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/19/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re Plaintiff communication.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/19/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA and MJF re client update.		\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/19/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re communication with opt-ins.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/19/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA and MJF re update to clients.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/19/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and SJA re questions from opt-in re notice.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
8/20/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review discovery and draft correspondence with propose electronic discovery search terms.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
8/20/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review list of potential custodians and add notes re same.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
8/20/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft correspondence with administrator re notice information.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
8/20/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re potential custodians.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/20/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review notice materials for distribution.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/20/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re notice materials for distribution.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/20/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with opt-in K. Pierno re notice question.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
8/20/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and SJA re notice question.	0.1	\$ 350.00		35.00
8/20/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Proof correspondence with administrator re notice information.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/21/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review discovery to create electronic discovery search term recommendations; correspondence with DAA re same.	1.7	\$ 350.00	\$	595.00
8/21/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with settlement administrator re notice materials and contact information.	0.8	\$ 270.00	\$	216.00
8/21/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update discovery matrix.	0.6	\$ 270.00		162.00
8/21/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re pending discovery.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
8/21/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM and SJA re 216(b) settlement administration notice questions.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
8/21/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM and DAA re discovery matrix questions.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
8/21/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, MJF re case website.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
8/21/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re notice process.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
8/21/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with DXS re search terms.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/21/2020 8/21/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA DAA	Review potential search terms. Correspondence with DXS, MJF re potential search	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
0/04/0000	I company Advices	LVM	terms.	0.4	 070.00	<u>_</u>	07.00
8/21/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save class list to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
8/23/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review Dixon 216(b) reply and motion for leave to amend drafted by co-counsel.	0.4	\$ 350.00		140.00
8/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re search terms, strategy for discovery going forward.	0.6	\$ 600.00		360.00
8/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re search terms, strategy for discovery going forward.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 84 of 124

8/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review Dixon reply; correspondence with SJA and co-counsel re same.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
8/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with DXS and MJF re search terms and targets of electronic discovery searches, and general electronic discovery search strategy.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
8/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA and DXS re search terms and targets of electronic discovery searches, and general electronic discovery search strategy.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
8/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review Dixon case reply.	0.4	\$ 625.00	\$	250.00
8/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with DXS re electronic discovery search terms.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Opt-In Plaintiff J. McLaughlin re opt-in website.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with L. Ho re Dixon v. Cushman discovery.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/25/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA and administrators re case website.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
8/25/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review notices website.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/25/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re review of notices website.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/25/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant's response re privilege assertions.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/27/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research case law re Defendant's response to Plaintiff's deficiency correspondence.	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$	245.00
8/27/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DXS re Defendant electronic discovery strategy and TAR proposal framework.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$	312.50
8/27/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DXS and DAA re Defendant electronic discovery strategy and TAR proposal framework.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$	125.00
8/27/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA and DXS re Defendant electronic discovery strategy and TAR proposal framework.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
8/27/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with DXS re negotiating electronic discovery.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/28/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and send correspondence with Defendant re interrogatories response deficiency; correspondence with DAA re same.	1.0	\$ 350.00	\$	350.00
8/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review research re privilege assertions.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re research re privilege assertions.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re privilege dispute.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/28/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save amended discovery responses to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
8/29/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review discovery correspondence.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/31/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated request for proposal of documents responses.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
8/31/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with SJA re litigation status.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
8/31/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with JMS re litigation status.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
8/31/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA and MJF re updated request for proporal of documents responses.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
8/31/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DXS and DAA re amended discovery responses.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
9/2/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM, DAA, and SJA re discovery and privilege log.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
9/2/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with opposing counsel re electronic discovery.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$	187.50
9/2/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA and MJF re settlement negotiations, custodians, discovery responses.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
9/2/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA and SJA re settlement negotiations, custodians, discovery responses.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
9/2/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA and MJF re settlement negotiations, custodians, discovery responses.	0.3	\$ 625.00	\$	187.50
9/2/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with claims administrator re status of notice.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
9/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Calculate damages for junior appraisers and correspondence with team re same.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$	312.50
9/3/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review reply brief re motion to amend.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
9/3/2020	Sally J.	SJA	Review 216(b) notice.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
9/3/2020	Abrahamson Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with administrator re 216(b) notice.		\$ 625.00	\$	62.50
	Abrahamson				 	-	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 85 of 124

9/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re privilege log.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with web developer re site for notice.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review and edit potential custodian list.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/3/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re potential custodian list.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/3/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, MJF re reply brief re motion to amend.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/3/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA and co-counsel re reply to motion for leave to amend in the Dixon case.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
9/3/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from SJA re settlement demand.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
9/3/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence re notice process and potential for settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
9/4/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review revised email notices.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/4/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA and administrator re revised email notices.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/4/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MNF and administrator re email notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/4/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with administrator re email notice,	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save docketed entries from related case [Dixon].	0.8	\$ 270.00	\$ 216.00
9/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar notice administration deadlines, and draft call script notes.	0.6	\$ 270.00	\$ 162.00
9/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with Dixon counsel re calculating damages.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$ 312.50
9/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with SJA and MJF re calculating settlement demand, notice administration, and discovery negotiations.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$ 300.00
9/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with DAA and MJF re calculating settlement demand, notice administration, and discovery negotiations.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$ 312.50
9/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with co-counsel and MJF re calculating settlement demand.	0.5	\$ 625.00	\$ 312.50
9/8/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with co-counsel and SJA re calculating settlement demand.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
9/8/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SJA and DAA re calculating settlement demand, notice administration, and discovery negotiations.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
9/8/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA, DAA, and co-counsel re calculating damages for settlement demand.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
9/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re litigation.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re litigation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with web developer re notice site.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re damages calculations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review damages calculations, correspondence re settlement demand	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re damages calculations, correspondence re settlement demand.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re settlement status and staffing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/8/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re damage calculations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/8/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Create team call agenda.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
9/8/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re settlement status and staffing.	0.1	\$ 990.00	99.00
9/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant production to case file and extract.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
9/9/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM, SJA, and DAA re notice administration.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
9/9/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review custodian list for ESI discovery.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 86 of 124

9/9/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re custodian list.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/9/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review opposing counsel response re objection to interrogatories.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant discovery responses in related case.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
9/9/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review amended interrogatory responses.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
9/9/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with SJA re amended interrogatory		\$	350.00		35.00
	,		responses.					
9/9/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence with team re discovery.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
9/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review documents produced by Defendant;	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
			correspondence with SJA and DAA re same.					
9/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with co-counsel L. Parrnell re damages.	0.4	\$	625.00	\$	250.00
9/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review amended request for production responses and privilege log from Defendant.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
9/10/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re electronic discovery.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/10/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, MJF re document production.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/11/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review revised privilege log and draft deficiency email; correspondence with LXM and SJA re same.	0.6	\$	350.00	\$	210.00
0/11/2020	Doirdro A Aoron	DAA	Correspondence to privilege leg	0.1	0	600.00	· c	60.00
9/11/2020 9/11/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence re privilege log. Correspondence with MNF re document production.		\$ \$	600.00		60.00
			·				ļ ,	
9/11/2020 9/11/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review notice administration report.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
9/11/2020	Lynsey Major Lynsey Major	LXM	Format privileged documents. Correspondence with MJF re priveleged	0.1	\$ \$	270.00 270.00		27.00 27.00
9/11/2020	Lynsey Major	LAW	documents.	0.1	l p	270.00	Ф	27.00
9/11/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save administrator's report to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
9/11/2020	Sally J.	SJA	Telephone conference with MJF re privelege log	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/11/2020	Abrahamson Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	deficiencies. Telephone conference with SJA re privilege log	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
9/11/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	deficiencies. Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
			Defendant's discovery production.					
9/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update discovery matrix and production log re supplemental discovery responses.	1.0	\$	270.00	\$	270.00
9/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Listen to voicemail, draft call script notes, and Correspondence with MJF re same.	0.4	\$	270.00	\$	108.00
9/14/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated damages calculations.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
9/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case memo.	0.2	\$	270.00		54.00
9/14/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM and DAA re potential opt		\$	350.00	\$	70.00
9/14/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	in inquiry and inquiry process. Correspondence with SJA, DAA, and co-counsel re	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
			discovery and agenda for team meeting.					
9/14/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review filings in Dixon case.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
9/14/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Review damage calculations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/14/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re damage calculations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/14/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MNF and LXM re notice inquiries.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/14/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Update call log re notice inquiries.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/15/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Collate intake notes with 216b class list, and draft call script.	1.1	\$	270.00		297.00
9/15/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review Defendant's discovery responses in the Dixon case.	0.7	\$	350.00	\$	245.00
9/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with SJA and MJF re 216(b) notice, settlement demand, and discovery.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
9/15/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with DAA and MJF re 216(b) notice, settlement demand, and discovery.	0.4	\$	625.00	\$	250.00
9/15/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SJA and DAA re 216(b) notice, settlement demand, and discovery.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
9/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review draft email to opposing counsel re privilege	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	log. Correspondence with MJF re privilege log email to opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/15/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re privilege log email to opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/15/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Leave voicemail with class member re query.	0.1	\$	270.00	¢	27.00
JI 1JIZUZU	L ALISEA INIGIOI	LAIVI	Leave voiceman with class member re query.	10.1	Φ	210.00	Ψ	21.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 87 of 124

0/45/0000	II	LIXA	O	Io 4	Ι φ	070.00	Ι φ	07.00
9/15/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re class member call status.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
9/15/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with co-counsel re Defendant's discovery responses in the Dixon case.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
9/15/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review call log and script for 216(b) notice drafted by LXM.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
9/15/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM re call log and script for 216(b) notice.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
9/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review damages calculations and correspondence with MJF, co-counsel L. Pardell re same.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
9/16/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review damages calculated by co-counsel; Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	0.6	\$	350.00	\$	210.00
9/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review of damages calculations.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
9/16/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence re California damages.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
9/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re status of Dixon discovery.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review notice call script.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MNF, LXM re call log script.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/16/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re Dixon discovery responses.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Pardell re calculations.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re outstanding discovery disputes.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/16/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re discovery deficiency.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review categories of damages alleged.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re categories of damages alleged.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/16/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review CA damages.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
9/17/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with class member and update call log re same.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
9/17/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re damage calculations.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
9/17/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence re damage calculations.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
9/17/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Further review of damage calculations.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
9/17/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re case transition.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re case transition.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/18/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Correspondence re damages calculations and review regs re same, correspondence with MJF re same.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
9/18/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and SJA re damage calculations for settlement demand.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
9/18/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re calculating overtime for commission.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/18/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review claims administrator report.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/18/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re claims adminstration report.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/18/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save administrator's consent form report to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
9/21/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review damages drafted by co-counsel; correspondence with DAA, SJA, and co-counsel re same.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
9/21/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re strategy for potential settlement.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
9/21/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re strategy for potential settlement.	0.2	\$	990.00	\$	198.00
9/21/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/21/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/21/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence re electronic discovery custodians.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/21/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re electronic discovery, case coverage.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/21/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re discovery.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/21/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA re case transition.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
					1 7			

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 88 of 124

Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Pardell re damages, reclassification.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with DAA re case transition.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with SJA and MJF re settlement demand and discovery strategy.	0.6	\$	600.00	\$	360.00
Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with DAA and MJF re	0.6	\$	625.00	\$	375.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SJA and DAA re	0.6	\$	350.00	\$	210.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review status of discovery negotiations and create agenda to prepare for weekly team meeting.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Pardell re calculating damages for settlement demand.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
Sally J.	SJA	Review damage calculations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with MJF re damage calculations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with JMS re companion case.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review settlement damages calculated by co- counsel, Correspondence with co-counsel, DAA, and SJA re same.	1.7	\$	350.00	\$	595.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review of prior damages calculations and correspondence re demands.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with MJF and DAA re damage calculations.	0.7	\$	625.00	\$	437.50
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with SJA and MJF re damages calculations.	0.7	\$	600.00	\$	420.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with SJA and DAA re damages caclulations.	0.7	\$	350.00	\$	245.00
Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft SJA's notice of withdrawal; research re lead counsel; and Correspondence with SJA re notice of	0.4	\$	270.00	\$	108.00
Sally J.	SJA	Conference with Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.3	\$	625.00	\$	187.50
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF and SJA re prior	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence re withdrawal of self from case.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from co counsel re updated	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with GRW re website.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
Sally J.	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re damage calculations.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
	ΠΔΔ	Review correspondence re privilege log	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
							60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from client re potential	0.1	\$			60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated damages calculations.	0.1	\$			60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, MNF re updated	0.1	\$			60.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with defense counsel re privilege log.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re staffing and pro hac vice.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with DAA, MJF, and co- counsel re damages calculation and settlement demand.	1.1	\$	625.00	\$	687.50
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with SJA, MJF and co- counsel re damages calculation and settlement demand.	1.1	\$	600.00	\$	660.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SJA, DAA and co- counsel re damages calculation and settlement demand.	1.1	\$	350.00	\$	385.00
	Sally J. Abrahamson Deirdre A. Aaron Sally J. Abrahamson Molly J. Frandsen Molly J. Frandsen Molly J. Frandsen Sally J. Abrahamson Sally J. Abrahamson Molly J. Frandsen Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron Molly J. Frandsen Lynsey Major Sally J. Abrahamson Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron Sally J. Abrahamson Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	Sally J. Abrahamson Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Sally J. Abrahamson Molly J. Frandsen MJF Molly J. Frandsen MJF Molly J. Frandsen MJF Sally J. Abrahamson Sally J. Abrahamson Sally J. Abrahamson Molly J. Frandsen MJF Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Sally J. Abrahamson Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Sally J. Abrahamson Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Sally J. SJA Abrahamson Molly J. Frandsen MJF Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Deirdre A. Aaron DAA	Sally J.	Sally J. SJA Conference with DAA re case transition. 0.1	Sally J. SAIA Conference with DAA re case transition. 0.1 SAIA Conference with DAA re case transition. 0.1 SAIA Conference with DAA re case transition. 0.1 SAIA SAIA Telephone conference with SJA and MJF re settlement demand and discovery strategy. 0.6 SAIA SAIA Telephone conference with DAA and MJF re settlement demand and discovery strategy. SAIA SAIA Telephone conference with DAA and MJF re settlement demand and discovery strategy. 0.6 SAIA SAIA	damagas, reclassification.	Sally J. SJA Conference with DAA re case transition. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Conference with DAA re case transition. 0.1 \$ 625.00 \$ Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Telephone conference with SJA and MJF re sottlement demand and discovery strategy. 0.6 \$ 625.00 \$ Sally J. SJA Telephone conference with DAA and MJF re sottlement demand and discovery strategy. 0.6 \$ 8625.00 \$ Sally J. Frandsen MJF Telephone conference with DAA and MJF re 0.6 \$ 350.00 \$ 350.00 \$ Sally J. Frandsen MJF Telephone conference with DAA and DAA re 0.6 \$ 350.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 89 of 124

9/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review damages and create distribution model; Correspondence with DAA, SJA, and co-counsel re same and re settlement demand strategy.	1.0	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00
9/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from Defendant re privilege log and research response.	0.8	\$ 350.00	\$ 280.00
9/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further analysis of damages and correspondence with SJA, MJF re same.	0.7	\$ 600.00	\$ 420.00
9/24/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research and draft notice of substitution.	0.6	\$ 270.00	\$ 162.00
9/24/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise, finalize, and file notice of substitution; save to case file.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
9/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Conference with SEH re appearance.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
9/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Telephone conference with DAA and MJF re damages calculation and settlement demand.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
9/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with SJA and MJF re damages calculation and settlement demand.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
9/24/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update notice call script re reclassification.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
9/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with SJA and DAA re damages calculation and settlement demand.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
9/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re damages calculations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA, MJF re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/24/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Edit Notice of Supplemental Authority for SEH.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM re updating 216(b) intake form.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
9/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SJA re opposing counsel withdrawal.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/25/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research privilege log dispute; draft correspondence with DAA re same.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
9/25/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare notice of consent and redact form.	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$ 135.00
9/25/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research rules re local counsel filing; file consent; and save to case file.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
9/25/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review policy documents for potential sources of electronic discovery.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
9/25/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review correspondence re Defendant change in counsel and update case memo re same.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
9/25/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Draft settlement demand letter to opposing counsel T. Petrides.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
9/25/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with reporter re case background.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
9/25/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update contact information and electronic case filing information in class log.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
9/25/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review consent to join form for filing and local rules re same.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
9/25/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with claims administrator re consent to join.	0.2	\$ 625.00	\$ 125.00
9/25/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Prepare for reporter call.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
9/25/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho, SJA re settlement discussions.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
9/25/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with reporter re case background.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/25/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SLG re settlement demand.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/25/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save administrator report to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/25/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with administrator re responses received.	0.1	\$ 270.00	27.00
9/25/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with L. Ho re opposing counsel withdrawal.	0.1	\$ 625.00	\$ 62.50
9/25/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re opt-in.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
9/25/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence re demand.	0.1	\$ 350.00	35.00
9/25/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with co-counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 625.00	62.50
9/28/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save consent form to case file, prepare notice, file, and update contact log.	0.7	\$	189.00
9/28/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Calculate time lost from gaps in tolling for calculating demand; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
9/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review damages calculations and correspondence with SJA, MJF re same.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
9/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel P. Meireles re settlement demand.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 90 of 124

9/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement demand.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re tolling.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review summary of tolling.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
9/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re tolling.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
9/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re settlement demand.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
9/29/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re settlement negotiations and discovery strategy.		\$	600.00	\$	240.00
9/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re settlement negotiations and discovery strategy.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
9/29/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement demand and assumptions re same.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
9/29/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with L. Ho re settlement demand.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
9/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re privilege log,	0.2	\$	350.00		70.00
			electronic discovery, and document review.				·	
9/29/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review damages calculations.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
9/29/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re response to opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/29/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re follow up on electronic discovery.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/29/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review MJF correspondence re privilege log.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/29/2020	Sally J. Abrahamson	SJA	Correspondence with DAA re damages.	0.1	\$	625.00	\$	62.50
9/29/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Pardell re	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
			scheduling call					
9/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and from co-counsel re settlement demand.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
9/30/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review privilege log and documents produced; research privilege case law; and correspondence with DAA re responding to Defendant's response to privilege log deficiency.	1.9	\$	350.00	\$	665.00
9/30/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review privilege log and correspondence with MJF re potential waiver issues.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
9/30/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re correspondence from potential opt-in.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
9/30/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re change of counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/30/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated damages calculations.	0.1	\$	600.00		60,00
9/30/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Pardell re damages.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
9/30/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save notice of appearance to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
9/30/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case memo re notice of appearance.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
9/30/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Pardell re updated damages calculations.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
10/1/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re opt-in inquiry in Dixon case.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
10/1/2020	Sally J.	SJA	Oversee withdrawal of self from case.	0.2	\$	625.00	\$	125.00
10/1/2020	Abrahamson Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with opposing counsel T. Petrides	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
10/1/0000			re potential for settlement.			222.22	_	
10/1/2020 10/1/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA DAA	Review stipulation re notice and collective list. Correspondence with MJF re response to potential	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
10/2/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	opt-in. Call with reporter re case overview; correspondence	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
40/0/0000	Dainder A Asses	D 4 4	with co-counsel re same.	0.4		000.00	Φ.	
10/2/2020 10/2/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA DAA	Review new consent to join submission. Correspondence with LXM re filing new consent to	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
10/2/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	join submission.	0.1	•	250.00	Φ	25.00
10/2/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re privilege log. Correspondence with defense counsel re privilege	0.1	\$	350.00 350.00		35.00 105.00
40/5/0000	Date to A. 1	 D	log; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.4	+	000.00	_	
10/5/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence re privilege log.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
10/5/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re privilege log.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
10/5/2000		MJF	Respond to inquiry from client Seltz re case.	0.1	\$	350.00		35.00 35.00
10/5/2020 10/5/2020	Molly J. Frandsen Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re inquiry from client	0.1	\$	350.00	Ъ	00.00
			Seltz re case. Telephone conference with MJF re settlement	0.1	\$	350.00		180.00
10/5/2020 10/6/2020	Molly J. Frandsen Deirdre A. Aaron	MJF DAA	Seltz re case. Telephone conference with MJF re settlement negotiations, discovery strategy, and Dixon hearing.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
10/5/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Seltz re case. Telephone conference with MJF re settlement				\$	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 91 of 124

10/6/2020	Doirdro A Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re electronic discovery.	0.1	I \$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/6/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft agenda for weekly check-in meeting.	0.1	\$	350.00		35.00
10/6/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re Dixon hearing.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
10/6/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel and DAA re Dixon hearing.		\$	350.00		35.00
10/6/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
10/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Attend Dixon hearing; correspondence with DAA re	0.5	\$	350.00		175.00
	,		same.				,	
10/7/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF, L. Ho, and B. Holtzmann re filing FLSA only complaint for appraisers with recoverable draws.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
10/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA, L. Ho, and B. Holtzmann re filing FLSA only complaint for appraisers with recoverable draws.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
10/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise Dixon notice.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
10/7/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re 216b and motion to dismiss hearing in Dixon.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
10/7/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case memo re Defendant noticed of appearance.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
10/7/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re 216b and motion to dismiss hearing in Dixon.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
10/7/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with opposing counsel T. Petrides re settlement negotiation status and strategy.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
10/7/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re appraisers' status.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
10/7/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant notices of appearance to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
10/7/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re settlement negotiation status and strategy.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
10/8/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise Dixon case collective notice.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
10/8/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save related complaint to case file, and register DAA and MJF for docket alerts.	0.3	\$	270.00		81.00
10/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re call to discuss possible settlement.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re Dixon motion to dismiss, 216b.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/8/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re Dixon notice, new complaint.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/8/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review new Dixon FLSA complaint.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
10/8/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re new Dixon fair labor standards act complaint.	0.1	\$	350.00		35.00
10/9/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with opposing counsel T. Petrides re potential settlement, mediation	0.7	\$	600.00	\$	420.00
10/9/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re CA case and status of DC settlement negotiations.	0.3	\$	990.00	\$	297.00
10/9/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re CA case and status of DC settlement negotiations.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
10/9/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review damages calculations in preparation for call with opposing counse.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
10/9/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re call with opposing counsel re mediation.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
10/9/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Confrence with DAA re conference with Defendant re mediation.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
10/9/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence re CA case and status of DC settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
10/9/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review claims administration report.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/9/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re claims administration.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
10/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re opt-in reports.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
10/9/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re potential mediation.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
10/12/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re check-in call.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
10/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA and MJF re potential opt- in, and review case file re same.	- 0.8	\$	270.00	\$	216.00
10/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save consent form to case file; update records; and docket.	0.5	\$	270.00	\$	135.00
10/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with L. Ho re potential mediation, mediators.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
10/13/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and LXM re inquiry from Opt-In Plaintiff D. Wilkes; draft correspondence with opposing counsel re same.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
10/13/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with potential opt-in.	0.2	\$	270.00		54.00
10/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re follow up with opposing counsel re mediation.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
		•	•	•				

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 92 of 124

10/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, LXM re consent to join form.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re consent to join form.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/13/2020	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re potential for local settlement and related issues.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
10/14/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re mediation, discovery.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
10/14/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re mediation, discovery.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
10/14/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with mediators' assistance and DAA re mediator availability.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
10/14/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re potential mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/14/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS, P. Meireles re potential mediators.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/14/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MNF re reminder notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/14/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MNF re reminder notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review collective list re opt-ins.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/14/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re opt-ins.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
10/14/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and approve reminder notice.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
10/14/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re reminder notice.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
10/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re Steve Rottman (mediator) availability.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS, co-counsel P. Meireles re mediator availability.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/15/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re mediator availability.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re confirming mediator.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re possible mediators.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with client re case check-in.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with client re case update.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/16/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re discussion with opposing counsel re stay of litigations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/17/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from client, DAA, co- counsel, and opposing counsel re mediation, Dixon notice, and opt-in D. Wilkes.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
10/18/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel, L. Ho re mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/19/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review mediation correspondence; chart deadlines; and calendar same.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
10/19/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re scheduling call with Seltz and opposing counsel re stip; correspondence with LXM re calendar dates in mediation notice.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
10/19/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Call with client.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/19/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re mediation dates.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/19/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/19/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with client re case check in.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
10/20/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with opposing counsel, L. Ho re mediation logistics, stipulation re stay, Dixon notice.	0.5	\$ 600.00	300.00
10/20/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with L. Ho before call with opposing counsel re mediation, stay, notice in Dixon.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
10/20/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Correspondence re Dixon notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/20/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence from administrator re reminder notice mailing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
10/21/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and draft stipulation to stay case pending mediation.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
10/21/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence re Dixon notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/21/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re preparing stipulation re mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
10/22/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft motion to stay; revise incorporating edits from DAA and send to co-counsel.	1.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 525.00
10/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF and client R. Seltz re case status, mediation.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
10/22/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA and client R. Seltz re case status, mediation.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
10/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re mediation planning.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
10/22/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re mediation planning.	0.3	\$ 350.00	105.00
10/22/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re costs for settlement administration.	0.2	\$ 350.00	70.00
10/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise stipulation re mediation.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
10/22/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM re preservation letter.	0.1	\$ 350.00	35.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 93 of 124

10/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re stipulation re mediation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re notice administration.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/22/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re stipulation for mediation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/23/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re stipulation for mediation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/23/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re motion to stay case.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
10/26/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, opposing counsel re stipulation for stay.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/26/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from mediator re mediation expectations.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/26/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with accounting re invoice for mediation expectations.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/27/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft, finalize, parse and send preservation letters.	1.2	\$	270.00	\$	324.00
10/27/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review preservation letter drafted by LXM;	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
10/27/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	correspondence with DAA and LXM re same. Save stipulations and order re class certification to	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
10/07/0000	D		Dixon case file.					
10/27/2020 10/27/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA DAA	Correspondence with MJF re preservation letters. Correspondence with MJF, LXM re preservation	0.1	\$ \$	600.00	\$	60.00 60.00
			letter.					
10/27/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with opt-in Plaintiff re contact.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
10/27/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update class list.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
10/28/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with potential opt-in re case; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
10/28/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review edits to motion to stay from Defendant; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
10/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re follow up with potential	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/28/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	opt in. Correspondence with opposing counsel re	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/29/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	stipulation. Format motion to stay; draft proposed order re	0.7	\$	270.00	\$	189.00
10/29/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	same; and research re local rules. Supervise LXM to file motion to stay and draft	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
			proposed order; correspondence with DAA, SEH, opposing counsel, and JLM re same.					
10/29/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant's edits to stipulation re stay.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/29/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re stipulation re stay.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/30/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Finalize and file motion to stay; save to case file.	0.4	\$	270.00		108.00
10/30/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re mediation prep.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
10/30/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re mediation prep	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
10/30/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save sealing order in Dixon case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
10/30/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise LXM to file motion to stay case.	0.1	\$	350.00		35.00
10/30/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re motion to stay case.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
10/30/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review edits to Dixon stipulation from opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
11/2/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise ALM to file consent to join; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
11/2/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Bursey stipulation re settlement approval.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/2/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re settlement of CO	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	case. Save stipulations and orders in related case (Dixon) to case file, and calendar deadlines for same.	0.4	\$	270.00	\$	108.00
11/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update class list, prepare preservation letter, and	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
11/9/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	send same. Correspondence with DAA and LXM re motion to	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
			stay, preservation letters, and weekly check-in.				,	
11/9/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re mediation data.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
11/9/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save consent form report to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
11/10/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA, LMX, and co-counsel re motion to stay, notice website, and scheduling internal calls.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$ 	105.00
11/10/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re proposed order.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
11/10/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review local rules re proposed order.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
11/11/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save order staying deadlines to case file, and	0.2	\$	270.00		54.00
			update calendar re same.				,	
11/11/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review order re staying case.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 94 of 124

11/11/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW MNF, LXM re Dixon notice website.	0.1	\$ 600.00	·	60.00
11/11/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re notice website.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
11/11/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review correspondence between DAA and GXW.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
11/12/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel GBDH, MJF re mediation data, Dixon notice.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
11/12/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with co-counsel GBDH, DAA re mediation data, Dixon notice.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
11/12/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re Dixon v. Cushman notice website.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/12/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re notice website.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re Dixon notice and mediaiton data.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
11/13/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re Dixon notice and mediation data.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
11/13/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Send preservation letters and mediation update to opt-ins.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
11/13/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re notice website.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
11/16/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save notice re change of address, stipulation and order re class list deadline; revise calendar deadline.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
11/17/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review payroll data discovery and correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re data questions for defense counsel.	0.9	\$ 350.00	\$	315.00
11/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re pending tasks.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
11/17/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re data questions.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/18/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re mediation data.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and GW re Dixon website.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
11/24/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re data questions for Defendant.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
11/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re weekly call.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
11/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW MJF re notice website.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
11/24/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re Colorado case.		\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/30/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with GW, DAA, and co-counsel re website.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
11/30/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re Dixon website.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
11/30/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re Dixon website.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
11/30/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review further correspondence re Dixon website.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/30/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re call with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
11/30/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save consent form report to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
12/1/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with opt-in D. Wilkes; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
12/1/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review Dixon website; Correspondence with co- counsel; DAA, vendor, and GW re same.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
12/1/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW J. McLaughlin re notice website for Dixon.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/1/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re status of Colorado case.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/1/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re following up with opt in.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/1/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re status report in related case.		\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
12/1/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review Bursey status report.	0.1	\$ 350.00		35.00
12/1/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and LXM re Bursey status report.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
12/1/2020	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with settlement administrator and opt-in re updated address.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
12/1/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re following up with Defendants re data questions, Colorado case.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
12/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save consent form to case file; file on docket; and correspondence with opt-in re preservation duties.	1.0	\$ 270.00	\$	270.00
12/2/2020	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research case file re class list, and correspondence with MJF re stipulation re same.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
12/2/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re case status.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
12/2/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM, MJFJ re opt-ins, Dixon website.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
12/2/2020	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re scheduling call.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
	+	+	-	•			

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 95 of 124

Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel re Dixon website.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re opt-in D. Wilkes.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel, MJF re call to discuss data.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re potential opt-out.	0.1	\$			60.00
Molly J. Frandsen						\$	35.00
		data questions, CO case.				,	180.00
Deirdre A. Aaron		opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Call with co-counsel L. Ho in preparation for call with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re call with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re conference with defense counsel and re opt-in D. Wilkes issue.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re opt-in issue, update to client.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with D. Wilkes re submitting consent to join in Dixon case.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re submitting consent to join in Dixon case.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
Lynsey Major	LXM	Call with opt-in re related case.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA, LXM, and co-counsel re clients who filed in Seltz who should file in Dixon.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re ineligible opt-in.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel re consent to join forms.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re potential class member.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re call to discuss data.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Lynsey Major	LXM	Leave voicemail with ineligible opt-in re related case.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re data questions.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review payroll data for mediation damage calculations and Defendant's responses to data questions; correspondence with co-counsel re same.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re mediation data, mediation planning.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re mediation data, mediation planning	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF and opt-in re class eligibility.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re mediation data.	0.1	\$			35.00
Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case file; save docketed events in related case.	0.4	\$	270.00	\$	108.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise data follow-up request to opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re data follow-up request to opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with defense counsel re data issues.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re data issues.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with accounting and DAA re settlement administrator invoice.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with accounting, co counsel re notice administration costs.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence re administration invoice.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
	DAA	Review Bursey settlement and correspondence with team re same.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
Deirdre A. Aaron		iteani le same.					
Justin Swartz	JMS	Review memo re CO settlement.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
	JMS LXM		0.1	\$	990.00 270.00	\$	99.00 81.00
Justin Swartz		Review memo re CO settlement. Save consent form, consent report, and agreement	0.3			\$	
	Molly J. Frandsen Deirdre A. Aaron Molly J. Frandsen Deirdre A. Aaron Molly J. Frandsen Molly J. Frandsen Molly J. Frandsen Molly J. Frandsen Lynsey Major Deirdre A. Aaron Lynsey Major Molly J. Frandsen Lynsey Major Deirdre A. Aaron Lynsey Major Molly J. Frandsen Molly J. Frandsen Deirdre A. Aaron Molly J. Frandsen Lynsey Major Deirdre A. Aaron Molly J. Frandsen Lynsey Major Deirdre A. Aaron Molly J. Frandsen Lynsey Major Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	Molly J. Frandsen DAA Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Molly J. Frandsen MJF Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Molly J. Frandsen MJF Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Molly J. Frandsen MJF Molly J. Frandsen MJF Molly J. Frandsen MJF Molly J. Frandsen MJF Lynsey Major LXM Molly J. Frandsen MJF Lynsey Major LXM Molly J. Frandsen MJF Lynsey Major LXM Molly J. Frandsen MJF Lynsey Major LXM Molly J. Frandsen MJF Lynsey Major LXM Molly J. Frandsen MJF Lynsey Major LXM Molly J. Frandsen MJF Lynsey Major LXM Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Lynsey Major LXM Molly J. Frandsen MJF Molly J. Frandsen MJF Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Molly J. Frandsen MJF Lynsey Major LXM Molly J. Frandsen MJF Molly J. Frandsen MJF	Molly J. Frandsen Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Deirdre A. Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Deirdre A. Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Deir	Molly J. Frandsen Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. De	Molly J. Frandsen MJF	Molity J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re opt-in D. Wilkes 0.1 \$ 600.00	Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re opti-in D. Wilkes 0,1 \$ 350,00 \$ 1

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 96 of 124

1/5/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Attention to claims administrator invoice and fees.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
1/6/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with Defendant re data; review Bursey settlement agreement.	0.4	\$	350.00		140.00
1/6/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re related case, docket updates, and settlement approval papers.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
1/7/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with IT re mediation folder.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
1/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review Bursey settlement,	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
1/11/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case file re history/docket of Bursey case.	0.8	\$	270.00	\$	216.00
1/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review Bursey settlement; summarize and	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
1/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	correspondence with DAA re same. Correspondence with MJF re Bursey settlement	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
17 12/2021	Bellate 74 74 for		terms.			000.00	Ψ	00.00
1/12/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA re class member.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
1/12/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with class member re opt-in deadline.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
1/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with defense counsel re data questions.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
1/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review mediation statements from previous mediation to prepare for call with DAA; correspondence with CAPG re mediator.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
1/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re mediation preparation.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
1/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re mediation preparation.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
1/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re mediation statement.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
1/19/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save consent form in related case.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
1/19/2021 1/21/2021	Justin Swartz Molly J. Frandsen	JMS MJF	Correspondence with team re potential mediator. Correspondence with co-counsel re mediation preparation.	0.1	\$	990.00 350.00	\$	99.00 35.00
1/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re follow up with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re class data.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
1/25/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save consent in related case.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
1/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re data (.1) conference with co-counsel re mediation statement (.1) and conference with MLS to discuss mediation in front of mediator Rottman (.1)	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
1/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, G. Grimes, MJF re mediation preparation, data.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
1/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, G. Grimes, DAA re mediaiton preparation, data.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
1/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re agenda for call with co counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MLS re mediator.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re data issues.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re client update.	0.1	\$	600.00	-	60.00
1/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Additional correspondence with MLS, MJF re mediator.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Respond to inquiry from Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
1/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re inquiry from Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
1/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re mediation data issues.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
1/27/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MLS, MJF re mediator Rottman.	0.3	\$	600.00		180.00
1/27/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA, MLS re mediator Rottman.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
1/27/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Outline mediation statement.	0.3	\$	350.00		105.00
1/27/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re mediation statement.	0.2	\$	600.00		120.00
1/27/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with MJF re mediation statement.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
1/27/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save consent in related case.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
1/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re call to discuss Defendant's response re data.		\$	350.00	\$	35.00
2/1/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and draft mediation statement; correspondence with DAA re same.	3.5	\$	350.00		1,225.00
2/1/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update mediation deadline re Zoom details.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
2/2/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review production and responses from opposing counsel re questions re mediation data; Correspondence with DAA re same.	0.6	\$	350.00	\$	210.00
2/2/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise law clerk NTC to conduct research in support of mediation statement; telephone conference with NTC re same.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
2/2/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save consent forms in related case.	0.1	\$	270.00	2	27.00
-, -, - 0 - 1	periody iviajoi	-/ XIVI	55.0 concent forms in related case.	10.1	ĮΨ	_, 0.00	ıΨ	2, 00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 97 of 124

2/3/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with MJF re mediation statement, data, and damages.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$ 300.00
2/3/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA re mediation statement, data, and damages.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
2/3/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review tolling agreement to determine mediation statute of limitation; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
2/3/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review mediation statement, data in preparation for call with MJF.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
2/3/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Create agenda for conference with co-counsel re mediation preparation.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
2/3/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with P. Meireles, L. Pardell re mediation preparation	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/3/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re agenda for call with co counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/4/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review previous damage calculations and circulate to team; correspondence with co-counsel re data; draft correspondence with opposing counsel re outstanding data; correspondence with DAA and LXM re same.	0.8	\$ 350.00	\$ 280.00
2/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference call with MJF, co-counsel re mediation preparation, damages calculations.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$ 300.00
2/4/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference call with DAA, co-counsel re mediation preparation, damage calculations.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
2/4/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Proof class list, and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
2/5/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re class list, and forward same.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
2/5/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with Defendant re mediation data questions.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
2/5/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with MLS and LXM re mediation data questions.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
2/8/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save consent form in related case to file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise mediation statement incorporating edits from DAA and send to co-counsel.	0.9	\$ 350.00	\$ 315.00
2/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise mediation statement.	0.8	\$ 600.00	\$ 480.00
2/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re mediation statement and scheduling call to discuss statement and damages.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
2/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re mediation preparation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Schedule conference re mediation preparation.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
2/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from co-counsel re data issues and damage calculations; correspondence with co-counsel and to DAA re same; review new correspondence from Defendant re data.	0.9	\$ 350.00	\$ 315.00
2/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review summary of data issues.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
2/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re data issues.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
2/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review mediation data; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same to prepare for conference; review correspondence from co-counsel to opposing counsel re same.	1.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 385.00
2/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and incorporate edits to the mediation statement from co-counsel L. Ho; correspondence with DAA re same.	1.0	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00
2/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference call with co-counsel GBDH, MJF re damages calculations, mediation statement.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$ 300.00
2/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference call with co-counsel GBDH, DAA re damages calculations, mediation statement.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
2/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from co-counsel, opposing counsel re damages.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
2/22/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Check opt-in status.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re updating mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
2/22/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re opt-in status.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
2/23/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA, co-counsel, and opposing counsel re data, damages, and scheduling conferences re mediation.	0.9	\$ 350.00	\$ 315.00
2/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re damages, calls with co counsel and opposing counsel.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 98 of 124

2/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence re damages.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
2/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
2/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Calculate damages for Seltz opt-ins; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.9	\$ 350.00	\$	315.00
2/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re damages calculation, mediation statement, preparation for next steps.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
2/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re damages calculation, mediation statement, preparation for next steps.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
2/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel and defense counsel re data questions for mediation damage calculations.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
2/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re data issues.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
2/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise mediation statement; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
2/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise mediation statement.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$	360.00
2/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
2/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF and co-counsel re mediation statement, data.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
2/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF, opposing counsel, L. Ho re mediation, data.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
2/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA and co-counsel re mediation statement, data.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
2/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA, opposing counsel, L. Ho re mediation, data.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
2/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re statement, data issues, and conference with opposing counsel.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
2/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise mediation statement and collect exhibits.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
2/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review notes with opposing counsel in preparation for team call re mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
3/1/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review new data from Defendant; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re data issues and re following up with opt-ins determined not to be juniors based on data.	1.5	\$ 350.00	\$	525.00
3/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF and co-counsel re damages calculations.	1.0	\$ 600.00	\$	600.00
3/1/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA and co-counsel re damages calculations.	1.0	\$ 350.00	\$	350.00
3/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re damages calculation, mediation, opt-in discrepancies.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
3/1/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re damages calculation, mediation, opt-in discrepancies.	0.5	\$ 990.00	\$	495.00
3/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated data and correspondence with L. Pardell, MJF re same.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
3/1/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review prior correspondence and documents in preparation for call with DAA.	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$	198.00
3/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re damages calculations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re newly produced data.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Pardell, MJF re damages.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review newly produced mediation data.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/2/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare mediation exhibits and collective lists in Dixon I and II.	1.5	\$ 270.00		405.00
3/2/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review mediation data from Defendant and draft questions; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	1.1	\$ 350.00	\$	385.00
3/2/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with two opt-ins not in collective (.2); correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same; conference with Opt-In Plaintiff Jeremy Darner re employment facts (.4).	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
3/2/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and LXM re finalizing and submitting mediation statement, review exhibits and correspondence re outstanding information.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
3/2/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re mediation preparation.	0.5	\$ 600.00		300.00
3/2/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re mediation preparation.	0.5	\$ 350.00		175.00
3/2/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case file re docketed events in related cases.	0.4	\$ 270.00	·	108.00
3/2/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence and supplemental data production in preparation for mediation.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 99 of 124

3/2/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho re mediation negotiations.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
3/2/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re data issues, mediation.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
3/2/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review lodestar and fees.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
3/2/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re preparation for mediation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/2/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re opt-in status.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
3/2/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re mediator's contact.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
3/2/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Further attention to correspondence and premediation materials.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
3/3/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Calculate statute of limitations for opt-ins and non- opt-ins for mediation damages.	1.5	\$ 350.00	\$	525.00
3/3/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, MJF re mediation prep.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
3/3/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, DAA re mediation prep.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
3/3/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re data issues, damages caclulations, tolling.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
3/3/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review lodestar; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
3/3/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re data issues, damages calculations, tolling.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
3/3/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re data issues, damages calculations, tolling.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
3/3/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with RXT re mediation materials	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$	81.00
3/3/2021	Lymany Mainr	LXM	and instructions.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
3/3/2021	Lynsey Major Lynsey Major	LXM	Check consent form dates. Correspondence with MJF re consent form dates.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
3/3/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM and RXT re finalizing and submitting mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 350.00		35.00
3/3/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Calendar call with RXT re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
3/3/2021	Rania Tootla	RXT	Calendar call with MJF re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
3/3/2021	Rania Tootla	RXT	Telephone conference with MJF re finalizing and submitting mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
3/4/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review new mediation data from defense counsel; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
3/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re data produced by Defendants.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$	360.00
3/4/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re data produced by Defendants.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
3/4/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with co-counsel LP re data and damage calculations.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
3/4/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with opt-in C. Chester; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
3/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review data produced by Defendants.	0.2	\$ 600.00	¢	120.00
3/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review document production re job titles.	0.2	\$ 600.00		120.00
3/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re opt-in damages.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
3/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re data produced by Defendants.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
3/4/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with RXT re finalizing and submitting mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
3/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise term sheet and circulate to co- counsel.	1.1	\$ 600.00	\$	660.00
3/5/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Calculate damages based on updated statute of limitations for opt-ins.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
3/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review damages calculations, tolling agreements and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
3/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re damages calculations,	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
3/5/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	mediation. Conference with DAA re damages calculations,	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
3/5/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	mediation. Telephone conference with Opt-In Plaintiff S.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
3/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Hoffman re mediation damages. Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, L. Pardell re	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
3/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	damages calculation, mediation. Correspondence with co-counsel L. Pardell re	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
		1	damages calculations.			<u> </u>	
3/5/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review draft term sheet.	0.1	\$ 990.00		99.00
3/5/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review proposed term sheet drafted by DAA.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 100 of 124

3/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review damages calculated by co-counsel L. Pardell and S. Grimes; correspondence with co-counsel and to DAA re same.	2.5	\$ 350.00	\$	875.00
3/8/2021	Rania Tootla	RXT	Add exhibit numbers into mediation statement, format statement, finalize, send to mediator and opposing counsel.	0.9	\$ 270.00	\$	243.00
3/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Finalize mediation statement; supervise RXT to finalize and submit to mediator and opposing counsel; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	1.1	\$ 350.00	\$	385.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Call with MJF and co counsel re damages calculations.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with client Plaintiff R. Seltz, MJF re mediation, damages.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
3/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with client Plaintiff R. Seltz, DAA re mediation, damages.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
3/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Call with DAA and co-counsel re damages calculations.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review damages calculations, Bursey settlement, previous client call notes in preparation for call with client.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review intake notes, document production re damages in preparation for mediation.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
3/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Call with DAA in preparation for call with co counsel.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re supplemental data.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re damages.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated damages.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re damages.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re mediation statement, damages.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re call to discuss damages.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Follow up conference with MJF re mediation, damages.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with RXT re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
3/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Follow up conference with DAA re mediation, damages.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
3/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft mediation cheat sheet.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Correspondence from MJF, co counsel re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/8/2021	Rania Tootla	RXT	Telephone conference with MJF re mediation statement.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
3/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review update mediation statement and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
3/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft correspondence with opposing counsel re relevant statute of limitations, headcount, and opt-in collective membership; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	2.6	\$ 350.00	\$	910.00
3/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review damages calculations from co-counsel L. Pardell and S. Grimes; correspondence re same; create simple Seltz damages model to create demands for mediation.	1.7	\$ 350.00	\$	595.00
3/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Team conference call with MJF re damages, mediation preparation.	0.8	\$ 600.00	\$	480.00
3/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Team conference call with DAA re damages, mediation preparation.	0.8	\$ 350.00	\$	280.00
3/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review communication from opposing counsel and research previous case documents for the response; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
3/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft mediation cheat sheet.	0.4	\$ 350.00		140.00
3/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated damages calculations and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.3	\$ 600.00	Ţ	180.00
3/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re damages calculations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA re correspondence with opposing counsel re statute of limitations, headcount and workweeks.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 101 of 124

3/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with MJF re correspondence with opposing counsel re statute of limitations, headcount and workweeks.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
3/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re data issues for follow up with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
3/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise email correspondence to opposing counsel re data issues for mediation.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
3/10/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Pardell re revising mediation damages and headcount and review models; create damages and headcount summary to send to opposing counsel; create Seltz internal damages model for use at mediation.	2.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 735.00
3/10/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review of final damages calculations and correspondence with MJF, co counsel re same.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
3/10/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise and send correspondence with opposing counsel re data issues for mediation.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
3/10/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF and co counsel re damages calculations.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
3/10/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re damages calculations.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
3/10/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA and co-counsel re damages calculations.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
3/10/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re damages calculations.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
3/10/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, co-counsel L. Parcel re damages calculations.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
3/10/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Additional correspondence with co counsel re data questions for opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
3/10/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re damages calculations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
3/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Attend mediation.	11.1	\$ 600.00	6,660.00
3/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Attend mediation.	9.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 3,325.00
3/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Team conference call in preparation for mediation.	1.0	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00
3/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Team conference call in preparation for mediation.	1.0	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00
3/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re mediation prep and negotiation strategy.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$ 360.00
3/11/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re mediation prep and negotiation strategy.	0.6	\$ 990.00	\$ 594.00
3/11/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review mediation papers and conferences and correspondence with DAA during mediation.	0.5	\$ 990.00	\$ 495.00
3/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Bursey settlement, prior demands and draft memorandum re same.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$ 300.00
3/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Pre-mediation conference with MJF re settlement demand.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$ 300.00
3/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Pre-mediation conference with DAA re settlement demand.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
3/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA to prepare for mediation.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
3/11/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review mediation correspondence.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
3/11/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review mediation brief.	0.1	\$ 990.00	99.00
3/11/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with co-counsel P. Meireles re negotiation strategy.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
3/12/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re tasks and scheduling call to discuss proposed settlement amount.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
3/12/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with co-counsel P. Meireles re negotiation strategy.	0.3	\$ 990.00	\$ 297.00
3/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
3/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re administration bids.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
3/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re status of settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
3/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research class and collective cases in front of J. Howell and in District Court of D.C. and firm cases to evaluate mediator's proposal; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	2.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 770.00
3/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review damages from co-counsel S. Grimes to evaluate settlement proposal and determine allocation for the different cases.	1.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 455.00
3/15/2021 3/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron Molly J. Frandsen	DAA MJF	Review judge precedent re FLSA cases. Draft rough bid request to settlement administrator as part of evaluating potential settlement; review bid; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	0.6	\$ 600.00 350.00	\$ 360.00 175.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 102 of 124

3/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF, co counsel re settlement status.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
3/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA, co counsel re settlement status.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
3/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re damages calculations, allocation formula.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
3/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re damages calculations, allocation formula.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
3/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review damages calculations, data in preparation for call with co counsel and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
3/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review damages calculations from co-counsel L. Pardell; correspondence re same.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
3/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Check client paystubs.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
3/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re settlement negotiations.	0.2	\$	350.00		70.00
3/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re settlement negotiations.	0.2	\$	600.00		120.00
3/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with client re scheduling call.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
3/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, client, re call with client.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
0/10/2021	Beliate 7t. Maiori		Correspondence with work, chemi, he can with chemic	0.1	Ψ	000.00	*	00.00
3/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re potential allocation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
3/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Follow up correspondence with Plaintiff R. Seltz re	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
3/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	scheduling call. Review distribution model to consider different	1.2	\$	350.00	\$	420.00
3/10/2021	ivioliy 3. Francisen	IVISI	allocations for settlement proposal; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.		J v	330.00	Ψ	420.00
3/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review damages calculations and potential allocations and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.8	\$	600.00	\$	480.00
3/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re damages calculations and allocation.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
3/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re damages calculations and allocation.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
3/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF, co-counsel re damages, allocation formula.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
3/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA, co-counsel re damages, allocation formula.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
3/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA and client re status of settlement negotiations.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
3/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF and client re status of settlement negotiations.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
3/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further revise allocation formulas and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
3/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review of damages calculations and allocation.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
3/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Further conference with DAA re allocations, prepraration for call with client.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
3/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further conference with MJF re allocation, preparation for call with client.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
3/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Research re fair labor standards act settlement approval in District Court of D.C.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
3/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review legal support for non-opt-ins versus opt-in allocation model.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
3/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re allocation formula.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
3/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re prepration for call with client.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
3/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re preparation for call with client.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
3/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re settlement allocation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
3/17/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re correspondence with client re accepting settlement proposal and term sheet.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
3/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence and text to client re settlement.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
3/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel, mediator re settlement.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
3/17/2021	Deirdro A Acron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re settlement.	0.1	· ·	600.00	¢	60.00
3/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone call with co-counsel L. Ho, mediator re	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00 60.00
3/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	settlement proposal. Conference with co-counsel L. Ho re settlement	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
			proposal.					

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 103 of 124

3/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Follow up correspondence with mediator re settlement proposal.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re call with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re term sheet.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Call with co-counsel L. Ho, opposing counsel T. Petrides re settlement terms.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
3/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re settlement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Follow up correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re venue, call to discuss settlement terms.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with co-counsel L. Ho, MJF re settlement terms.	1.0	\$ 600.00	\$	600.00
3/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with co-counsel L. Ho, DAA re settlement terms.	1.0	\$ 350.00	\$	350.00
3/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Research re Bristol Myers in District Court of D.C.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
3/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with JCS re venue questions.	0.3	\$ 350.00		105.00
3/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho, MJF, P. Meireles re potential settlement terms.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
3/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re Bristol Myers, venue.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
3/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re status of call with opposing counsel T. Petrides.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JCS re settlement approval.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/19/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re settlement.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
3/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Research re settlement approval and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
3/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research personal jurisdiction question for venue; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
3/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re settlement tasks, research.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
3/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re settlement tasks, research.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
3/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re settlement logistics.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60,00
3/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re settlement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, MJF re	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
3/23/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	settlement approval process. Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, DAA re	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
3/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	settlement approval process.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
			Correspondence with the National Employment Lawyer Association re settlement allocation.			,	
3/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence re allocation formula.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research approval of differing settlement allocation for non-op-ins and pace of approval in District Court of D.C. and ND Cal; correspondence with DAA, JCS, and other CAPG attorneys re same.	1.3	\$ 350.00	\$	455.00
3/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research whether objectors have brought Bristol- Meyers challenges; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
3/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re settlement terms.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/24/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re venue and settlement issues.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
3/24/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re venue and approval issues.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
3/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research approval venue; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.9	\$ 350.00	\$	315.00
3/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re settlement approval logistics, research.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
3/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re settlement approval logistics, research.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
3/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, G. Grimes, MJF re settlement logistics, drafting settlement papers.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
3/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re approval venue and drafting settlement agreement.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
3/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, G. Grimes, DAA re settlement logistics, drafting settlement papers.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
3/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re settlement logistics, drafting settlement papers.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 104 of 124

3/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re settlement logistics, drafting settlement papers.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
3/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft joint status report and send to DAA.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
3/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JCS, MJF re settlement approval	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
3/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review SCOTUS decision re Bristol Myers.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
3/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from JCS, MJF re settlement approval.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re settlement approval.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with client re settlement approval process.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with CMM, MJF re settlement approval logistics.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/25/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Locate and review prior motions relevant to	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
3/25/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	settlement approval issues. Correspond with team re prior motions relevant to settlement approval issues.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
3/25/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA and MJF re research for	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
3/25/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	approval issues. Correspondence with MJF re research for	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$	99.00
3/26/2021	Deirdre A, Aaron	DAA	settlement approval issues. Review and revise status report and send to co-	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$	360.00
3/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	counsel. Revise status report and send to opposing counsel;	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
5, 25, 252 1	mony of Francisch		correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	3.5	223.00	*	100.00
3/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re drafting settlement agreement.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
3/26/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA, MJF re settlement approval process.	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$	198.00
3/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS, MJF re settlement approval process.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
3/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re drafting settlement agreement.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
3/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with JMS, DAA re settlement approval process.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
3/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re consolidation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re follow up with opposing counsel re outstanding items.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research cases approving global settlements of multiple cases.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
3/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re approving global settlements of multiple cases.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
3/29/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft settlement agreement.	2.0	\$ 350.00	\$	700.00
3/29/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA; co-counsel; and opposing counsel re joint status report.	0.2	\$ 350.00		70.00
3/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review ND Cal rules re settlement approval.	0.1	\$ 600.00	¢	60.00
3/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Research ND Cal rules re settlement approval.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
3/29/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Update case memo.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
3/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendants edits to status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/30/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft settlement agreement; correspondence with DAA re same.	3.9	\$ 350.00		1,365.00
3/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re settlement agreement.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
3/30/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re settlement agreement.	0.4	\$ 350.00		140.00
3/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review prior hybrid agreements re opt out and objection rights and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.3	\$ 600.00		180.00
3/30/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save joint status report in related case to file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
3/31/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise settlement agreement.	1.7	\$ 600.00	\$	1,020.00
3/31/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review, finalize, and file joint status report; save docketed file; and calendar further report deadline.	0.7	\$ 270.00	\$	189.00
3/31/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/31/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re settlement agreement.		\$ 600.00		60.00
3/31/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review final status report for filing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/31/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re final status report for filing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/31/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JCS re approval motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
3/31/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re draft settlement agreement.		\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
			145.00mont.	!		Ь	

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 105 of 124

3/31/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and LXM re settlement agreement and website inquiries.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
4/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review and revise draft settlement agreement.	2.1	\$ 600.00	\$	1,260.00
4/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, co-counsel re draft settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
4/5/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise settlement agreement; correspondence with DAA re same.	2.8	\$ 350.00	\$	980.00
4/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, MJF re settlement agreement draft.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
4/5/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, DAA re settlement agreement draft.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
4/5/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review online submissions for response; and correspondence with GW and MJF re same.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
4/5/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re revisions to draft settlement agreement.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
4/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re revisions to draft settlement agreement.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
4/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review co-counsel edits to settlement agreement.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
4/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re call with co counsel, settlement draft.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
4/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re settlement agreement draft.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
4/6/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Search re client documents/production, and correspondence with MJF re same.	1.0	\$ 270.00	\$	270.00
4/6/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review and revisions to settlement agreement.	0.8	\$ 600.00	\$	480.00
4/6/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review online consent form submissions, and correspondence with DAA and MJF re consent to join.	0.7	\$ 270.00	\$	189.00
4/6/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review edits to settlement agreement from DAA; research PAGA question; correspondence with DAA and CAPG associates re same.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
4/6/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise settlement agreement incorporating edits from co-counsel; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
4/6/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further conference with MJF re settlement agreement issues.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
4/6/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Further conference with DAA re settlement agreement issues.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
4/6/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel P. Meireles re status of settlement negotiations.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
4/6/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM, DAA, and co-counsel re consent to join form in Dixon.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
4/6/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review CA caselaw re service award standard.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
4/6/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re CA caselaw re service award standard.	t	\$ 600.00	-	60.00
4/6/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save consent form to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
4/6/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with GW re consent form.	0.1	\$ 270.00		27.00
4/6/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho, MJF re revisions to settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
4/6/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM re client's W2 statement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
4/6/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF the settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
4/7/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review of additional co-counsel revisions to settlement agreement.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$	360.00
4/7/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise additional co-counsel edits to settlement agreement.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
4/7/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho re finalizing draft settlement agreement.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
4/7/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re status of settlement negotiations.	0.2	\$ 990.00	\$	198.00
4/7/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re status of settlement negotiations.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
4/7/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review co-counsel agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
4/7/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correpsondence to JMS re co-counsel agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
4/7/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re finalizing settlement agreement draft.	0.1	\$ 600.00		60.00
4/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re workweeks for settlement agreement.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
4/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review data for workweeks numbers.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·							

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 106 of 124

4/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re status of settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re data for workweeks numbers.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel L. Pardell and L. Ho re workweeks in the different categories of class members for settlement agreement.	0.8	\$ 350.00	\$ 280.00
4/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re workweek count.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review collective data	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re collective data.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/12/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise settlement agreement and review workweek data; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	1.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 420.00
4/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise settlement agreement, data.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
4/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, co-counsel re settlement agreement, data.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re draft settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re finalizing settlement agreement, data.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/12/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re CA case.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
4/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JMS re settlement status.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review MJF additional edits to settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re additional edits to settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/12/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Conference with DAA re case status.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
4/13/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re next steps on settlement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/13/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review final settlement agreement from co-counsel.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
4/13/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re final settlement agreement from co-counsel.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
4/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re status of settlement documents.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re scheduling conference to discuss settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
4/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel, MJF re call with opposing counsel to discuss settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re settlement agreement and update to client Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
4/20/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, opposing counsel re settlement agreement.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$ 360.00
4/20/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, L. Ho re call with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/21/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with JMS re case status.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/23/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re agreement, status report, and update to named Plaintiff.	0.2	\$ 350.00	70.00
4/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re summary of call with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re status of settlement agreement, status reports due next week.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re status reports.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re timing of filing for approval.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
4/27/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re case status, update to client.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/27/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re update to client.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/27/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re W-2.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/27/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft status update to client.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
4/27/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re status update to client.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
4/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review draft status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re draft status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
4/29/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save joint status report to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
4/29/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF and DAA re fee petition.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 107 of 124

4/29/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Calendar deadline for further joint status report and/or preliminary approval.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
4/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review order re additional status report.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
4/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with GW re notice website.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, co counsel, opposing counsel re edits to settlement documents.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
5/4/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re settlement agreement.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
5/6/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re follow up with client.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/6/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Send client his W2 form.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
5/6/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re client's W2 form and re settlement agreement.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
5/6/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re follow up with client.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/8/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with mediator.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
5/10/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review Defendant's edits to settlement agreement and correspondence with DAA re same.	2.5	\$	350.00	\$	875.00
5/10/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re call to discuss Defendants' settlement edits with co-counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/10/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re reviewing Defendants' agreement edits.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/10/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re call to discuss Defendant's agreement edits.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA and co-counsel re Defendant's settlement agreement edits.	1.0	\$	350.00	\$	350.00
5/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with MJF and co-counsel re	1.0	\$	600.00	\$	600.00
5/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Defendant's settlement agreement edits. Review defense counsel, co-counsel, MJF edits and	0.7	\$	600.00	\$	420.00
5/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	comments to settlement agreement. Review DAA's comments on opposing counsel's edits to settlement agreement; correspondence re	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
5/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	same. Telephone conference with DAA re Defendant's	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
5/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	settlement agreement edits. Telephone conference with MJF re Defendant's	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
5/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	settlement agreement edits. Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
0/11/2021	Wolly J. Francisen	IVIST	scheduling conference with Defendant and agreement follow up.	0.2	Ψ	330.00	Ψ	70.00
5/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review Defendant's proposed stipulations to file amended complaint and stay related cases.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
5/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re scheduling call with opposing counsel, checking damages and schedule in settlement agreement.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re outstanding tasks.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/12/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review tolling and statutes of limitations in agreement; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
5/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re stipulation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re call with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/13/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review agreement and create timeline of the parties proposals; correspondence with DAA and co counsel re same.	0.9	\$	350.00	\$	315.00
5/13/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendant edits re covered periods, check mediation damages re same, and Correspondence with MJF re settlement timeline and scope of covered period.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
5/13/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re settlement terms.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
5/13/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re settlement terms.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
5/13/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review settlement schedule.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel GBDH, MJF, opposing counsel re settlement agreement.	0.9	\$	600.00	\$	540.00
5/14/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with co-counsel GBDH, DAA, and opposing counsel re settlement agreement.	0.9	\$	350.00	\$	315.00
5/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re drafting settlement notices.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
5/14/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re drafting settlement notices	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
5/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, G. Grimes re drafting additional settlement documents.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
5/17/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft notices, claim form, and reminder notice.	2.7	\$	350.00	\$	945.00
5/17/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review updated class list from opposing counsel;	0.9	\$	350.00		315.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 108 of 124

5/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review data and correspondence with co counsel re same, scheduling internal check in.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
5/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review sample notices and reminders.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re sample notices and reminders.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re notice methods.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re call with co-counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/18/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review settlement agreement edits and spreadsheet from co-counsel and add additional edits; correspondence with DAA re same.	2.0	\$ 350.00	\$	700.00
5/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise draft notices.	1.2	\$ 600.00	\$	720.00
5/18/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise notices incorporating edits from DAA and send to co-counsel.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
5/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re class list.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/18/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re class list from Defendant.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
5/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re draft notices.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re Northern District of California settlement approval guidelines.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated data, calculations, updated draft settlement agreement and comments to MJF re same.	1.4	\$ 600.00	\$	840.00
5/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, G. Grimes, MJF re settlement agreement edits, notices, allocation.	1.2	\$ 600.00	\$	720.00
5/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise settlement agreement post-conference with co-counsel.	1.1	\$ 350.00	\$	385.00
5/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, G. Grimes, DAA re settlement agreement edits, notices, allocation.	1.2	\$ 350.00	\$	420.00
5/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re settlement terms.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$	240.00
5/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re settlement terms	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
5/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re collective notices.		\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re revising settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with JCS re settlement agreement questions.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
5/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re revising settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
5/20/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise settlement agreement; research release language approved by Judge; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	1.6	\$ 350.00	\$	560.00
5/20/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further review of settlement agreement edits and correspondence with MJF re same.	1.3	\$ 600.00	\$	780.00
5/20/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise settlement notices incorporating edits from co-counsel; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	0.9	\$ 350.00	\$	315.00
5/20/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft Private Attorney Generals Act enclosure letter.	. 0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
5/20/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re settlement agreement edits.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/20/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re scope of release.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/20/2021 5/20/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA DAA	Review co-counsel edits to notice. Correspondence with MJF re co-counsel's edit to	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00 60.00
5/20/2021	Doirdro A Asses	DAA	notice. Review updated data spreadsheet.	0.1	 600.00	<u>ф</u>	60.00
5/20/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel re updated data spreadsheet.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/20/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re PAGA language.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/21/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise settlement agreement and send to DAA and co-counsel.		\$ 350.00	\$	420.00
5/21/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise settlement notices and send to opposing counsel.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
5/21/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re settlement agreement edits.	0.2	\$ 350.00		70.00
5/21/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re settlement agreement edits.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
5/21/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re status report filing.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
5/21/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re settlement agreement edits.		\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
5/21/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re notices.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 109 of 124

5/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review workweek data from co-counsel; correspondence with co-counsel and DAA re same.	1.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 385.00
5/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with co-counsel, DAA re settlement agreement.	0.9	\$ 350.00	\$ 315.00
5/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel, MJF re settlement agreement.	0.9	\$ 600.00	\$ 540.00
5/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review edits to notice from co-counsel.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
5/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re edits to notice from co- counsel.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
5/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
5/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise class/collective notices incorporating edits from co-counsel; correspondence re same.	0.8	\$ 350.00	\$ 280.00
5/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise notices incorporating additional edits from co-counsel and send to opposing counsel; correspondence with co-counsel and DAA re same.	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$ 245.00
5/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re finalizing settlement notices, administration bids, gathering information for preliminary approval briefing.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
5/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re finalizing settlement notices, administration bids, gathering information for preliminary approval briefing.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$ 300.00
5/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and pull information for preliminary approval filing; correspondence with DAA and RWD re same.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
5/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re scope of release.	0.1	\$ 600.00	 60.00
5/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re revisions to notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Additional correspondence with MJF re notices.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence, data re total workweeks.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re opt in notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from co-counsel re settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
5/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
5/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Gather information from comparable cases for preliminary approval; correspondence with DAA and CAPG re same.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00
5/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re data points for preliminary approval motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re status reports.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re status reports.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with administration and DAA re bids.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
5/27/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft chart of comparable settlements for preliminary approval procedural guidelines requirement and gather other case law support for motion; correspondence with DAA re same.	2.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 840.00
5/27/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft status report and check case dockets; correspondence with DAA, JLM, and MCD re same.	0.5	\$ 350.00	175.00
5/27/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review settlement administrator bids; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
5/27/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Draft Dixon case joint status reports.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
5/27/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re joint status reports.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/27/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise draft status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
5/27/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re draft status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	 60.00
5/27/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/27/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with parastaffing re status report filling.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft joint status reports; correspondence with DAA; co-counsel; and opposing counsel re same.		\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
5/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA, JMS, and co-counsel re authority and comparable settlements for preliminary approval.		\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
5/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with administration and DAA re settlement administration bids.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
5/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re status reports to courts.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 110 of 124

5/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review chart re comparator settlement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re comparator settlement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re administrator bids.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel, MJF re joint status reports.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
5/28/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review status report.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
5/28/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with MJF re approval filing and strategy for same.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/1/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save joint status report to case file, and calendar further report deadline.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
6/1/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save status reports in related cases to file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
6/1/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save clerk's notice setting deadlines to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
6/2/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review draft stipulation to stay; chart of other settlements for approval motion, and other misc. correspondence re settlement negotiatons.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
6/3/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re case status.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/3/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with client re status of settlement negotiations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and update chart of opt in dates and damages and check against prior data; correspondence with L. Ho re same.	0.7	\$ 600.00	\$ 420.00
6/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re potential Dixon II class member.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review intake info for opt-in and further correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re including in Dixon II.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/8/2021 I	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research cases for supporting agreement in preliminary approval motion; correspondence re same with co-counsel and DAA.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00
6/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re administration bids, opt-in data, comparator cases for preliminary approval brief.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
6/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re administration bids, opt-in data, comparator cases for preliminary approval brief.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
6/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and administrators re administration bids.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
6/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re pending tasks.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence re settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
6/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
6/8/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save order re joint status report, and update calendar.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
6/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re call with opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
6/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF, opposing counsel, and co- counsel GBDH re settlement agreement.	1.3	\$ 600.00	780.00
6/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA opposing counsel, and co- counsel GBDH re settlement agreement.	1.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 455.00
6/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and correspondence with DAA and co- counsel re comparator cases and support for preliminary approval motion.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
6/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with CAPG, DAA, and co-counsel re administrator bids.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
6/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re administrator.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re comparator cases for preliminary approval.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review current draft of settlement in preparation for call with opposing counsel.		\$ 600.00	60.00
6/10/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re stipulations, amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review cases for preliminary approval requirements; send to co-counsel; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$ 245.00
6/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review final summary of comparator cases for preliminary approval brief.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/14/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with Opt-In Plaintiff C. Chester re dates of employment and manner of pay; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 111 of 124

	6/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.6	\$ 600.00	\$	360.00
Mark J. Frandsen MJF Conference with DAA re decisimations in support of 0.3 \$ \$50,00 \$ 109,00 \$	6/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.3	\$ 600.00	\$	180.00
Delidre A. Aaron DAA Deridenter A. Delidenter A. Del	6/14/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re declarations in support of	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
	6/14/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
	6/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review Defendant's edits to settlement agreement. 0,1 \$ 350,00 \$	6/14/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel G. Grimes re	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
Settlement agreement. Settlement. Settlement	6/14/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	11 1 3 11	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conference with co-courses (GEDH, DAA re finalizing settlement, preliminary approval appears	6/14/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
26/14/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Raview Opt-In Plantiff C. Chester's compensation 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00 26/14/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re C. Chester's 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00 26/14/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Circulate summary of Defendant's additional 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00 26/14/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Circulate summary of Defendant's additional 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00 26/14/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review sample preliminary approval declaration 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00 26/14/2021 Lynsey Major LXM Research re and draft JCS notice of appearance 1.4 \$ 270.00 \$ 78.00 26/14/2021 Lynsey Major LXM Research re and draft JCS notice of appearance 1.4 \$ 270.00 \$ 78.00 26/14/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Prepare declaration of clent Plaintiff R. Seltz in 1.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 420.00 26/14/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Draft declaration in support of preliminary approval 1.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 420.00 26/14/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Draft declaration in support of preliminary approval 0.9 \$ 600.00 \$ 640.00 26/14/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Telephone conference with client R. Seltz to draft 0.8 \$ 350.00 \$ 260.00 26/14/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Telephone conference with client R. Seltz to draft 0.8 \$ 350.00 \$ 245.00 26/14/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Further drafting of declaration in support of preliminary approval. 2.5	6/14/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with co-counsel GBDH, DAA re	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
Side Deirdra A. Aaron DAA Carrespondence with MUF re C. Chester's Deirdra A. Aaron DAA Circulate summary of Defendant's additional Deirdra A. Deirdra A. Aaron DAA Circulate summary of Defendant's additional Deirdra A. Deirdra D. Deirdra A. Deirdra A. Deirdra D. Deirdra A. Deirdra D. Deirdra A. Deirdra D. De	6/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Opt-In Plaintiff C. Chester's compensation	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
Delidra A. Aaron DAA Circulate summary of Defendant's additional 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00	6/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re C. Chester's	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
	6/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Circulate summary of Defendant's additional	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
No.	6/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review sample preliminary approval declaration	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
Molly J. Frandsen MJF Prepare declaration of client Plaintiff R. Seltz in support of preliminary approval motion; review time entries re time Seltz spent on case.	6/15/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research re and draft JCS notice of appearance	1.4	\$ 270.00	\$	378.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Draft declaration in support of preliminary approval. 0.9 \$ 600.00 \$ 540.00	6/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Prepare declaration of client Plaintiff R. Seltz in support of preliminary approval motion; review time	1.2	\$ 350.00	\$	420.00
declaration in support of preliminary approval.	6/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.9	\$ 600.00	\$	540.00
Molly J. Frandsen MJF Supervise LXM to draft notice of appearances and pro hac vice motion; review drafts; correspondence with LXM JLM, and DAA re same.	6/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with client R. Seltz to draft	0.8	\$ 350.00	\$	280.00
Delidre A. Aaron DAA Further drafting of declaration in support of preliminary approval.	6/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	M.IF	1	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$	245 00
Image: Content of the Content of t	G/ 16/1202	meny or managem		pro hac vice motion; review drafts; correspondence				
Lynsey Major LXM Check case file re certificates of good standing, and 0.4 \$ 270.00 \$ 108.00	6/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.5	\$ 600.00	\$	300.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel re remaining 0.2 \$600.00 \$120.00	6/15/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Check case file re certificates of good standing, and	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$	108.00
Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with JLM re certificate of good standing and apply for same. S/15/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re attorney declaration and fee information in support of preliminary approval. S/15/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review and revise client declaration. O.2 \$600.00 \$120.00	6/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re remaining	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$	120.00
Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re attorney declaration and fee information in support of preliminary approval.	6/15/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with JLM re certificate of good	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$	54.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review and revise client declaration. D.2 \$ 600.00 \$ 120.00	6/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re attorney declaration and fee information in support	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with opposing counsel re 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00	0/45/0004	Deinster A. Arman	DAA	1 2 11	0.0	000.00	Φ.	400.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with JCS re case status, filing 0.1 \$600.00 \$60.00 \$	6/15/2021			Correspondence with opposing counsel re				60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re client declaration for preliminary approval. Solution	6/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with JCS re case status, filing	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with co-counsel re fees. D.1 \$600.00 \$60.00	6/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re client declaration for	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review fee entries. D.1 \$600.00 \$60.00	6/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	1	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re notices of appearance, pro hac vice motion. Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re administrator bids. Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with JLM re notice of appearance. Lynsey Major LXM Draft MJF notice of appearance. Lynsey Major LXM Draft MJF notice of appearance. Lynsey Major LXM Finalize MJF notice of appearance. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Edit declaration of client Plaintiff R. Seltz in support of motion for preliminary approval incorporating edits from DAA. Send declaration of client Plaintiff R. Seltz to cocounsel.	6/15/2021		DAA	Review fee entries.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re notices of appearance, pro hac vice motion. Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re administrator bids. Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with JLM re notice of appearance. Lynsey Major LXM Draft MJF notice of appearance. Lynsey Major LXM Draft MJF notice of appearance. Lynsey Major LXM Finalize MJF notice of appearance. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Edit declaration of client Plaintiff R. Seltz in support of motion for preliminary approval incorporating edits from DAA. Send declaration of client Plaintiff R. Seltz to cocounsel.	6/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re administrator bids. 0.1 \$600.00 \$60.00	6/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re notices of	0.1	600.00	\$	60.00
Lynsey Major LXM Correspondence with JLM re notice of appearance. 0.1 \$ 270.00 \$ 27.00	6/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.1	\$ 600.00	\$	60.00
Edit declaration of client Plaintiff R. Seltz to co-counsel. Sel	6/15/2021							27.00
Edit declaration of client Plaintiff R. Seltz to co-counsel. Sel	6/15/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Draft MJF notice of appearance.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$	27.00
Molly J. Frandsen MJF Edit declaration of client Plaintiff R. Seltz in support of motion for preliminary approval incorporating edits from DAA. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Send declaration of client Plaintiff R. Seltz to co-counsel.	6/15/2021							27.00
counsel.	6/15/2021			Edit declaration of client Plaintiff R. Seltz in support of motion for preliminary approval incorporating				35.00
	6/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
	6/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.1	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 112 of 124

6/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re administrator re bid.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
6/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel re named Plaintiff draft declaration.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
6/15/2021 6/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron Lynsey Major	DAA LXM	Correspondence with MJF re client declaration. Categorize and review fees and costs for	0.1 1.0	\$	600.00 270.00	\$ \$	60.00 270.00
6/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	preliminary approval, and correspondence with MJF re same. Correspondence with co-counsel, DAA, and LXM,	0.7	\$	350.00	\$	245.00
0/10/2021	Wony 3. Francisch	IVISI	re reviewing fees and create summaries for declarations in support of preliminary approval and final approval.	0.7	Ψ	330.00	Ψ	243.00
6/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re allocation formula.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
6/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with MJF re settlement negotiations and declarations in support of preliminary approval motion.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
6/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA re settlement negotiations and declarations in support of preliminary approval motion.	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
6/16/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Request certificate of good standing for DAA, and correspondence with DAA re same.	0.4	\$	270.00	\$	108.00
6/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Check updated allocations and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.3	\$	600.00	\$	180.00
6/16/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Research local rules re pro hac vice requirements, and correspondence with DAA and MJF re same.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
6/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review data re Defendant's workweek allocation proposal; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
6/16/2021 6/16/2021	Lynsey Major Lynsey Major	LXM	Revise and finalize DAA's pro hac vice application. Review docket and individual rules re pro hac vice motions.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00 81.00
6/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with LXM re fee information in support of preliminary and final approval.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
6/16/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with MJF re preliminary costs and fees.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
6/16/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Telephone conference with MJF re fee information in support of preliminary and final approval.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
6/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with LXM, JLM, DAA, and co- counsel re notice of appearance and pro hac vice motion.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
6/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho re allocation formula, finalizing settlement.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
6/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from MJF, co-counsel re client declaration.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review notices of appearance, pro hac vice application.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, LXM re notices of appearance, pro hac vice application.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re updates to client declaration.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re fee summaries for preliminary approval motion.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/16/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save certificate of good standing to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/16/2021 6/16/2021	Lynsey Major Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Format pro hac vice application. Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re	0.1	\$ \$	270.00 600.00	\$	27.00 60.00
6/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	settlement allocation. Correspondence with DAA re declaration of Plaintiff		\$	350.00	\$	35.00
6/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	R. Seltz. Review correspondence from co-counsel L. Ho to	0.1	°	350.00	\$	35.00
	·		opposing counsel re settlement agreement negotiations.					
6/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re allocation formula and correspondence with opposing counsel re same.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/17/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and edit final settlement agreement.	2.0	\$	350.00		700.00
6/17/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review and format costs and fee summaries for preliminary approval motion.	1.6	\$		Ÿ	432.00
6/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review final settlement agreement edits and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.6	\$	600.00	\$	360.00
6/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Telephone conference with MJF re outstanding items for finalizing settlement.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
6/17/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA re outstanding items for finalizing settlement.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
6/17/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with potential administrators re follow up on bids for administration.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 113 of 124

\$ 108.00 \$ 120.00 \$ 70.00 \$ 70.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 70.00 \$ 70.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 70.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 60.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 60.00 \$ 27.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 27.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 60.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 35.00 \$ 35.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 35.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 60.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 60.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 60.00
\$ 35.00
\$ 35.00
\$ 35.00
\$ 60.00
\$ 60.00
\$ 700.00
\$ 240.00
\$ 180.00
\$ 81.00
\$ 120.00
\$ 120.00
\$ 70.00
\$ 70.00
\$ 60.00
\$ 60.00
\$ 60.00
\$ 60.00
¢ 00.00
\$ 99.00 \$ 60.00
\$ 60.00
\$ 60.00
\$ 60.00
\$ 60.00
•
\$ 60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 114 of 124

6/21/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, LXM re final filing of stipulations.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/21/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review declaration of co-counsel P. Miereles in support of preliminary approval.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
6/21/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re preliminary approval.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
6/21/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with potential administrator re settlement administration bids.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
6/21/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re settlement administration bids.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
6/21/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence re assembling fee petition and other related issues.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
6/21/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	File joint status report.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/21/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with DAA and MJF re joint status report.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/21/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save docketed report to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
6/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel, DAA, JMS, and potential administrator re settlement bid.	0.8	\$	350.00	Ċ	280.00
6/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise notices incorporating edits from co-counsel; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	0.7	\$	350.00	\$	245.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review final drafts of agreement and exhibits and correspondence with opposing counsel re same.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re finalizing outstanding settlement documents, administrator bids, preparing for preliminary approval.	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
6/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re finalizing outstanding settlement documents, administrator bids, preparing for preliminary approval.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
6/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re preliminary approval paper details.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
6/22/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Format DAA's pro hac vice and MJS and JCS's notice of appearances in related case.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re co counsel declaration, fee summary for same.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review opt-in notice re release language.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re opt-in notice re release langage.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/22/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save joint status reports in related cases to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review final updated agreement draft.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM re formatting issues of agreement draft.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/22/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Format settlement agreement.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/22/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save notice of appearances and DAA pro hac vice filed in related case to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re finalizing claims administration.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re settlement agreement attachments.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho, MJF re final edits to settlement agreement.		\$	600.00	Ċ	60.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re settlement administrator.	0.1	\$	600.00	·	60.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho, opposing counsel re administrator and language re opting out.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re coordinating with co- counsel for preliminary approval filing.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and LXM re reviewing fee records for declaration of DAA in support of preliminary approval.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
6/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise LXM and JLM to file notice of appearance and pro hac vice application in Dixon case.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
6/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with settlement administrator re bid.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
6/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from L. Ho, MJF re preliminary approval filing.	0.1	\$	600.00	,	60.00
6/22/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re claims administrator.	0.1	\$	990.00		99.00
6/22/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with MJF re selecting	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 115 of 124

6/23/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and edit motion for preliminary approval drafted by co-counsel; correspondence with DAA re same.	1.0	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00
6/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Begin reviewing draft approval motion.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
6/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further revise co-counsel declaration for preliminary approval.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
6/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with SLG re declaration of preliminary approval, pro hac vice motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/23/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save order granting DAA's pro hac vice admission to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
6/23/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Correspondence with accounting re updated fees and costs.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
6/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with LXM, JLM re co-counsel pro hac vice motions.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Additional correspondence with SLG re fee summary for preliminary approval, pro hac vice applications.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re DC allegations in second amended complaint	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/23/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from defense counsel re settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
6/23/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review Dixon second amended complaint drafted by co-counsel.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
6/23/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re second ameded complaint drafted by co-counsel.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
6/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA; CAPG; and co-counsel re settlement administrator bid and information for preliminary approval motion.	1.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 385.00
6/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel GBDH, MJF re approval motion, second amended complaint, timeline for preliminary approval filing.	0.8	\$ 600.00	\$ 480.00
6/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with co-counsel GBDH, DAA re approval motion, second amended complaint, timeline for preliminary approval filing.	0.8	\$ 350.00	\$ 280.00
6/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and edit preliminary approval motion; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$ 245.00
6/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise preliminary approval motion.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$ 360.00
6/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and edit second amended complaint; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
6/24/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Prepare JMS pro hac vice application in related case.	0.4	\$ 270.00	\$ 108.00
6/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re preliminary approval motion, administrator.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
6/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re preliminary approval motion, administrator.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
6/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re preliminary approval motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review draft second amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re second amended complaint.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re award calculations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re preliminary approval motion.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
6/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise LXM and JLM to draft and file pro hac vice motion for JMS.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
6/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with administrator and DAA re bid, average awards, and other cases with CPT for preliminary approval papers.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00
6/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise Notices; correspondence with DAA and co- counsel and send to opposing counsel.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
6/25/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Review and update fee and cost summaries.	0.5	\$ 270.00	\$ 135.00
6/25/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Quality check fees and costs.	0.2	\$ 270.00	54.00
6/25/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save docketed pro hac vice motion of JMS to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	27.00
6/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re final settlement agreement, pro hac vice admissions.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re individual award calculations, settlement administration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review revised notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJFJ re revised notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and LXM re fee review.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 116 of 124

6/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF in preparation for call with client.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$ 360.00
6/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA in preparation for call with client.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00
6/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re tasks for finalizing settlement, approval motion.	0.3	\$ 600.00	\$ 180.00
6/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re tasks for finalizing settlement, approval motion.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
6/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise BXB to send settlement agreement to Plaintiff R. Seltz.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
6/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise declaration of DAA in support of preliminary approval.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
6/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re pro hac vice motion, declaration for preliminary approval.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with client re settlement agreement, scheduling call to discuss same.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re cy pres designee.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re cy pres proposal.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Call with MJF, client re settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re preliminary approval.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
6/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Call with DAA, client re settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
6/28/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review settlement administrator correspondence.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
6/29/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise DAA declaration in support of preliminary approval incorporating fees & costs and other additional information; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	1.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 455.00
6/29/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	DAA and send to co-counsel.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
6/29/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Final review of revised agreement; supervise BXB to send to client via DocuSign; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re finalizing declarations, edits to approval brief and notices, finalizing fees and costs for approval motion.	0.5	\$ 600.00	\$ 300.00
6/29/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re finalizing declarations, edits to approval brief and notices, finalizing fees and costs for approval motion.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise updated draft approval declaration and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review P. Meireles declaration, pro hac vice motion and correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re same.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re cy pres, updated settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re cy pres, updated settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review costs and fee summary.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re costs and fee summary.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review opposing counsel edits to draft notices.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re defendants' revision to settlement notices.		\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Defendants' edits to approval motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with team re Defendant's edits to approval motion.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re final settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co counsel re Defendants notice edits.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re final settlement agreement.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated client declaration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re updated client declaration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
6/29/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise declaration of named Plaintiff R. Seltz and send to DAA.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
6/29/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Send declaration of client R. Seltz to DAA.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
6/29/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re edits to preliminary approval motion.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 117 of 124

			finalizing settlement agreement with signatures and exhibits, review multiple versions.			350.00	\$	315.00
6/30/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise and finalize declaration of DAA in support of motion for preliminary approval.	0.7	\$	350.00	\$	245.00
6/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review updated client declaration, updated declaration in support of preliminary approval, and correspondence with MJF, co-counsel G. Grimes re same.	0.5	\$	600.00	\$	300.00
6/30/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Supervise VXY to finalize and send via DocuSign declaration of DAA and Plaintiff R. Seltz in support of motion for preliminary approval.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
6/30/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel, DAA, and JLM re filing stipulation to stay Seltz case.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
6/30/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise and finalize declaration of client R. Seltz in support of motion for preliminary approval.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
6/30/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with client R. Seltz re declaration in support of preliminary approval.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
6/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, co-counsel G. Grimes re final exhibits to settlement.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, co-counsel G. Grimes re filing stipulations.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re data points for preliminary approval motion.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re declaration.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence re documents for settlement approval, status of declarations, etc.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re documents for settlement approval, status of declarations, etc.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re stipulation to file amended complaint.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/30/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Connference with DAA re douments for settlement approval, status of declarations, etc.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
6/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles, co counsel re pro hac vice motion.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with opposing counsel re final settlement agreement, filing stipulations.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
6/30/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re declaration of co- counsel P. Meireles in support of motion for preliminary approval.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
7/1/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise declaration of co-counsel P. Meireles in support of preliminary approval and send to co-counsel.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
7/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re final co-counsel P. Meireles declaration.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re stipulation re stay.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/1/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re preliminary approval filing.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
7/1/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review amended complaint and order re same.	0.1	\$	990.00	\$	99.00
7/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review court order re stay, further status report.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
7/6/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel P. Meireles re pro hac vice motion.	0.1	\$	600.00	·	60.00
7/6/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence re settlement issues.	0.1	\$	990.00		99.00
7/7/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and administrator re preliminary approval hearing.	0.3	\$	350.00		105.00
7/7/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJFJ re settlement approval next steps.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/8/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save preliminary approval motion to case file.	0.2	\$	270.00		54.00
7/8/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save joint stipulation to file second amended complaint to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/8/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save stipulation to stay pending FA to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
7/8/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save order granting leave to file second amended complaint to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/8/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save second amended complaint to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
7/8/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save order re status report to case file, and calendar deadline for same.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
7/16/2021	Lynsey Major	LXM	Save Defendant's response to PA Motion to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00	\$	27.00
•			Hadata and manage	0.7	\$	270.00	\$	189.00
7/19/2021 7/19/2021	Lynsey Major Molly J. Frandsen	LXM MJF	Update case memo. Correspondence with DAA and BXS re paralegal	0.7	Ψ	350.00		70.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 118 of 124

7/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re paralegal staffing, preparation for final approval.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/20/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re preliminary approval hearing.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/20/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and JLM re preliminary approval hearing logistics.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
7/22/2021	Deirdre A, Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re approval hearing.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re preliminary approval	0.1	\$	350.00		35.00
7/26/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	hearing. Correspondence with co-counsel and DAA re	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
			preparing for preliminary approval hearing.					
7/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review new docket entry.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
7/26/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re settlement approval hearing.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/27/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft joint status report in Seltz action; correspondence with DAA and opposing counsel re same.	0.6	\$	350.00	\$	210.00
7/27/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re joint status report.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
7/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review joint status report.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
7/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re joint status report.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
7/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with opposing counsel re joint	0.1	\$	350.00		35.00
	Í		status report.				·	
7/30/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Finalize joint status report and supervise MXT to finalize and JLM to file; correspondence with DAA	0.5	\$	350.00	\$	175.00
			and defense counsel re same.					
7/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review status report.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
7/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re status report.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/2/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re preliminary approval hearing.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
8/2/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re preliminary approval hearing.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
8/2/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MFJ and co-counsel re preliminary approval hearing.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/2/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA and co-counsel re preliminary approval hearing.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
8/2/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and BXB re paralegal staffing and fee review.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
8/3/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft preliminary approval cheat sheet and send to DAA.	0.7	\$	350.00	\$	245.00
8/3/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Prepare fee review assignment for motion for attorneys' fees.	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
8/4/2021	Christopher Truong	CXT	Telephone conference with MJF re case background and next steps.	0.3	\$	270.00	\$	81.00
8/4/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with CXT re case background and next steps.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
8/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review settlement summary sheet in preparation	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	for preliminary approval hearing. Correspondence with MJF re settlement summary	0.1	\$	600.00	¢	60.00
0/4/2021	Delitite A. Aaron	DAA	sheet in preparation for preliminary approval hearing.	0.1	J P	000.00	φ	00.00
8/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review order vacating hearing.	0.1	\$	600.00	ď	60.00
8/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re order vacating	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
0/4/0004	Mall I Franks	N 4 1 5	hearing.	0.4		050.00	Φ.	05.00
8/4/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re vacated hearing.	0.1	\$	350.00		35.00
8/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review Seltz order re status report.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
8/5/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review order re supplemental briefing; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	0.3	\$	350.00	\$	105.00
8/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re call to discuss supplemental approval submission.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review order re supplemental briefing.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/6/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research for supplemental preliminary approval briefing; correspondence with CAPG and JCS re same.	0.6	\$	350.00		210.00
8/6/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Call with MJF and co-counsel re supplemental preliminary approval submission.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
8/6/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Call with DAA and co-counsel re supplemental	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
8/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	preliminary approval submission. Research and draft supplemental briefing and revise notices to respond to Court's request for supplemental preliminary approval briefing;	1.9	\$	350.00	\$	665.00
			correspondence with JCS re same.					

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 119 of 124

8/10/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and draft supplemental briefing responses and revise notices; correspondence with JCS, CMM, JMS, and co-counsel re same.	1.8	\$ 350.00	\$ 630.00
8/10/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with JCS re supplemental preliminary approval briefing.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
8/10/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with team re settlement approval issues.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
8/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and draft supplemental approval briefing; correspondence with JCS, DAA, JMS, and co-counsel re same.	4.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 1,575.00
8/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from MJF, JCS, co-counsel re supplemental settlement approval submission, updates to notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re supplemental approval submission.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/11/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review research and correspondence re supplemental approval briefing.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
8/12/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Research and draft supplemental preliminary approval briefing; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	3.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 1,120.00
8/12/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re revised notice.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
8/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re supplemental settlement approval submission.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re supplemental settlement approval submission.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/12/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Review correspondence re supplemental approval briefing.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
8/13/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review edits to notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/13/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re edits to notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/13/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise notices and send to opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
8/13/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re revisions to notice.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
8/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise supplemental briefing re preliminary approval and correspondence with MJF, co-counsel re same.	0.6	\$ 600.00	\$ 360.00
8/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review edits from DAA re supplemental preliminary approval briefing.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
8/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise sections for supplemental briefing on preliminary approval and correspondence with MJF re same.	1.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 660.00
8/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF and co-counsel re supplemental preliminary approval submission.	0.7	\$ 600.00	\$ 420.00
8/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA and co-counsel supplemental preliminary approval submission.	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$ 245.00
8/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and edit preliminary approval briefing drafted by co-counsel; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00
8/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft declaration for DAA; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	0.5	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00
8/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further conference with MJF re supplemental preliminary approval filing.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
8/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Further conference with DAA re supplemental preliminary approval filling.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
8/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review edits from co-counsel to preliminary approval supplemental briefing; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
8/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review further edits to supplemental briefing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re edits to supplemental briefing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review co counsel edits to supplemental settlement submission.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/17/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Revise supplemental briefing and review exhibits; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	2.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 770.00
8/17/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft DAA declaration iso supplemental briefing iso preliminary approval.	0.9	\$ 350.00	\$ 315.00
8/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise updated draft supplemental approval submission and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.7	\$ 600.00	\$ 420.00
8/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Check prior briefing for one-step approval cases.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
8/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review calculations assumption chart.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
8/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re same for supplemental preliminary approval submission.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 120 of 124

	8/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with co-counsel, MJF re caclulations assumption chart.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8178/2021	8/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	declarations for supplemental preliminary approval submission.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Britist Brit	8/17/2021								60.00
DAA and oc-counsel re supplemental briefing and exhibits Section									60.00
Supplemental approval submission.	8/18/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	DAA and co-counsel re supplemental briefing and	1.2	\$	350.00	\$	420.00
Supplemental approval submission.	8/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron		supplemental approval submission.		\$		\$	420.00
Bit				supplemental approval submission.					
Supplemental briefing and exhibits. Supplemental settlement approval. Supplemental s									
Supplemental briefing and exhibits Supplemental briefing and exhibits Supplemental settlement approval Set (Sec 1) Sec 2) Sec 3) Sec				supplemental briefing and exhibits.				ľ	
Bit	8/18/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	IMJF		0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
Bris2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re email to co-counsel. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00	8/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review and revise draft declaration in search of	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
Bit	8/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re review of risk analysis.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Molly J. Frandsen	8/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron						\$	60.00
Bit	8/18/2021								60.00
Counsel L. Ho in support of supplemental briefing. Counsel L. Ho in support of supplemental briefing. Section		·		of supplemental briefing.					
				counsel L. Ho in support of supplemental briefing.				ľ	
Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review and edit declarations, notices, and exhibits in support of supplemental briefing; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	8/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	·	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review and edit declarations, notices, and exhibits in support of supplemental briefing; correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re same.	8/18/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re damages exposure.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
L. Ho declaration, and correspondence with team resame.	8/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review and edit declarations, notices, and exhibits in support of supplemental briefing; correspondence		\$	350.00	\$	630.00
Submission.	8/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	L. Ho declaration, and correspondence with team re	0.7	\$	600.00	\$	420.00
B/19/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review correspondence from opposing counsel re supplemental approval submission. S 600.00 S 60.00 S	8/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF		0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
Section	8/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	•	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
Supplemental approval submission. Supplemental approval submission. Supplemental approval Supplemental settlement	8/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron		approval submission.	0.1				60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF, GBDH re draft declaration in support of supplemental settlement approval.	8/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	, , , , ,	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
B/19/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re class data and correspondence re data. Section	8/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	declaration in support of supplemental settlement	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review final damages chart. D.1 \$600.00 \$60.00	8/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re class data and	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/19/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Correspondence with MJF re final damages chart. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00 8/19/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Conference with MJF re supplemental settlement 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00 8/20/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review filed supplemental approval papers. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00 8/23/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review process for fee review. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 8/23/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re preliminary approval hearing prep and Seltz status update. 0.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 35.00 8/23/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re process for fee 0.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 35.00 8/23/2021 Christopher Truong CXT Upload new docket filings to case file. 0.2 \$ 270.00 \$ 54.00 8/24/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Conference with MJF re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. 0.4 \$ 350.00 \$ 140.00 8/24/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conference with DAA re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. 0.4 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 8/24/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 8/24/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 8/24/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft magistrate consent form. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00	8/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA		0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
8/19/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Conference with MJF re supplemental settlement submission. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 60.00 8/20/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Review filed supplemental approval papers. 0.1 \$ 600.00 \$ 600.00 8/23/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review process for fee review. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 8/23/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re preliminary approval hearing prep and Seltz status update. 0.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 350.00 8/23/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re process for fee review. 0.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 350.00 8/23/2021 Christopher Truong CXT Upload new docket filings to case file. 0.2 \$ 270.00 \$ 54.00 8/24/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Conference with MJF re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. 0.4 \$ 350.00 \$ 350.00 8/24/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval review. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 8/24/2021	8/19/2021								60.00
8/23/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Review process for fee review. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 8/23/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re preliminary approval hearing prep and Seltz status update. 0.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 35.00 8/23/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re process for fee review. 0.1 \$ 350.00 \$ 350.00 8/23/2021 Christopher Truong CXT Upload new docket filings to case file. 0.2 \$ 270.00 \$ 54.00 8/24/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Conference with MJF re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. 0.4 \$ 350.00 \$ 350.00 8/24/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. 0.4 \$ 350.00 \$ 350.00 8/24/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval review. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 8/24/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft magistrate consent form. 0.2 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00 <td>8/19/2021</td> <td>Deirdre A. Aaron</td> <td>DAA</td> <td>· ·</td> <td>0.1</td> <td></td> <td>600.00</td> <td>\$</td> <td>60.00</td>	8/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	· ·	0.1		600.00	\$	60.00
8/23/2021Molly J. FrandsenMJFCorrespondence with DAA re preliminary approval hearing prep and Seltz status update.0.1\$ 350.00\$ 35.008/23/2021Molly J. FrandsenMJFCorrespondence with DAA re process for fee review.0.1\$ 350.00\$ 35.008/23/2021Christopher Truong 8/24/2021CXTUpload new docket filings to case file.0.2\$ 270.00\$ 54.008/24/2021Deirdre A. Aaron hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application.0.4\$ 600.00\$ 240.008/24/2021Molly J. FrandsenMJFConference with DAA re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application.0.4\$ 350.00\$ 140.008/24/2021Molly J. FrandsenMJFCorrespondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval review.0.2\$ 350.00\$ 70.008/24/2021Molly J. FrandsenMJFDraft magistrate consent form.0.2\$ 350.00\$ 70.00	8/20/2021				0.1				60.00
hearing prep and Seltz status update. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re process for fee review. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA re process for fee review. Molly J. Frandsen DAA Conference with MJF re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conference with DAA re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conference with DAA re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval review. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft magistrate consent form. D.1 \$350.00 \$ 350.00 \$ 70.00	8/23/2021								70.00
review. 8/23/2021 Christopher Truong CXT Upload new docket filings to case file. 8/24/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Conference with MJF re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. 8/24/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conference with DAA re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. 8/24/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval review. 8/24/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft magistrate consent form. 8/24/2021 Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft magistrate consent form.	8/23/2021	, ,		hearing prep and Seltz status update.					35.00
B/24/2021 Deirdre A. Aaron DAA Conference with MJF re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conference with DAA re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval review. Correspondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval nearly approval preview. Correspondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval nearly	8/23/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	•	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Conference with DAA re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Correspondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval review. Molly J. Frandsen MJF Draft magistrate consent form. Description: 0.4	8/23/2021								54.00
8/24/2021Molly J. FrandsenMJFConference with DAA re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing fee application.0.4\$ 350.00\$ 140.008/24/2021Molly J. FrandsenMJFCorrespondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval review.0.2\$ 350.00\$ 70.008/24/2021Molly J. FrandsenMJFDraft magistrate consent form.0.2\$ 350.00\$ 70.00	8/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	hearing, update to client, status report, preparing	0.4	\$	600.00	\$	240.00
8/24/2021Molly J. FrandsenMJFCorrespondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval review.0.2\$ 350.00\$ 70.008/24/2021Molly J. FrandsenMJFDraft magistrate consent form.0.2\$ 350.00\$ 70.00	8/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Conference with DAA re preliminary approval hearing, update to client, status report, preparing	0.4	\$	350.00	\$	140.00
	8/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and CXT re fee approval	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
OF REAL POUND VENDOUS IDAM TO CONTROLOGICO MILLINGUE DE DICHINGUESTAS DE LA TRACTICA DE CONTROLOGICA DE CONTRO	8/24/2021 8/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen Deirdre A. Aaron	MJF DAA		0.2 0.1	\$			70.00 60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 121 of 124

8/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re update to client.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft Seltz status report.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
8/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re Seltz status report.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
8/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with client R. Seltz re status of the case.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
8/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re status of the case.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
8/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re fee application.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with CXT re joint status report and preparing for preliminary approval hearing.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
8/24/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel, DAA, and JLM re magistrate consent form.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
8/24/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re consent to magistrate.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with CXT re preliminary approval preparation and attorneys' fee review.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
8/25/2021	Christopher Truong	CXT	Telephone conference with MJF re preliminary approval preparation and attorneys' fee review.	0.3	\$ 270.00	\$ 81.00
8/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and CXT re status report and preliminary approval hearing prep.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
8/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and CXT re attorneys' fees.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
8/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with settlement administrator re continued hearing.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
8/25/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Send proposed joint status report to opposing counsel.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
8/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review draft status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re draft status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
8/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re preparing fee application.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re status report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/25/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF, CXT re fee application preparation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review order preliminarily approving settlement and correspondences to team re same.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
8/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Revise draft status report accordingly and send to opposing counsel.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
8/30/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondences with co counsel, administrator, re settlement administration process.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
8/31/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from opposing counsel re settlement administration issues.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/31/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to client re preliminary approval order.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/31/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondences re settlement administration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
8/31/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review defendants' edits to status report and correspondence to opposing counsel re same (.1); correspondence to CXT re filing same (.1).	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
8/31/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to client re case update, next steps.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review order extending stay and correspondence to CXT re same.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/1/2021	Christopher Truong	CXT	Upload new docket filing to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/1/2021	Christopher Truong	CXT	Prepare new joint status report letter to file with Court via ECF.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/1/2021	Christopher Truong	CXT	File joint status letter with Court via ECF.	0.2	\$ 270.00	\$ 54.00
9/1/2021	Christopher Truong	CXT	Upload new docket filing to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/2/2021	Christopher Truong	CXT	Upload new docket filing to case file.	0.1	\$ 270.00	\$ 27.00
9/3/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from administrator.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
9/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to co counsel re CAFA administration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	60.00
9/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re settlement administration issues and logistics.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review preliminary approval order; correspondence with DAA and CXT re notice administration, CAFA notice, and attorneys' fee motion.	0.7	\$ 350.00	\$ 245.00
9/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondences from co counsel, defense counsel re CAFA notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re update to clients.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re settlement award calculations and check agreement re same.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 122 of 124

9/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further correspondence to MJF re settlement admin.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/9/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further correspondence with MJF re fee application preparation.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with CXT re upcoming fee app project.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
9/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft and send case update to opt-in clients; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.6	\$ 350.00	\$ 210.00
9/9/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA, co-counsel L. Ho, and settlement administrator re estimated award calculations.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
9/13/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re responding to opt-in questions.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/13/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondences from administrator re notice and administration questions, and correspondence with MJF re same.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/13/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review questions from administrator re notice documents and review documents; draft response; correspondence to DAA and co-counsel re same.	1.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 385.00
9/13/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with opt-in Plaintiff C. Pierno re retaliation concerns; correspondence with DAA re same.	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
9/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondences from administrator re status of notice mailing; MJF, opposing counsel re notice edits.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re opposing counsel proposed edits to notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re opposing counsel proposed edits to notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review draft response to administrator and correspondence to team re same.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re settlement administration questions, follow up with opt-in.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review additional correspondences from administrator, opposing counsel, MJF re method of notice distribution, edits to notice.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/14/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with opt-in plaintiff K. Pierno re [REDACTED]; correspondence to DAA re same.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
9/14/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review notice documents and questions from administrator and opposing counsel re notice administration; correspondence with DAA, cocounsel, and opposing counsel re same.	0.9	\$ 350.00	\$ 315.00
9/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re call with opt-in to discuss retaliation concerns.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with client K. Pierno re [REDACTED].	0.3	\$ 350.00	\$ 105.00
9/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re follow up with client.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and settlement administrator re notice administration.	0.3	\$ 350.00	105.00
9/16/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re settlement calculations.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with CXT re attorneys' fee review.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
9/16/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with settlement administrator, DAA, and co-counsel re notice administration.	0.2	\$ 350.00	\$ 70.00
9/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review award calculations and correspondence with GBDH co-counsel re same.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
9/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondences from administrator, opposing counsel re objection deadline and correspondence to co counsel re same.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
9/17/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to administrator, opposing counsel re exclusion deadline.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/19/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review additional correspondences re settlement administration and correspondence with co-counsel L. Ho re class member data question.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
9/19/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from DAA and co-counsel and opposing counsel re notice administration.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
9/20/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re status of notice mailing.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
9/20/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft call script; correspondence with CXT re same.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
			•			

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 123 of 124

9/20/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review Notice documents; correspondence with DAA, co-counsel, and settlement administrator re same.	0.7	\$	350.00	\$	245.00
9/20/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondences from opposing counsel, administrator re notice mailing and correspondence to MJF re same.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/21/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re notice administration.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/21/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Draft notice script; correspondence with DAA and	0.4	\$	350.00		140.00
	,		CXT re same.				*	
9/21/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondence from administrator re notice mailing and correspondence to MJF re same.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/22/2021	Christopher Truong	CXT	Telephone Conference with MXF re call script.	0.2	\$	270.00	¢	54.00
9/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with CXT re notice	0.2	\$	350.00		70.00
	·		administration.					
9/22/2021	Christopher Truong	CXT	Upload call log, call script, and Opt-In Notice to case file.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
9/22/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel re question from settlement administrator.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
9/22/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondences from co-counsel L. Ho, MJF, administrator re class member inquiry.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re fee application preparation.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/23/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondences to MJF re time entry review.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
9/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with co-counsel L. Ho, G. Grimes, and MJF re preparing fee application.	0.5	\$	600.00		300.00
9/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further conference with MJF re fee application.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
9/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA and co-counsel L. Ho and G. Grimes re attorneys' fee motion.	0.5	\$	350.00		175.00
9/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA re attorneys' fee motion.	0.2	\$	350.00	\$	70.00
9/28/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review orders from Judge Corley re fee application	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
9/28/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	requirements. Correspondence with co-counsel re motion for	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
10/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	attorneys' fees. Review administration report and correspondence	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	to MJF re same. Correspondence to co counsel re settlement	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/1/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	participation. Correspondence to MJF re additional fee	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
			application questions.					
10/1/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re claims rate; review settlement agreement.		\$	350.00		70.00
10/4/2021	Christopher Truong	CXT	Update paralegal case memo.	0.1	\$	270.00		27.00
10/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re fee application.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
10/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re class list.	0.1	\$	600.00		60.00
10/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to partners re settlement notice process questions.	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
10/4/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondences from administrator, co counsel re notice website.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/4/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re settlement administration.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
10/4/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review notice website; correspondence from co- counsel, opposing counsel, and administrator re same.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
10/5/2021	Christopher Truong	CXT	Respond to question from MJF re locating pro hac vice charges for fee approval motion.	0.2	\$	270.00	\$	54.00
10/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with L. Ho re settlement administration.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/5/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence with MJF re fee application, settlement administration.	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/6/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to L. Ho re potential NY opt-in	0.1	\$	600.00	\$	60.00
10/8/2021	Doirdro A Agran	DAA	inquiry. Poviou claims administration report	0.1	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	600.00	¢	60.00
10/8/2021 10/8/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA MJF	Review claims administration report.	0.1	\$ \$	600.00 350.00		60.00
10/0/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	IVIJE	Review correspondence from administrator, co- counsel and opposing counsel re notice questions.	0.1	•	JOU.UU	Ф	35.00
10/8/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with co-counsel re lodestar for attorneys' fee motion.	0.1	\$	350.00	\$	35.00
10/11/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review correspondences from administrator,	0.2	\$	600.00	\$	120.00
			opposing counsel, L. Ho re notice process.					
	·	·						

Case 3:18-cv-05813-JSC Document 137-1 Filed 10/25/21 Page 124 of 124

10/11/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Review correspondence from co-counsel, opposing counsel, and administrator re notice administration.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
10/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to co-counsel re settlement claims.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review prior productions re collective list.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
10/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Conference with MJF re fee application, settlement administration.	0.4	\$ 600.00	\$ 240.00
10/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to client re case update.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/12/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further correspondence to MJF re settlement administration questions.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/12/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Telephone conference with DAA re attorneys' fee review and notice administration.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
10/12/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA and co-counsel re settlement administration.	0.4	\$ 350.00	\$ 140.00
10/13/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to potential opt-in re claims.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/13/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to JMS re settlement administration.	0.2	\$ 600.00	\$ 120.00
10/13/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Further correspondence to MJF re settlement administration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to co counsel re fee application.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/14/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re responding to class member inquiry.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/14/2021	Justin Swartz	JMS	Correspondence with DAA re opt-in rate and notice issues.	0.1	\$ 990.00	\$ 99.00
10/14/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence with DAA re attorneys' fees and settlement inquiries.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00
10/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re fee application review.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re follow up on potential class member.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re fee application, settlement administration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Review settlement administration report.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re settlement administration.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/15/2021	Deirdre A. Aaron	DAA	Correspondence to MJF re class member workweek question.	0.1	\$ 600.00	\$ 60.00
10/15/2021	Molly J. Frandsen	MJF	Correspondence to opposing counsel and with DAA re class member notice inquiry.	0.1	\$ 350.00	\$ 35.00

Total 1,509.9 \$699,404.50